ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/24/2026 at 11:30 AM

2025 NJDOT ROAD PROGRAM
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
44538 00

Earle Asphalt Company

DiMeglio Construction Co., Inc.

Lexa Concrete, LLC

River Front Recycling &
Aggregate, LLC

PO Box 556, Farmingdale, NJ
07727-0556

594 White Horse Pike, Atco, NJ
08004

11 Commerce Way Drive,
Hammonton, NJ 08037-3363

1301 N 26th Street, Camden, NJ
08105

P: (732)308-1113
F: (732)308-1034

P: (856)767-1351
F: (856)767-3642

P: (609)704-5311
F: (609)704-5355

P: (856)966-1100
F: (856)966-0008

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 |HMA Miling, 4" 7,375.0[SY 12.80 94,400.00 4.25 31,343.75 9.00| $ 66,375.00 4.75 35,031.25
2 |Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 1,120.0/TON 105.00 117,600.00 110.00 123,200.00 99.00 110,880.00 110.00 123,200.00
3 |Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Base Course, 1.5" Thick 665.0] TON 125.00 83,125.00 115.00 76,475.00 107.00 71,155.00 130.00 86,450.00
4 |Hot Mix Asphalt Pavemnet Repair (If & Where Directed) 375.0[SY 0.01 3.75 5.00 1,875.00 5.00 1,875.00 30.65 11,493.75
5 |Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick 370.0({SY 147.50 54,575.00 130.00 48,100.00 130.00 48,100.00 80.00 29,600.00
6 |Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 3" Thick 25.0[SY 65.50 1,637.50 70.00 1,750.00 70.00 1,750.00 150.00 3,750.00
7 |Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 300.0{SY 114.50 34,350.00 120.00 36,000.00 | $ 140.00 42,000.00 | $ 75.00 22,500.00
8 |Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 1,200.0|LF 38.00 45,600.00 48.00 57,600.00 | $ 54.00 64,800.00 [ $ 60.00 72,000.00
9 [Monolithic Concrete Curb and Gutter 1,837.0|LF 41.75 76,694.75 55.00 101,035.00 60.00 110,220.00 80.00 146,960.00
10 |Steel Treeplate 180.0[LF 0.01 1.80 15.00 2,700.00 60.00 10,800.00 1.00 180.00
11 |Detectable Warning Surface 5.34|SY 267.50 1,428.45 1,000.00 5,340.00 360.00 1,922.40 225.00 1,201.50
12 |Excavated Point Repair, Sanitary Sewer 2.0|UN 3,000.00 6,000.00 8,500.00 17,000.00 8,500.00 17,000.00 12,500.00 25,000.00
13 |Inlet, Type B 1.0|UN 6,026.80 6,026.80 6,750.00 6,750.00 6,800.00 6,800.00 4,800.00 4,800.00
14 |Manhole, 4' Diameter 1.0|UN 5,400.00 5,400.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 3,000.00 3,000.00
15 |Reconstructed inlet, Type B, Using Existing casting 1.0/UN 830.00 830.00 3,500.00 3,500.00 1,500.00 1,500.00 2,200.00 2,200.00
16 |Reset/Reconstruct Existing Manhole Casting (If & Where Directed) 10.0|UN 690.00 6,900.00 500.00 5,000.00 1.00 10.00 1,100.00 11,000.00
17 _|Bicycle Safe Grate 1.0|UN 414.00 414.00 500.00 500.00 400.00 400.00 350.00 350.00
18 |Curb Piece 1.0|UN 590.00 590.00 500.00 500.00 400.00 400.00 500.00 500.00
19 |Construct 12" DIP 60.0|LF 188.00 11,280.00 185.00 11,100.00 200.00 12,000.00 205.00 12,300.00
20 |Traffic Stripes, 4" (Yellow) 200.0|LF 1.80 360.00 3.00 600.00 2.20 440.00 3.30 660.00
21 |Traffic Marking Lines, 6" 200.0|LF 2.75 550.00 5.00 1,000.00 3.30 660.00 3.75 750.00
22 |Traffic Marking Lines, 24" 180.0[LF 10.95 1,971.00 10.00 1,800.00 8.00 1,440.00 13.25 2,385.00
23 |Regulatory and Warning Sign 13.0/UN 300.00 3,900.00 400.00 5,200.00 300.00 3,900.00 330.00 4,290.00
24 |Street Sign 6.0[UN 75.00 450.00 300.00 1,800.00 45.00 270.00 110.00 660.00
25 |Street Sign Post 3.0[UN 300.00 900.00 500.00 1,500.00 200.00 600.00 330.00 990.00
26 |Topsoil and Seed, 4" Thick ( If & Where Directed) 10.0{UN 27.50 275.00 1.00 10.00 10.00 100.00 10.00 100.00
27 _|Cleanout Monument Box (If & Where Directed) 8.0|UN 0.01 0.08 400.00 3,200.00 100.00 800.00 250.00 2,000.00
28 |Repair Sewer Lateral Cleanout Riser (If & Where Directed) 1.0/UN 650.00 650.00 350.00 350.00 500.00 500.00 150.00 150.00
29 |Repair Sewer Lateral Cleanout Riser and Tee (If & Where Directed) 1.0/UN 1,250.00 1,250.00 500.00 500.00 1,850.00 1,850.00 1,100.00 1,100.00
30 [Tree Removal, Over 8" to 12" Diameter 1.0|UN 750.00 750.00 1,700.00 1,700.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 750.00 750.00
31 [Tree Removal, Over 12" to 18" Diameter 1.0|UN 1,500.00 1,500.00 2,200.00 2,200.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 950.00 950.00
32 [Tree Removal, Over 30" to 36" Diameter 1.0|UN 4,500.00 4,500.00 3,200.00 3,200.00 3,500.00 3,500.00 1,500.00 1,500.00
33 [Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.0/DOL 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00
34 [Fuel Price Adjustment 1.0/|DOL 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID:| $ 564,513.13 | $ 558,428.75 591,647.40 608,401.50
A1.1 [HMA Milling, 2" 44.0|SY 9.00 396.00 110.00 4,840.00 40.00 1,760.00 10.00 440.00
A1.2 [Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Base Course, 2" Thick 5.0/ TON 150.10 750.50 650.00 3,250.00 250.00 1,250.00 190.00 950.00
A1.3 [Concrete Swale, 8" Thick 2.5|SY 590.00 1,475.00 750.00 1,875.00 500.00 1,250.00 75.00 187.50
A1.4 [Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick 7.0[SY 427.50 2,992.50 300.00 2,100.00 300.00 2,100.00 85.00 595.00
A1.5 [Concrete Pad, 6" Thick, Reinforced 21.0|SY 285.00 5,985.00 200.00 4,200.00 250.00 5,250.00 85.00 1,785.00
A1.6 [Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 20.0|SY 223.00 4,460.00 200.00 4,000.00 200.00 4,000.00 75.00 1,500.00
A1.7 [Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 110.5[LF 54.00 5,967.00 80.00 8,840.00 80.00 8,840.00 65.00 7,182.50
A1.8 [Detectable Warning Surface 3.09|SY 250.00 772.50 1,000.00 3,090.00 360.00 1,112.40 50.00 154.50
A1.9 [Traffic Marking Lines, 6" 50.0|LF 2.75 137.50 10.00 500.00 3.30 165.00 2.50 125.00
A1.10 | Traffic Marking Lines, 24" 24.0|LF 11.00 264.00 15.00 360.00 13.30 319.20 10.00 240.00
A1.11 |Regulatory and Warning Sign 6.0[UN 300.00 1,800.00 500.00 3,000.00 385.00 2,310.00 450.00 2,700.00
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID#1:| $ 25,000.00 36,055.00 28,356.60 15,859.50
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1:| $ 589,513.13 | $ 594,483.75 | $ 620,004.00 | $ 624,261.00

:lindicates mathematically corrected value based on governing unit prices
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/24/2026 at 11:30 AM

2025 NJDOT ROAD PROGRAM
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
44538 00

Paving Plus, LLC

Pioneer General Contracting
Co,, Inc

Think Pavers Hardscaping LLC

Seacoast Construction Inc.

PO Box 464, Glassboro, NJ
08028

PO Box 67, Bradley Beach, NJ
07720

125 Kings Highway, MT. Royal,
NJ 08061

15 Addington Court, East
Brunswick, NJ 08816

P: (856)404-9166
F: (856)728-2895

P: (732)807-3158
F: (732)807-3159

P: (856)832-4680
F: (856)832-4681

P: (732)238-6963

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 |HMA Miling, 4" 7,375.0[SY 6.50 47,937.50 15.00 110,625.00 10.00 73,750.00 8.50 62,687.50
2 |Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 1,120.0/TON 96.00 107,520.00 125.00 140,000.00 119.00 133,280.00 170.00 190,400.00
3 |Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Base Course, 1.5" Thick 665.0] TON 105.00 69,825.00 125.00 83,125.00 140.00 93,100.00 150.00 99,750.00
4 |Hot Mix Asphalt Pavemnet Repair (If & Where Directed) 375.0[SY 1.00 375.00 51.00 19,125.00 15.00 5,625.00 60.00 22,500.00
5 |Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick 370.0({SY 159.00 58,830.00 120.00 44,400.00 80.00 29,600.00 166.00 61,420.00
6 |Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 3" Thick 25.0[SY 65.00 1,625.00 50.00 1,250.00 32.00 800.00 125.00 3,125.00
7 |Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 300.0{SY 136.00 40,800.00 120.00 36,000.00 | $ 70.00 21,000.00 | $ 144.00 43,200.00
8 |Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 1,200.0|LF 42.00 50,400.00 45.00 54,000.00 | $ 60.00 72,000.00 | $ 50.00 60,000.00
9 [Monolithic Concrete Curb and Gutter 1,837.0|LF 69.00 126,753.00 50.00 91,850.00 65.00 119,405.00 70.00 128,590.00
10 |Steel Treeplate 180.0[LF 5.00 900.00 20.00 3,600.00 50.00 9,000.00 50.00 9,000.00
11 |Detectable Warning Surface 5.34|SY 650.00 3,471.00 200.00 1,068.00 1,000.00 5,340.00 750.00 4,005.00
12 |Excavated Point Repair, Sanitary Sewer 2.0|UN 14,395.00 28,790.00 5,000.00 10,000.00 14,600.00 29,200.00 9,500.00 19,000.00
13 |Inlet, Type B 1.0|UN 8,200.00 8,200.00 3,000.00 3,000.00 5,220.00 5,220.00 9,500.00 9,500.00
14 |Manhole, 4' Diameter 1.0|UN 7,200.00 7,200.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 7,300.00 7,300.00 9,500.00 9,500.00
15 |Reconstructed inlet, Type B, Using Existing casting 1.0/UN 1,100.00 1,100.00 1,750.00 1,750.00 2,454.00 2,454.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
16 |Reset/Reconstruct Existing Manhole Casting (If & Where Directed) 10.0|UN 10.00 100.00 1,000.00 10,000.00 3,639.00 36,390.00 350.00 3,500.00
17 _|Bicycle Safe Grate 1.0|UN 600.00 600.00 500.00 500.00 586.00 586.00 600.00 600.00
18 |Curb Piece 1.0|UN 500.00 500.00 500.00 500.00 345.00 345.00 900.00 900.00
19 |Construct 12" DIP 60.0|LF 279.00 16,740.00 200.00 12,000.00 217.00 13,020.00 275.00 16,500.00
20 |Traffic Stripes, 4" (Yellow) 200.0|LF 2.00 400.00 5.00 1,000.00 1.90 380.00 1.55 310.00
21 |Traffic Marking Lines, 6" 200.0|LF 2.45 490.00 10.00 2,000.00 2.15 430.00 2.32 464.00
22 |Traffic Marking Lines, 24" 180.0[LF 10.00 1,800.00 20.00 3,600.00 8.40 1,512.00 9.30 1,674.00
23 |Regulatory and Warning Sign 13.0/UN 333.00 4,329.00 100.00 1,300.00 367.00 4,771.00 300.00 3,900.00
24 |Street Sign 6.0[UN 55.00 330.00 100.00 600.00 367.00 2,202.00 75.00 450.00
25 |Street Sign Post 3.0[UN 250.00 750.00 175.00 525.00 367.00 1,101.00 300.00 900.00
26 |Topsoil and Seed, 4" Thick ( If & Where Directed) 10.0{UN 1.00 10.00 50.00 500.00 15.00 150.00 27.00 270.00
27 _|Cleanout Monument Box (If & Where Directed) 8.0|UN 1.00 8.00 500.00 4,000.00 125.00 1,000.00 250.00 2,000.00
28 |Repair Sewer Lateral Cleanout Riser (If & Where Directed) 1.0/UN 1.00 1.00 250.00 250.00 350.00 350.00 500.00 500.00
29 |Repair Sewer Lateral Cleanout Riser and Tee (If & Where Directed) 1.0/UN 1.00 1.00 500.00 500.00 629.00 629.00 500.00 500.00
30 [Tree Removal, Over 8" to 12" Diameter 1.0|UN 1,500.00 1,500.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 2,257.00 2,257.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
31 [Tree Removal, Over 12" to 18" Diameter 1.0|UN 1,800.00 1,800.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,835.00 2,835.00 2,250.00 2,250.00
32 [Tree Removal, Over 30" to 36" Diameter 1.0|UN 2,200.00 2,200.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 4,908.00 4,908.00 4,000.00 4,000.00
33 [Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.0/DOL 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00 400.00
34 [Fuel Price Adjustment 1.0/|DOL 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 200.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID: 585,885.50 | $ 648,668.00 680,540.00 765,995.50
A1.1 [HMA Milling, 2" 44.0|SY 125.00 5,500.00 15.00 660.00 34.00 1,496.00 8.50 374.00
A1.2 [Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Base Course, 2" Thick 5.0/ TON 900.00 4,500.00 125.00 625.00 122.00 610.00 150.00 750.00
A1.3 [Concrete Swale, 8" Thick 2.5|SY 950.00 2,375.00 200.00 500.00 1,582.00 3,955.00 400.00 1,000.00
A1.4 [Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick 7.0[SY 850.00 5,950.00 120.00 840.00 441.00 3,087.00 166.00 1,162.00
A1.5 [Concrete Pad, 6" Thick, Reinforced 21.0|SY 500.00 10,500.00 120.00 2,520.00 348.00 7,308.00 166.00 3,486.00
A1.6 [Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 20.0|SY 200.00 4,000.00 120.00 2,400.00 359.00 7,180.00 144.00 2,880.00
A1.7 [Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 110.5[LF 125.00 13,812.50 45.00 4,972.50 78.00 8,619.00 50.00 5,525.00
A1.8 [Detectable Warning Surface 3.09|SY 1,000.00 3,090.00 200.00 618.00 410.00 1,266.90 750.00 2,317.50
A1.9 [Traffic Marking Lines, 6" 50.0|LF 2.45 122.50 10.00 500.00 2.00 100.00 2.32 116.00
A1.10 | Traffic Marking Lines, 24" 24.0|LF 10.00 240.00 20.00 480.00 8.00 192.00 9.30 223.20
A1.11 |Regulatory and Warning Sign 6.0[UN 480.00 2,880.00 100.00 600.00 52.50 315.00 300.00 1,800.00
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID#1: 52,970.00 | $ 14,715.50 34,128.90 19,633.70
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1: 638,855.50 | $ 663,383.50 | $ 714,668.90 | $ 785,629.20

:lindicates mathematically corrected value based on governing unit prices
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/24/2026 at 11:30 AM

2025 NJDOT ROAD PROGRAM
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
44538 00

Construct Connect, Inc

Pave Right Solutions RE Pierson Construction Co.

Richard T. Barrett

3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700,
Cincinnati, OH 45209

1121 Martin Avenue, Cherry Hill,
NJ 08002

426 Sewdesboro Road - PO Box
430, Pilesgrove, NJ 08098

400 Prospect Street, Trenton, NJ
08618-4659

P: (800)364-2059
F: (866)570-8187

P: (267)632-6908
F: (609)580-8838

P: (856)769-8244
F: (856)769-5630

P: (609)882-2236
F: (609)396-0572

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT
1 [HMA Miling, 4" 7,375.0{SY
2 |Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 1,120.0|TON
3 |Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Base Course, 1.5" Thick 665.0{TON
4 |Hot Mix Asphalt Pavemnet Repair (If & Where Directed) 375.0/SY
5 |Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick 370.0/SY
6 |Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 3" Thick 25.0|SY
7 |Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 300.0/SY
8 |Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 1,200.0|LF
9  |Monolithic Concrete Curb and Gutter 1,837.0|LF
10 |Steel Treeplate 180.0[LF
11 |Detectable Warning Surface 5.34[SY
12 |Excavated Point Repair, Sanitary Sewer 2.0/UN
13 |lInlet, Type B 1.0/UN
14 |Manhole, 4' Diameter 1.0/UN
15 |Reconstructed inlet, Type B, Using Existing casting 1.0/UN
16 |Reset/Reconstruct Existing Manhole Casting (If & Where Directed) 10.0|UN
17 |Bicycle Safe Grate 1.0/UN . . . . . . : .
78 Curb Piece TolUN No Bid Received No Bid Received No Bid Received No Bid Received
19 |Construct 12" DIP 60.0|LF
20 |Traffic Stripes, 4" (Yellow) 200.0[LF
21 |Traffic Marking Lines, 6" 200.0[LF
22 |Traffic Marking Lines, 24" 180.0[LF
23 |Regulatory and Warning Sign 13.0|UN
24 |Street Sign 6.0JUN
25 |Street Sign Post 3.0|UN
26 |Topsoil and Seed, 4" Thick ( If & Where Directed) 10.0|UN
27 |Cleanout Monument Box (If & Where Directed) 8.0|UN
28 |Repair Sewer Lateral Cleanout Riser (If & Where Directed) 1.0/UN
29 |Repair Sewer Lateral Cleanout Riser and Tee (If & Where Directed) 1.0/UN
30 |Tree Removal, Over 8" to 12" Diameter 1.0/UN
31 |Tree Removal, Over 12" to 18" Diameter 1.0/UN
32 |Tree Removal, Over 30" to 36" Diameter 1.0/UN
33 |Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.0/|DOL
34 |Fuel Price Adjustment 1.0/|DOL
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID:
A1.1 |HMA Milling, 2" 44.0|SY
A1.2 |Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Base Course, 2" Thick 5.0/]TON
A1.3 |Concrete Swale, 8" Thick 2.5|SY
A1.4 |Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick 7.0|SY
A1.5 |Concrete Pad, 6" Thick, Reinforced 21.0|SY
A1.6 |Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 20.0|SY No Bid Received No Bid Received No Bid Received No Bid Received
A1.7 |Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 110.5|LF
A1.8 |Detectable Warning Surface 3.09(SY
A1.9 |Traffic Marking Lines, 6" 50.0[LF
A1.10 | Traffic Marking Lines, 24" 24.0|LF
A1.11 |Regulatory and Warning Sign 6.0]UN

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID#1:

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1:

:lindicates mathematically corrected value based on governing unit prices
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