ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/24/2026 at 11:00 AM

STORMWATER INLET UPGRADES
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
44001 10

Pioneer General Contracting
Co., Inc

River Front Recycling &
Aggregate, LLC

DiMeglio Construction Co., Inc.

Coastline Excavating & Site
Services, LLC

PO Box 67, Bradley Beach, NJ
07720

1301 N 26th Street, Camden,
NJ 08105

594 White Horse Pike, Atco,
NJ 08004

37 Indian Trail, Southampton,
NJ 08088

P: (732)807-3158
F: (732)807-3159

P: (856)966-1100
F: (856)966-0008

P: (856)767-1351
F: (856)767-3642

P: (856)986-8363

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

1 Inlet, Type A (If & Where Directed) 1/UN 4,000.00 4,000.00 5,975.00 5,975.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,500.00 5,500.00
2 Inlet, Type B (If & Where Directed) 4|UN 4,500.00 18,000.00 6,600.00 26,400.00 5,250.00 21,000.00 6,400.00 25,600.00
3 Inlet, Type B-3 (If & Where Directed) 3|UN 4,000.00 12,000.00 6,600.00 19,800.00 6,000.00 18,000.00 7,500.00 22,500.00
4 Curb Piece (If & Where Directed) 57|UN 750.00 42,750.00 750.00 42,750.00 500.00 28,500.00 500.00 28,500.00
5 Bicycle Safe Grate (If & Where Directed) 20|UN 750.00 15,000.00 800.00 16,000.00 500.00 10,000.00 525.00 10,500.00
6 Inlet Frame, Type B (If & Where Directed) 16[UN 1,000.00 16,000.00 900.00 14,400.00 3,150.00 50,400.00 2,700.00 43,200.00
7 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 236|LF g 50.00 11,800.00 | § 65.00 15,340.00 | § 80.00 18,880.00 | § 77.00 18,172.00
8 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 20|8SY 200.00 4,000.00 | $ 125.00 2,500.00 225.00 4,500.00 175.00 3,500.00
9 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 96|SY 100.00 9,600.00 | § 33.00 3,168.00 100.00 9,600.00 100.00 9,600.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BID: 133,150.00 | § 146,333.00 | § 165,880.00 167,072.00
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/24/2026 at 11:00 AM

STORMWATER INLET UPGRADES
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
44001 10

Gemini General Contracting

Think Pavers Hardscaping LLC

Neri's Construction & Rentals,
Inc

Mac-Rose

425 Hurffville-Cross keys
Road, Box 697, Blackwood, NJ
08012

125 Kings Highway, MT.
Royal, NJ 08061

849 Clayton Road,
Williamstown, NJ 08094

85 Ridge Road, Browns Mills,
NJ 08015

P: (609)519-1860

P: (856)832-4680
F: (856)832-4681

P: (856)629-2408

P: (609)893-8600
F: (609)893-2102

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

1 Inlet, Type A (If & Where Directed) 1/UN 6,800.00 6,800.00 8,689.00 8,689.00 7,390.00 7,390.00 6,500.00 6,500.00
2 Inlet, Type B (If & Where Directed) 4|UN 8,500.00 34,000.00 8,635.00 34,540.00 8,250.00 33,000.00 8,500.00 34,000.00
3 Inlet, Type B-3 (If & Where Directed) 3|UN 8,000.00 24,000.00 9,275.00 27,825.00 9,610.00 28,830.00 10,500.00 31,500.00
4 Curb Piece (If & Where Directed) 57|UN 750.00 42,750.00 497.00 28,329.00 1,000.00 57,000.00 1,000.00 57,000.00
5 Bicycle Safe Grate (If & Where Directed) 20|UN 950.00 19,000.00 600.00 12,000.00 1,000.00 20,000.00 1,400.00 28,000.00
6 Inlet Frame, Type B (If & Where Directed) 16[UN 2,600.00 41,600.00 2,125.00 34,000.00 1,840.00 29,440.00 3,000.00 48,000.00
7 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 236|LF g 50.00 11,800.00 153.00 36,108.00 135.00 31,860.00 100.00 23,600.00
8 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 20|8SY ] 100.00 2,000.00 99.50 1,990.00 220.00 4,400.00 100.00 2,000.00
9 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 96|SY g 50.00 4,800.00 135.00 12,960.00 125.00 12,000.00 100.00 9,600.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BID:| § 186,750.00 196,441.00 223,920.00 240,200.00
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/24/2026 at 11:00 AM

STORMWATER INLET UPGRADES
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
44001 10

Anar Construction, LLC

Waters and Bugbee, Inc.

Amodio General Contracting

Booth Mechanical, Inc.

31 Pettit Ave, South River, NJ
08882

75 South Gold Drive, Hamilton,
NJ 08691

43 White Pine Rd,
Chesterfield, NJ 08515

42 N. Lippincott Avenue, Maple
Shade, NJ 0805

P: (732)585-6575

P: (609)584-1100
F: (609)584-2200

P: (609)731-6607

P: (856)667-1340

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT
1 Inlet, Type A (If & Where Directed) 1|UN 11,300.00 11,300.00 13,075.00 13,075.00
2 Inlet, Type B (If & Where Directed) 4[UN 16,050.00 64,200.00 13,125.00 52,500.00
3 Inlet, Type B-3 (If & Where Directed) 3|UN 20,000.00 60,000.00 16,575.00 49,725.00
4 Curb Piece (If & Where Directed) 57(UN 1,800.00 | $ 102,600.00 2,550.00 | $ 145,350.00
5 Bicycle Safe Grate (If & Where Directed) 20{UN 1,000.00 20,000.00 1,790.00 35,800.00 No Bid Received No Bid Received
6 Inlet Frame, Type B (If & Where Directed) 16/UN 2,000.00 32,000.00 2,590.00 41,440.00
7 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 236|LF 100.00 23,600.00 195.00 46,020.00
8 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 20|SY 300.00 6,000.00 265.00 5,300.00
9 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 96(SY 100.00 9,600.00 180.00 17,280.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: 329,300.00 406,490.00 | $ - $ -
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/24/2026 at 11:00 AM

STORMWATER INLET UPGRADES
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
44001 10

Construct Connect

Earle Asphalt Company

Garret Paul Construction LLC

Montana Construction Inc.

3825 Edwards Road, Suite
700, Cincinnati, OH 45209

PO Box 556, Farmingdale, NJ
07727-0556

P. O. Box AD | 915 Bennetts
Mill Rd., Jackson, NJ 08527

80 Contant Avenue, Lodi, NJ
07644

P: (800)364-2059
F: (866)570-8187

P: (732)308-1113 x254
F: (732)308-1034

P: (609)694-6962

P: (973)478-5200
F: (973)478-7604

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT
1 Inlet, Type A (If & Where Directed) 1|UN

2 Inlet, Type B (If & Where Directed) 4|UN

3 Inlet, Type B-3 (If & Where Directed) 3[UN

4 Curb Piece (If & Where Directed) 57(UN

5 Bicycle Safe Grate (If & Where Directed) 20{UN No Bid Received No Bid Received No Bid Received No Bid Received

6 Inlet Frame, Type B (If & Where Directed) 16|UN

7 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 236|LF

8 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 20(SY

9 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 96(SY

TOTAL AMOUNT BID:
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

STORMWATER INLET UPGRADES
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

Bid Opening 03/24/2026 at 11:00 AM 44001 10
RME
3 Meirs Road, Cream Ridge,
NJ 08514
P: (609)758-7809
F: (609)758-4930
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Inlet, Type A (If & Where Directed) 1|UN
2 Inlet, Type B (If & Where Directed) 4|UN
3 Inlet, Type B-3 (If & Where Directed) 3[UN
4 Curb Piece (If & Where Directed) 57(UN
5 Bicycle Safe Grate (If & Where Directed) 20[UN No Bid Received
6 Inlet Frame, Type B (If & Where Directed) 16|UN
7 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 236|LF
8 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 20(SY
9 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 96(SY

TOTAL AMOUNT BID:
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