
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

1 HMA Milling, 2" 3250 SY 6.00$             $19,500.00 12.50$           $40,625.00 10.00$           $32,500.00
2 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 390 TON 145.00$         $56,550.00 98.00$           $38,220.00 80.00$           $31,200.00
3 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Reapir ( If & Where Directed) 1950 SY 10.00$           $19,500.00 35.00$           $68,250.00 25.00$           $48,750.00
4 Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 2" Thick 75 SY 60.00$           $4,500.00 65.00$           $4,875.00 10.00$           $750.00
5 Reconstructed Inlet, Type B, Using Existing Casting 1 UN 2,178.13$      $2,178.13 2,500.00$      $2,500.00 11,000.00$    $11,000.00
6 Riprap Stone Preotection, 7" Thick (D50=6") 25 SY 100.00$         $2,500.00 165.00$         $4,125.00 10.00$           $250.00
7 Replacement of Existig Headwall 1 UN 12,500.00$    $12,500.00 6,500.00$      $6,500.00 55,000.00$    $55,000.00
8 Construct 18" RCP 30 LF 180.00$         $5,400.00 135.00$         $4,050.00 80.00$           $2,400.00
9 Traffic Stripes, 4" (White) 2400 LF 0.60$             $1,440.00 1.00$             $2,400.00 1.00$             $2,400.00
10 Traffic Stripes, 4" (Yellow) 2250 LF 0.60$             $1,350.00 1.00$             $2,250.00 1.00$             $2,250.00
11 Removal of Beam Guide Rail 80 LF 1.00$             $80.00 1.10$             $88.00 2.00$             $160.00
12 Beam Guide Rail 526 LF 15.00$           $7,890.00 15.00$           $7,890.00 20.00$           $10,520.00
13 Beam Guide Rail Post 83 UN 105.00$         $8,715.00 106.00$         $8,798.00 80.00$           $6,640.00
14 Beam Guide Rail Anchorage 2 UN 2,000.00$      $4,000.00 1,250.00$      $2,500.00 3,000.00$      $6,000.00
15 Tangent Gide Rail Terminal 2 UN 5,000.00$      $10,000.00 4,100.00$      $8,200.00 6,000.00$      $12,000.00
16 Turf Repair Strip ( If & Where Directed) 1000 LF 0.01$             $10.00 8.00$             $8,000.00 0.01$             $10.00
17 Asphalt Price Adjustment 200 DOL 1.00$             $200.00 1.00$             $200.00 1.00$             $200.00
18 Fuel Price Adjustment 100 DOL 1.00$             $100.00 1.00$             $100.00 1.00$             $100.00

A1.1 Reconstructed Inlet, Type E, Using Existing Casting 2 UN 2,150.00$      $4,300.00 2,534.31$      $5,068.62 2,370.00$      $4,740.00
A1.2 Bicycle Safe Grate 4 UN 425.00$         $1,700.00 500.00$         $2,000.00 421.50$         $1,686.00
A1.3 Riprap Stone Preotection, 7" Thick (D50=6") 30 SY 100.00$         $3,000.00 165.00$         $4,950.00 10.00$           $300.00
A1.4 Replacement of Existig Headwall 2 UN 8,000.00$      $16,000.00 6,500.00$      $13,000.00 16,500.00$    $33,000.00
A1.5 Construct 18" RCP 75 LF 180.00$         $13,500.00 135.00$         $10,125.00 100.00$         $7,500.00

A2.1 Removal of Beam Guide Rail 250 LF 1.00$             $250.00 1.10$             $275.00 1.00$             $250.00
A2.2 Non Vegetative Surface, Porous Hot Mix Asphalt, 4" Thick 100 SY 90.00$           $9,000.00 100.00$         $10,000.00 40.00$           $4,000.00
A2.3 Beam Guide Rail 1280 LF 18.00$           $23,040.00 17.00$           $21,760.00 25.00$           $32,000.00
A2.4 Beam Guide Rail Post 245 UN 100.00$         $24,500.00 106.00$         $25,970.00 80.00$           $19,600.00
A2.5 Beam Guide Rail Anchorage 1 UN 1,500.00$      $1,500.00 1,250.00$      $1,250.00 5,000.00$      $5,000.00
A2.6 Tangent Gide Rail Terminal 2 UN 4,750.00$      $9,500.00 4,100.00$      $8,200.00 10,000.00$    $20,000.00
A2.7 Controlled Release Terminal 1 UN 1,500.00$      $1,500.00 1,300.00$      $1,300.00 23,000.00$    $23,000.00
A2.8 Controlled Release Terminal Anchorage 1 UN 3,210.00$      $3,210.00 3,000.00$      $3,000.00 15,000.00$    $15,000.00

Alternate Bid #2: Miscellaneous Guiderail Work

Alternate Bid #1: Miscellaneous Stromwater Work

Base Bid: Sta. 118+40 to 130+91

222,130.00$                           

47,226.00$                             
269,356.00$                           

118,850.00$                           

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. BID #1 + #2: 267,413.13$                           
TOTAL AMOUNT ALT. BID #2: 72,500.00$                             

316,469.62$                           388,206.00$                           
71,755.00$                             

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. BID #1: 194,913.13$                           
TOTAL AMOUNT ALT. BID #1: 38,500.00$                             35,143.62$                             

244,714.62$                           

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

P: (732) 308-1113 x 254

156,413.13$                           

F: (732) 308-1034

Earle Co

Bid Opening 04/09/2026 at 10:00 AM

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID:

F: (609) 567-4750

C. J. Hesse, Inc.

PO BOX 207, Belford, NJ 
07718

P: (732) 291-8100
F: (732) 708-1213

P. O. Box 556, Farmingdale, 
NJ 07727

SOUTH LAKESHORE DRIVE PHASE V
TOWNSHIP OF PERMBERTON

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
28043 24C

P: (609) 561-4100

Arawak Paving Co., Inc.

7503 Weymouth Road, 
Hammonton, NJ 08037

209,571.00$                           

Think Pavers Hardscaping, 
LLC

125 Kings Highway, Mount 
Royal, NJ 08061

P: (856) 832-4680
F: (856) 832-4681
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

P: (732) 308-1113 x 254
F: (732) 308-1034

Earle Co

Bid Opening 04/09/2026 at 10:00 AM

F: (609) 567-4750

C. J. Hesse, Inc.

PO BOX 207, Belford, NJ 
07718

P: (732) 291-8100
F: (732) 708-1213

P. O. Box 556, Farmingdale, 
NJ 07727

SOUTH LAKESHORE DRIVE PHASE V
TOWNSHIP OF PERMBERTON

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
28043 24C

P: (609) 561-4100

Arawak Paving Co., Inc.

7503 Weymouth Road, 
Hammonton, NJ 08037

Think Pavers Hardscaping, 
LLC

125 Kings Highway, Mount 
Royal, NJ 08061

P: (856) 832-4680
F: (856) 832-4681

A3.1 HMA Milling, 2" 5000 SY 5.00$             $25,000.00 12.50$           $62,500.00 16.00$           $80,000.00
A3.2 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 600 TON 145.00$         $87,000.00 98.00$           $58,800.00 80.00$           $48,000.00
A3.3 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Reapir ( If & Where Directed) 2300 SY 10.00$           $23,000.00 35.00$           $80,500.00 25.00$           $57,500.00
A3.4 Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 2" Thick 140 SY 50.00$           $7,000.00 65.00$           $9,100.00 10.00$           $1,400.00
A3.5 Stone Driveway, 4" Thick 30 SY 40.00$           $1,200.00 50.00$           $1,500.00 10.00$           $300.00
A3.6 Traffic Stripes, 4" (White) 3550 LF 0.60$             $2,130.00 0.50$             $1,775.00 0.50$             $1,775.00
A3.7 Traffic Stripes, 4" (Yellow) 3500 LF 0.60$             $2,100.00 0.50$             $1,750.00 0.50$             $1,750.00
A3.8 Regulatory and Warning Sign ( If & Where Directed) 4 UN 340.00$         $1,360.00 350.00$         $1,400.00 250.00$         $1,000.00
A3.9 Turf Repair Strip ( If & Where Directed) 1000 LF 0.01$             $10.00 8.00$             $8,000.00 0.10$             $100.00
A3.10 Asphalt Price Adjustment 300 DOL 1.00$             $300.00 1.00$             $300.00 1.00$             $300.00
A3.11 Fuel Price Adjustment 100 DOL 1.00$             $100.00 1.00$             $100.00 1.00$             $100.00

A4.1 HMA Milling, 2" 3960 SY 6.50$             $25,740.00 12.50$           $49,500.00 15.25$           $60,390.00
A4.2 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 475 TON 150.00$         $71,250.00 98.00$           $46,550.00 80.00$           $38,000.00
A4.3 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Reapir ( If & Where Directed) 2550 SY 10.00$           $25,500.00 35.00$           $89,250.00 25.00$           $63,750.00
A4.4 Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 2" Thick 15 SY 50.00$           $750.00 65.00$           $975.00 10.00$           $150.00
A4.5 Traffic Stripes, 4" (White) 2900 LF 0.60$             $1,740.00 0.50$             $1,450.00 0.50$             $1,450.00
A4.6 Traffic Stripes, 4" (Yellow) 2700 LF 0.60$             $1,620.00 0.50$             $1,350.00 0.50$             $1,350.00
A4.7 Regulatory and Warning Sign ( If & Where Directed) 1 UN 292.50$         $292.50 350.00$         $350.00 0.50$             $0.50
A4.8 Turf Repair Strip ( If & Where Directed) 750 LF 0.01$             $7.50 8.00$             $6,000.00 0.01$             $7.50
A4.9 Asphalt Price Adjustment 300 DOL 1.00$             $300.00 1.00$             $300.00 1.00$             $300.00
A4.10 Fuel Price Adjustment 100 DOL 1.00$             $100.00 1.00$             $100.00 1.00$             $100.00

738,019.62$                           745,929.00$                           
TOTAL AMOUNT ALT. BID #4:

Alternate Bid #3: Sta. 130+91 TO 149+26

Alternate Bid #4: Sta. 102+76 TO 118+40

indicates mathematically corrected value based on governing unit prices

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. BID #1 + #2 + #3 + #4: 543,913.13$                           
127,300.00$                           195,825.00$                           165,498.00$                           

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. BIDS #1 + #2 + #3: 416,613.13$                           542,194.62$                           580,431.00$                           
TOTAL AMOUNT ALT. BID #3: 149,200.00$                           225,725.00$                           192,225.00$                           
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

1 HMA Milling, 2" 3250 SY
2 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 390 TON
3 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Reapir ( If & Where Directed) 1950 SY
4 Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 2" Thick 75 SY
5 Reconstructed Inlet, Type B, Using Existing Casting 1 UN
6 Riprap Stone Preotection, 7" Thick (D50=6") 25 SY
7 Replacement of Existig Headwall 1 UN
8 Construct 18" RCP 30 LF
9 Traffic Stripes, 4" (White) 2400 LF
10 Traffic Stripes, 4" (Yellow) 2250 LF
11 Removal of Beam Guide Rail 80 LF
12 Beam Guide Rail 526 LF
13 Beam Guide Rail Post 83 UN
14 Beam Guide Rail Anchorage 2 UN
15 Tangent Gide Rail Terminal 2 UN
16 Turf Repair Strip ( If & Where Directed) 1000 LF
17 Asphalt Price Adjustment 200 DOL
18 Fuel Price Adjustment 100 DOL

A1.1 Reconstructed Inlet, Type E, Using Existing Casting 2 UN
A1.2 Bicycle Safe Grate 4 UN
A1.3 Riprap Stone Preotection, 7" Thick (D50=6") 30 SY
A1.4 Replacement of Existig Headwall 2 UN
A1.5 Construct 18" RCP 75 LF

A2.1 Removal of Beam Guide Rail 250 LF
A2.2 Non Vegetative Surface, Porous Hot Mix Asphalt, 4" Thick 100 SY
A2.3 Beam Guide Rail 1280 LF
A2.4 Beam Guide Rail Post 245 UN
A2.5 Beam Guide Rail Anchorage 1 UN
A2.6 Tangent Gide Rail Terminal 2 UN
A2.7 Controlled Release Terminal 1 UN
A2.8 Controlled Release Terminal Anchorage 1 UN

Alternate Bid #2: Miscellaneous Guiderail Work

Alternate Bid #1: Miscellaneous Stromwater Work

Base Bid: Sta. 118+40 to 130+91

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. BID #1 + #2:
TOTAL AMOUNT ALT. BID #2:

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. BID #1:
TOTAL AMOUNT ALT. BID #1:

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 04/09/2026 at 10:00 AM

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID:

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

SOUTH LAKESHORE DRIVE PHASE V
TOWNSHIP OF PERMBERTON

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
28043 24C

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received No Bid Received No Bid Received

No Bid Received No Bid Received

P: (800) 364-2059
F: (866) 570-8187

798 Carteret Court, Mount 
Laurel, NJ 08054

P: (856) 266-8279
F: (609) 242-1443

No Bid Received No Bid Received

No Limit Group Inc

505 Dugout Drive, Lanoka 
Harbor, NJ 08734

P: (609) 242-1442

Swift & Son IncConstruct Connect, Inc

3825 Edwards Road, Suite 
700, Cincinnati, OH 45209
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 04/09/2026 at 10:00 AM

A3.1 HMA Milling, 2" 5000 SY
A3.2 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 600 TON
A3.3 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Reapir ( If & Where Directed) 2300 SY
A3.4 Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 2" Thick 140 SY
A3.5 Stone Driveway, 4" Thick 30 SY
A3.6 Traffic Stripes, 4" (White) 3550 LF
A3.7 Traffic Stripes, 4" (Yellow) 3500 LF
A3.8 Regulatory and Warning Sign ( If & Where Directed) 4 UN
A3.9 Turf Repair Strip ( If & Where Directed) 1000 LF
A3.10 Asphalt Price Adjustment 300 DOL
A3.11 Fuel Price Adjustment 100 DOL

A4.1 HMA Milling, 2" 3960 SY
A4.2 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 475 TON
A4.3 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Reapir ( If & Where Directed) 2550 SY
A4.4 Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 2" Thick 15 SY
A4.5 Traffic Stripes, 4" (White) 2900 LF
A4.6 Traffic Stripes, 4" (Yellow) 2700 LF
A4.7 Regulatory and Warning Sign ( If & Where Directed) 1 UN
A4.8 Turf Repair Strip ( If & Where Directed) 750 LF
A4.9 Asphalt Price Adjustment 300 DOL
A4.10 Fuel Price Adjustment 100 DOL

TOTAL AMOUNT ALT. BID #4:

Alternate Bid #3: Sta. 130+91 TO 149+26

indicates mathematically corrected value based on governing unit prices

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. BID #1 + #2 + #3 + #4:

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. BIDS #1 + #2 + #3:
TOTAL AMOUNT ALT. BID #3:

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

SOUTH LAKESHORE DRIVE PHASE V
TOWNSHIP OF PERMBERTON

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
28043 24C

P: (800) 364-2059
F: (866) 570-8187

798 Carteret Court, Mount 
Laurel, NJ 08054

P: (856) 266-8279
F: (609) 242-1443

No Limit Group Inc

505 Dugout Drive, Lanoka 
Harbor, NJ 08734

P: (609) 242-1442

Swift & Son IncConstruct Connect, Inc

3825 Edwards Road, Suite 
700, Cincinnati, OH 45209

No Bid Received

No Bid Received No Bid Received No Bid Received

No Bid Received No Bid Received
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