
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

BASE BID

1 Well #6 Rehabilitation, Complete 1 L.S. $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $63,000.00 $63,000.00

2 Equipment and Repairs (If and Where Directed) 1 All. $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

3 Pre & Post TV Inspection 1 L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

4 Piping & Valves 1 L.S. $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $63,700.00 $63,700.00

5 Instrumentation & Equipment 1 L.S. $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

25749 07A

$175,000.00 $173,700.00 NO BID NO BID

F: 732-543-2775 F: 856-694-4242

P: 856-845-5656 P: 732-543-2777 P: 856-694-4200

Woodbury Heights, NJ 08097 Edison, NJ 08817 Franklinville, NJ 08322-3692

664 S Evergreen Avenue 154 Silver Lake Avenue 61 Grays Ferry Road

Engineer's Estimate A.C. Schultes, Inc.
JVS Industrial and 

Commercial Contractors, Inc.

Uni-tech Drilling 

Company, Inc.

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/12/2026 @ 11:00 AM

Well #6 Well Rehabilitation Project

Medford Township

Burlington County, New Jersey



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

1 Well #6 Rehabilitation, Complete 1 L.S.

2 Equipment and Repairs (If and Where Directed) 1 All.

3 Pre & Post TV Inspection 1 L.S.

4 Piping & Valves 1 L.S.

5 Instrumentation & Equipment 1 L.S.

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/12/2026 @ 11:00 AM

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

NO BID

Well #6 Well Rehabilitation Project

Medford Township

Burlington County, New Jersey

25749 07A

Grand Prairie, TX 75052-7361

NO BID

F: 866-570-8187

P: 800-393-6343P: 800-364-2059

Cincinnati, OH 45209

Suite 700 Suite 160 #501

3825 Edwards Road, 2860 S. State Highway 161,

Dodge Construction 

Network
Construct Connect


