ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Capela Construction, Inc.

Decker's Hardscaping &
Landscaping Inc.

Seacoast Construction Inc.

Think Pavers Hardscaping
LLC

PO Box 2046 Medford
Lakes, NJ 08055

P: (609)-535-5367
F: (609)-801-2533

16 Lakeside Ave, Cherry
Hill, NJ 08003

P: (856)795-7087
F: (856)354-8630

15 Addington Court East
Brunswick, NJ 08816-5300

P: (732)-238-6963
F: (732)238-6083

125 Kings Highway, Mount
Royal, NJ 08061

P: (856)832-4680
F: (856)832-4681

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 $50,250.00 | $50,250.00 | $105,000.00 | $105,000.00 | $237,999.74 | $237,999.74
2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY $15.00 $5,625.00 $26.00 $9,750.00 $0.01 $3.75 $0.01 $3.75
3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00({CY $15.00 $5,625.00 $17.00 $6,375.00 $0.01 $3.75 $0.01 $3.75
4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF $40.00 $8,600.00 $70.00 | $15,050.00 $75.00 | $16,125.00 $20.00 $4,300.00
5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF $50.00 $2,000.00 $72.00 $2,880.00 $80.00 | $3,200.00 $20.00 $800.00
6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00(LF $100.00 $8,500.00 $90.00 $7,650.00 $85.00 | $7,225.00 $20.00 $1,700.00
7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $885.00 $4,425.00 $4,250.00 | $21,250.00 $2,200.00 | $11,000.00
8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00|UN $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $6,400.00 | $12,800.00 $4,650.00 | $9,300.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00
9 Inlet Type ‘A’ 1.00|UN $10,000.00 | $10,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 | $6,500.00 $25,000.00 | $25,000.00
10 Doghouse Inlet Type ‘A’ 1.00|UN $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 | $6,500.00 $35,000.00 | $35,000.00
11 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,260.00 $7,260.00 $2,250.00 | $2,250.00 $0.01 $0.01
12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00{UN $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $1,500.00 | $3,000.00 $5,000.00 | $10,000.00
13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY $100.00 $125,000.00 $80.00 | $100,000.00 $108.00 | $135,000.00 $70.00 | $87,500.00
14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY $130.00 $1,300.00 $85.00 $850.00 $140.00 | $1,400.00 $70.00 $700.00
15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF $50.00 $2,150.00 $45.00 $1,935.00 $50.00 | $2,150.00 $25.00 $1,075.00
16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF $10.00 $2,800.00 $65.00 | $18,200.00 $55.00 | $15,400.00 $25.00 $7,000.00
17 Wheel Stop 21.00 |UN $100.00 $2,100.00 $150.00 $3,150.00 $100.00 | $2,100.00 $20.00 $420.00
18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00(|SY $30.00 $37,800.00 $11.75 | $14,805.00 $18.00 | $22,680.00 $5.00 $6,300.00
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Capela Construction, Inc. Decr:;ssgzg?:gcalgisg & Seacoast Construction Inc. Think Pave[sl_gardscaping
PO Box 2046 Medford 16 Lakeside Ave, Cherry 15 Addington Court East 125 Kings Highway, Mount

Lakes, NJ 08055 Hill, NJ 08003 Brunswick, NJ 08816-5300 Royal, NJ 08061

P: (609)-535-5367 P: (856)795-7087 P: (732)-238-6963 P: (856)832-4680

F: (609)-801-2533 F: (856)354-8630 F: (732)238-6083 F: (856)832-4681

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19  |Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8') (Includes Installation) 1.00(LS $90,000.00 | $90,000.00 | $115,655.00 | $115,655.00 | $95,000.00 | $95,000.00 | $125,000.00 | $125,000.00
20 |Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF $50.00 $14,500.00 $110.00 | $31,900.00 $85.63 | $24,832.70 $50.00 | $14,500.00
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,278.00 | $2,556.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00
22 |Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $2,350.00 | $2,350.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
23  |Play Equipment Installation 1.00(LS $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 | $61,625.00 | $61,625.00 | $30,000.00 | $30,000.00 $75,000.00 | $75,000.00
24  |Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF $25.00 $128,750.00 $31.00 | $159,650.00 $22.00 | $113,300.00 $20.00 | $103,000.00
25 |Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY $100.00 $133.00 $400.00 $532.00 $750.00 | $997.50 $575.00 $764.75
26 |Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF $5.00 $1,950.00 $4.85 $1,891.50 $3.00 | $1,170.00 $6.00 $2,340.00
27  |4"-6" River Rock 30.00|SY $150.00 $4,500.00 $60.00 $1,800.00 $270.00 | $8,100.00 $50.00 $1,500.00
28 |6"-8" River Rock 40.00(SY $200.00 $8,000.00 $80.00 $3,200.00 $270.00 | $10,800.00 $50.00 $2,000.00
29 |Landscape 1.00(LS $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 | $27,200.00 | $27,200.00 | $72,500.00 | $72,500.00 $20,000.00 | $20,000.00
30 |[Top Soil and Seed 1.00(LS $15,000.00 | $15,000.00 | $40,000.00 | $40,000.00 | $55,000.00 | $55,000.00 $20,000.00 | $20,000.00
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00(LS $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $1,350.00 | $1,350.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: $595,833.00 $724,233.50 $777,043.70 $803,807.00

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK
JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS
CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Vulcan Construction Group,

Landberg Construction LLC Inc

Senco Metals, LLC The Earle Asphalt Co.

82 Tuckahoe Road, Dorothy,| 3 Hance Drive, Cookstown, 318 McLean Blvd Unit 4 PO Box 556, Farmingdale,

NJ 08317 NJ 08511 Paterson, NJ 07504 NJ 07727-0556
P: (609)829-2131 P: (848)525-1201 P: (973) 342-1742 P: (732)308-1113 x 206
F: (609)909-1647 F: (848)997-1230 F: (732)308-1034

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS $131,000.00 | $131,000.00 | $200,000.00 | $200,000.00 | $210,000.00 | $210,000.00

2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY $5.00 $1,875.00 $10.00 $3,750.00 $65.00 [ $24,375.00

3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY $5.00 $1,875.00 $5.00 $1,875.00 $100.00 | $37,500.00

4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF $86.00 $18,490.00 $30.00 $6,450.00 $75.00 | $16,125.00

5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF $100.00 $4,000.00 $40.00 $1,600.00 $95.00 $3,800.00

6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00|LF $120.00 $10,200.00 $50.00 $4,250.00 $135.00 | $11,475.00

7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN $2,200.00 $11,000.00 $2,500.00 | $12,500.00 $3,800.00 | $19,000.00

8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00{UN $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $6,500.00 | $13,000.00

9 Inlet Type ‘A’ 1.00|UN $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00

10 Doghouse Inlet Type 'A’ 1.00|UN $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00

11 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00

12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00|UN $650.00 $1,300.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,800.00 $7,600.00

13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY $108.00 $135,000.00 $90.00 | $112,500.00 $250.00 | $312,500.00

14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY $140.00 $1,400.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $300.00 $3,000.00

15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF $45.00 $1,935.00 $40.00 $1,720.00 $115.00 $4,945.00

16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF $45.00 $12,600.00 $60.00 | $16,800.00 $85.00 | $23,800.00

17 Wheel Stop 21.00 (UN $110.00 $2,310.00 $180.00 $3,780.00 $450.00 $9,450.00

18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00|SY $7.25 $9,135.00 $10.00 | $12,600.00 $50.00 | $63,000.00
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Landberg Construction LLC Vulcan Consl‘;]rg'ction Group, Senco Metals, LLC The Earle Asphalt Co.
82 Tuckahoe Road, Dorothy,| 3 Hance Drive, Cookstown, 318 McLean Blvd Unit 4 PO Box 556, Farmingdale,
NJ 08317 NJ 08511 Paterson, NJ 07504 NJ 07727-0556
P: (609)829-2131 P: (848)525-1201 P: (973) 342-1742 P: (732)308-1113 x 206
F: (609)909-1647 F: (848)997-1230 F: (732)308-1034
NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19  |Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8') (Includes Installation) 1.00(LS $67,000.00 $67,000.00 | $120,000.00 | $120,000.00 | $245,000.00 | $245,000.00
20 |Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF $60.00 $17,400.00 $30.00 $8,700.00 $70.00 | $20,300.00
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00
22 |Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,800.00 $4,800.00
23  |Play Equipment Installation 1.00(LS $150,000.00 | $150,000.00 | $100,000.00 | $100,000.00 | $285,000.00 | $285,000.00
24  |Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF $29.00 $149,350.00 $25.00 | $128,750.00 $23.00 | $118,450.00
25 Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY $400.00 $532.00 $300.00 $399.00 $500.00 $665.00
26 |Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF $3.25 $1,267.50 $4.00 $1,560.00 $20.00 $7,800.00
27  |4"-6" River Rock 30.00|SY $115.00 $3,450.00 $70.00 $2,100.00 $200.00 $6,000.00
28 |6"-8" River Rock 40.00(SY $115.00 $4,600.00 $70.00 $2,800.00 $280.00 | $11,200.00
29 |Landscape 1.00(LS $65,000.00 $65,000.00 | $68,000.00 [ $68,000.00 | $155,000.00 | $155,000.00
30 |[Top Soil and Seed 1.00(LS $35,000.00 $35,000.00 | $20,000.00 [ $20,000.00 | $48,000.00 | $48,000.00
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00(LS $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,800.00 $4,800.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: $854,719.50 $860,634.00 $1,690,985.00 NO BID

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Fred M. Schiavone
Construction, Inc.

Furino and Sons, Inc.

Pioneer General Contracting
Co., Inc

RNM Construction, LLC

2057 Tuckahoe Road,
Franklinville, NJ 08322

P: (856)697-4558 x 21
F: (856)-697-5412

66 Columbia Road,
Branchburg, NJ 08876

P: (908)756-7736 x 129
F: (908)842-0241

PO Box 67 Bradley Beach,
NJ 07720

P: (732)-807-3158
F: (732)807-3159

45 Hockamick Road
Cookstown, NJ 08511

P: (609)-722-1270

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS
2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF
5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF
6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00(LF
7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN
8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00{UN
9 [Inlet Type 'A’ 1.00|UN
10 Doghouse Inlet Type 'A' 1.00|UN
1 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN
12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00|UN
13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY
14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY
15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF
16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF
17 Wheel Stop 21.00 |UN
18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00|SY

50f8




ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Fred M. Schiavone
Construction, Inc.

Furino and Sons, Inc.

Pioneer General Contracting
Co., Inc

RNM Construction, LLC

2057 Tuckahoe Road,
Franklinville, NJ 08322

P: (856)697-4558 x 21
F: (856)-697-5412

66 Columbia Road,
Branchburg, NJ 08876

P: (908)756-7736 x 129
F: (908)842-0241

PO Box 67 Bradley Beach,
NJ 07720

P: (732)-807-3158
F: (732)807-3159

45 Hockamick Road
Cookstown, NJ 08511

P: (609)-722-1270

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19 Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8") (Includes Installation) 1.00|LS
20 Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN
22 Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN
23 Play Equipment Installation 1.00|LS
24 Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF
25 Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY
26 Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF
27 4"-6" River Rock 30.00(SY
28 6"-8" River Rock 40.00|SY
29 Landscape 1.00|LS
30 Top Soil and Seed 1.00|LS
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00|LS
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Shore Top Construction
Corp

West Bay Construction, Inc.

23 Yellowbrook Rd Freehold
NJ 07728

P: (732)-835-2600
F: (732)-377-7774

133 Pleasant Ave Absecon,
NJ 08201

P: (609)-380-7065
F: (609)-573-5955

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS
2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF
5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF
6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00(LF
7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN
8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00{UN
9 [Inlet Type 'A’ 1.00|UN
10 Doghouse Inlet Type 'A' 1.00|UN
1 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN
12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00|UN
13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY
14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY
15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF
16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF
17 Wheel Stop 21.00 |UN
18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00|SY
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Shore Top Construction
Corp

West Bay Construction, Inc.

23 Yellowbrook Rd Freehold
NJ 07728

P: (732)-835-2600
F: (732)-377-7774

133 Pleasant Ave Absecon,
NJ 08201

P: (609)-380-7065
F: (609)-573-5955

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19 Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8") (Includes Installation) 1.00|LS
20 Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN
22 Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN
23 Play Equipment Installation 1.00|LS
24 Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF
25 Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY
26 Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF
27 4"-6" River Rock 30.00(SY
28 6"-8" River Rock 40.00|SY
29 Landscape 1.00|LS
30 Top Soil and Seed 1.00|LS
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00|LS
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: NO BID NO BID

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Capela Construction, Inc.

Decker's Hardscaping &
Landscaping Inc.

Seacoast Construction Inc.

Think Pavers Hardscaping
LLC

PO Box 2046 Medford
Lakes, NJ 08055

P: (609)-535-5367
F: (609)-801-2533

16 Lakeside Ave, Cherry
Hill, NJ 08003

P: (856)795-7087
F: (856)354-8630

15 Addington Court East
Brunswick, NJ 08816-5300

P: (732)-238-6963
F: (732)238-6083

125 Kings Highway, Mount
Royal, NJ 08061

P: (856)832-4680
F: (856)832-4681

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 $50,250.00 | $50,250.00 | $105,000.00 | $105,000.00 | $237,999.74 | $237,999.74
2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY $15.00 $5,625.00 $26.00 $9,750.00 $0.01 $3.75 $0.01 $3.75
3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00({CY $15.00 $5,625.00 $17.00 $6,375.00 $0.01 $3.75 $0.01 $3.75
4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF $40.00 $8,600.00 $70.00 | $15,050.00 $75.00 | $16,125.00 $20.00 $4,300.00
5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF $50.00 $2,000.00 $72.00 $2,880.00 $80.00 | $3,200.00 $20.00 $800.00
6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00(LF $100.00 $8,500.00 $90.00 $7,650.00 $85.00 | $7,225.00 $20.00 $1,700.00
7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $885.00 $4,425.00 $4,250.00 | $21,250.00 $2,200.00 | $11,000.00
8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00|UN $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $6,400.00 | $12,800.00 $4,650.00 | $9,300.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00
9 Inlet Type ‘A’ 1.00|UN $10,000.00 | $10,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 | $6,500.00 $25,000.00 | $25,000.00
10 Doghouse Inlet Type ‘A’ 1.00|UN $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 | $6,500.00 $35,000.00 | $35,000.00
11 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,260.00 $7,260.00 $2,250.00 | $2,250.00 $0.01 $0.01
12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00{UN $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $1,500.00 | $3,000.00 $5,000.00 | $10,000.00
13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY $100.00 $125,000.00 $80.00 | $100,000.00 $108.00 | $135,000.00 $70.00 | $87,500.00
14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY $130.00 $1,300.00 $85.00 $850.00 $140.00 | $1,400.00 $70.00 $700.00
15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF $50.00 $2,150.00 $45.00 $1,935.00 $50.00 | $2,150.00 $25.00 $1,075.00
16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF $10.00 $2,800.00 $65.00 | $18,200.00 $55.00 | $15,400.00 $25.00 $7,000.00
17 Wheel Stop 21.00 |UN $100.00 $2,100.00 $150.00 $3,150.00 $100.00 | $2,100.00 $20.00 $420.00
18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00(|SY $30.00 $37,800.00 $11.75 | $14,805.00 $18.00 | $22,680.00 $5.00 $6,300.00
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Capela Construction, Inc. Decr:;ssgzg?:gcalgisg & Seacoast Construction Inc. Think Pave[sl_gardscaping
PO Box 2046 Medford 16 Lakeside Ave, Cherry 15 Addington Court East 125 Kings Highway, Mount

Lakes, NJ 08055 Hill, NJ 08003 Brunswick, NJ 08816-5300 Royal, NJ 08061

P: (609)-535-5367 P: (856)795-7087 P: (732)-238-6963 P: (856)832-4680

F: (609)-801-2533 F: (856)354-8630 F: (732)238-6083 F: (856)832-4681

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19  |Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8') (Includes Installation) 1.00(LS $90,000.00 | $90,000.00 | $115,655.00 | $115,655.00 | $95,000.00 | $95,000.00 | $125,000.00 | $125,000.00
20 |Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF $50.00 $14,500.00 $110.00 | $31,900.00 $85.63 | $24,832.70 $50.00 | $14,500.00
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,278.00 | $2,556.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00
22 |Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $2,350.00 | $2,350.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
23  |Play Equipment Installation 1.00(LS $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 | $61,625.00 | $61,625.00 | $30,000.00 | $30,000.00 $75,000.00 | $75,000.00
24  |Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF $25.00 $128,750.00 $31.00 | $159,650.00 $22.00 | $113,300.00 $20.00 | $103,000.00
25 |Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY $100.00 $133.00 $400.00 $532.00 $750.00 | $997.50 $575.00 $764.75
26 |Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF $5.00 $1,950.00 $4.85 $1,891.50 $3.00 | $1,170.00 $6.00 $2,340.00
27  |4"-6" River Rock 30.00|SY $150.00 $4,500.00 $60.00 $1,800.00 $270.00 | $8,100.00 $50.00 $1,500.00
28 |6"-8" River Rock 40.00(SY $200.00 $8,000.00 $80.00 $3,200.00 $270.00 | $10,800.00 $50.00 $2,000.00
29 |Landscape 1.00(LS $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 | $27,200.00 | $27,200.00 | $72,500.00 | $72,500.00 $20,000.00 | $20,000.00
30 |[Top Soil and Seed 1.00(LS $15,000.00 | $15,000.00 | $40,000.00 | $40,000.00 | $55,000.00 | $55,000.00 $20,000.00 | $20,000.00
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00(LS $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $1,350.00 | $1,350.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: $595,833.00 $724,233.50 $777,043.70 $803,807.00

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK
JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS
CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Vulcan Construction Group,

Landberg Construction LLC Inc

Senco Metals, LLC The Earle Asphalt Co.

82 Tuckahoe Road, Dorothy,| 3 Hance Drive, Cookstown, 318 McLean Blvd Unit 4 PO Box 556, Farmingdale,

NJ 08317 NJ 08511 Paterson, NJ 07504 NJ 07727-0556
P: (609)829-2131 P: (848)525-1201 P: (973) 342-1742 P: (732)308-1113 x 206
F: (609)909-1647 F: (848)997-1230 F: (732)308-1034

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS $131,000.00 | $131,000.00 | $200,000.00 | $200,000.00 | $210,000.00 | $210,000.00

2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY $5.00 $1,875.00 $10.00 $3,750.00 $65.00 [ $24,375.00

3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY $5.00 $1,875.00 $5.00 $1,875.00 $100.00 | $37,500.00

4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF $86.00 $18,490.00 $30.00 $6,450.00 $75.00 | $16,125.00

5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF $100.00 $4,000.00 $40.00 $1,600.00 $95.00 $3,800.00

6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00|LF $120.00 $10,200.00 $50.00 $4,250.00 $135.00 | $11,475.00

7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN $2,200.00 $11,000.00 $2,500.00 | $12,500.00 $3,800.00 | $19,000.00

8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00{UN $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $6,500.00 | $13,000.00

9 Inlet Type ‘A’ 1.00|UN $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00

10 Doghouse Inlet Type 'A’ 1.00|UN $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00

11 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00

12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00|UN $650.00 $1,300.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,800.00 $7,600.00

13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY $108.00 $135,000.00 $90.00 | $112,500.00 $250.00 | $312,500.00

14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY $140.00 $1,400.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $300.00 $3,000.00

15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF $45.00 $1,935.00 $40.00 $1,720.00 $115.00 $4,945.00

16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF $45.00 $12,600.00 $60.00 | $16,800.00 $85.00 | $23,800.00

17 Wheel Stop 21.00 (UN $110.00 $2,310.00 $180.00 $3,780.00 $450.00 $9,450.00

18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00|SY $7.25 $9,135.00 $10.00 | $12,600.00 $50.00 | $63,000.00

30of8




ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Landberg Construction LLC Vulcan Consl‘;]rg'ction Group, Senco Metals, LLC The Earle Asphalt Co.
82 Tuckahoe Road, Dorothy,| 3 Hance Drive, Cookstown, 318 McLean Blvd Unit 4 PO Box 556, Farmingdale,
NJ 08317 NJ 08511 Paterson, NJ 07504 NJ 07727-0556
P: (609)829-2131 P: (848)525-1201 P: (973) 342-1742 P: (732)308-1113 x 206
F: (609)909-1647 F: (848)997-1230 F: (732)308-1034
NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19  |Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8') (Includes Installation) 1.00(LS $67,000.00 $67,000.00 | $120,000.00 | $120,000.00 | $245,000.00 | $245,000.00
20 |Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF $60.00 $17,400.00 $30.00 $8,700.00 $70.00 | $20,300.00
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00
22 |Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,800.00 $4,800.00
23  |Play Equipment Installation 1.00(LS $150,000.00 | $150,000.00 | $100,000.00 | $100,000.00 | $285,000.00 | $285,000.00
24  |Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF $29.00 $149,350.00 $25.00 | $128,750.00 $23.00 | $118,450.00
25 Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY $400.00 $532.00 $300.00 $399.00 $500.00 $665.00
26 |Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF $3.25 $1,267.50 $4.00 $1,560.00 $20.00 $7,800.00
27  |4"-6" River Rock 30.00|SY $115.00 $3,450.00 $70.00 $2,100.00 $200.00 $6,000.00
28 |6"-8" River Rock 40.00(SY $115.00 $4,600.00 $70.00 $2,800.00 $280.00 | $11,200.00
29 |Landscape 1.00(LS $65,000.00 $65,000.00 | $68,000.00 [ $68,000.00 | $155,000.00 | $155,000.00
30 |[Top Soil and Seed 1.00(LS $35,000.00 $35,000.00 | $20,000.00 [ $20,000.00 | $48,000.00 | $48,000.00
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00(LS $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,800.00 $4,800.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: $854,719.50 $860,634.00 $1,690,985.00 NO BID

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Fred M. Schiavone
Construction, Inc.

Furino and Sons, Inc.

Pioneer General Contracting
Co., Inc

RNM Construction, LLC

2057 Tuckahoe Road,
Franklinville, NJ 08322

P: (856)697-4558 x 21
F: (856)-697-5412

66 Columbia Road,
Branchburg, NJ 08876

P: (908)756-7736 x 129
F: (908)842-0241

PO Box 67 Bradley Beach,
NJ 07720

P: (732)-807-3158
F: (732)807-3159

45 Hockamick Road
Cookstown, NJ 08511

P: (609)-722-1270

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS
2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF
5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF
6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00(LF
7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN
8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00{UN
9 [Inlet Type 'A’ 1.00|UN
10 Doghouse Inlet Type 'A' 1.00|UN
1 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN
12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00|UN
13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY
14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY
15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF
16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF
17 Wheel Stop 21.00 |UN
18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00|SY

50f8




ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Fred M. Schiavone
Construction, Inc.

Furino and Sons, Inc.

Pioneer General Contracting
Co., Inc

RNM Construction, LLC

2057 Tuckahoe Road,
Franklinville, NJ 08322

P: (856)697-4558 x 21
F: (856)-697-5412

66 Columbia Road,
Branchburg, NJ 08876

P: (908)756-7736 x 129
F: (908)842-0241

PO Box 67 Bradley Beach,
NJ 07720

P: (732)-807-3158
F: (732)807-3159

45 Hockamick Road
Cookstown, NJ 08511

P: (609)-722-1270

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19 Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8") (Includes Installation) 1.00|LS
20 Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN
22 Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN
23 Play Equipment Installation 1.00|LS
24 Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF
25 Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY
26 Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF
27 4"-6" River Rock 30.00(SY
28 6"-8" River Rock 40.00|SY
29 Landscape 1.00|LS
30 Top Soil and Seed 1.00|LS
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00|LS
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Shore Top Construction
Corp

West Bay Construction, Inc.

23 Yellowbrook Rd Freehold
NJ 07728

P: (732)-835-2600
F: (732)-377-7774

133 Pleasant Ave Absecon,
NJ 08201

P: (609)-380-7065
F: (609)-573-5955

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS
2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF
5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF
6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00(LF
7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN
8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00{UN
9 [Inlet Type 'A’ 1.00|UN
10 Doghouse Inlet Type 'A' 1.00|UN
1 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN
12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00|UN
13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY
14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY
15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF
16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF
17 Wheel Stop 21.00 |UN
18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00|SY
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Shore Top Construction
Corp

West Bay Construction, Inc.

23 Yellowbrook Rd Freehold
NJ 07728

P: (732)-835-2600
F: (732)-377-7774

133 Pleasant Ave Absecon,
NJ 08201

P: (609)-380-7065
F: (609)-573-5955

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19 Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8") (Includes Installation) 1.00|LS
20 Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN
22 Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN
23 Play Equipment Installation 1.00|LS
24 Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF
25 Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY
26 Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF
27 4"-6" River Rock 30.00(SY
28 6"-8" River Rock 40.00|SY
29 Landscape 1.00|LS
30 Top Soil and Seed 1.00|LS
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00|LS
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: NO BID NO BID

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Capela Construction, Inc.

Decker's Hardscaping &
Landscaping Inc.

Seacoast Construction Inc.

Think Pavers Hardscaping
LLC

PO Box 2046 Medford
Lakes, NJ 08055

P: (609)-535-5367
F: (609)-801-2533

16 Lakeside Ave, Cherry
Hill, NJ 08003

P: (856)795-7087
F: (856)354-8630

15 Addington Court East
Brunswick, NJ 08816-5300

P: (732)-238-6963
F: (732)238-6083

125 Kings Highway, Mount
Royal, NJ 08061

P: (856)832-4680
F: (856)832-4681

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 $50,250.00 | $50,250.00 | $105,000.00 | $105,000.00 | $237,999.74 | $237,999.74
2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY $15.00 $5,625.00 $26.00 $9,750.00 $0.01 $3.75 $0.01 $3.75
3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00({CY $15.00 $5,625.00 $17.00 $6,375.00 $0.01 $3.75 $0.01 $3.75
4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF $40.00 $8,600.00 $70.00 | $15,050.00 $75.00 | $16,125.00 $20.00 $4,300.00
5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF $50.00 $2,000.00 $72.00 $2,880.00 $80.00 | $3,200.00 $20.00 $800.00
6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00(LF $100.00 $8,500.00 $90.00 $7,650.00 $85.00 | $7,225.00 $20.00 $1,700.00
7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $885.00 $4,425.00 $4,250.00 | $21,250.00 $2,200.00 | $11,000.00
8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00|UN $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $6,400.00 | $12,800.00 $4,650.00 | $9,300.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00
9 Inlet Type ‘A’ 1.00|UN $10,000.00 | $10,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 | $6,500.00 $25,000.00 | $25,000.00
10 Doghouse Inlet Type ‘A’ 1.00|UN $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 | $6,500.00 $35,000.00 | $35,000.00
11 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,260.00 $7,260.00 $2,250.00 | $2,250.00 $0.01 $0.01
12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00{UN $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $1,500.00 | $3,000.00 $5,000.00 | $10,000.00
13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY $100.00 $125,000.00 $80.00 | $100,000.00 $108.00 | $135,000.00 $70.00 | $87,500.00
14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY $130.00 $1,300.00 $85.00 $850.00 $140.00 | $1,400.00 $70.00 $700.00
15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF $50.00 $2,150.00 $45.00 $1,935.00 $50.00 | $2,150.00 $25.00 $1,075.00
16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF $10.00 $2,800.00 $65.00 | $18,200.00 $55.00 | $15,400.00 $25.00 $7,000.00
17 Wheel Stop 21.00 |UN $100.00 $2,100.00 $150.00 $3,150.00 $100.00 | $2,100.00 $20.00 $420.00
18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00(|SY $30.00 $37,800.00 $11.75 | $14,805.00 $18.00 | $22,680.00 $5.00 $6,300.00
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Capela Construction, Inc. Decr:;ssgzg?:gcalgisg & Seacoast Construction Inc. Think Pave[sl_gardscaping
PO Box 2046 Medford 16 Lakeside Ave, Cherry 15 Addington Court East 125 Kings Highway, Mount

Lakes, NJ 08055 Hill, NJ 08003 Brunswick, NJ 08816-5300 Royal, NJ 08061

P: (609)-535-5367 P: (856)795-7087 P: (732)-238-6963 P: (856)832-4680

F: (609)-801-2533 F: (856)354-8630 F: (732)238-6083 F: (856)832-4681

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19  |Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8') (Includes Installation) 1.00(LS $90,000.00 | $90,000.00 | $115,655.00 | $115,655.00 | $95,000.00 | $95,000.00 | $125,000.00 | $125,000.00
20 |Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF $50.00 $14,500.00 $110.00 | $31,900.00 $85.63 | $24,832.70 $50.00 | $14,500.00
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,278.00 | $2,556.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00
22 |Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $2,350.00 | $2,350.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
23  |Play Equipment Installation 1.00(LS $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 | $61,625.00 | $61,625.00 | $30,000.00 | $30,000.00 $75,000.00 | $75,000.00
24  |Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF $25.00 $128,750.00 $31.00 | $159,650.00 $22.00 | $113,300.00 $20.00 | $103,000.00
25 |Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY $100.00 $133.00 $400.00 $532.00 $750.00 | $997.50 $575.00 $764.75
26 |Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF $5.00 $1,950.00 $4.85 $1,891.50 $3.00 | $1,170.00 $6.00 $2,340.00
27  |4"-6" River Rock 30.00|SY $150.00 $4,500.00 $60.00 $1,800.00 $270.00 | $8,100.00 $50.00 $1,500.00
28 |6"-8" River Rock 40.00(SY $200.00 $8,000.00 $80.00 $3,200.00 $270.00 | $10,800.00 $50.00 $2,000.00
29 |Landscape 1.00(LS $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 | $27,200.00 | $27,200.00 | $72,500.00 | $72,500.00 $20,000.00 | $20,000.00
30 |[Top Soil and Seed 1.00(LS $15,000.00 | $15,000.00 | $40,000.00 | $40,000.00 | $55,000.00 | $55,000.00 $20,000.00 | $20,000.00
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00(LS $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $1,350.00 | $1,350.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: $595,833.00 $724,233.50 $777,043.70 $803,807.00

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK
JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS
CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Vulcan Construction Group,

Landberg Construction LLC Inc

Senco Metals, LLC The Earle Asphalt Co.

82 Tuckahoe Road, Dorothy,| 3 Hance Drive, Cookstown, 318 McLean Blvd Unit 4 PO Box 556, Farmingdale,

NJ 08317 NJ 08511 Paterson, NJ 07504 NJ 07727-0556
P: (609)829-2131 P: (848)525-1201 P: (973) 342-1742 P: (732)308-1113 x 206
F: (609)909-1647 F: (848)997-1230 F: (732)308-1034

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS $131,000.00 | $131,000.00 | $200,000.00 | $200,000.00 | $210,000.00 | $210,000.00

2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY $5.00 $1,875.00 $10.00 $3,750.00 $65.00 [ $24,375.00

3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY $5.00 $1,875.00 $5.00 $1,875.00 $100.00 | $37,500.00

4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF $86.00 $18,490.00 $30.00 $6,450.00 $75.00 | $16,125.00

5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF $100.00 $4,000.00 $40.00 $1,600.00 $95.00 $3,800.00

6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00|LF $120.00 $10,200.00 $50.00 $4,250.00 $135.00 | $11,475.00

7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN $2,200.00 $11,000.00 $2,500.00 | $12,500.00 $3,800.00 | $19,000.00

8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00{UN $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $6,500.00 | $13,000.00

9 Inlet Type ‘A’ 1.00|UN $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00

10 Doghouse Inlet Type 'A’ 1.00|UN $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00

11 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00

12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00|UN $650.00 $1,300.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,800.00 $7,600.00

13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY $108.00 $135,000.00 $90.00 | $112,500.00 $250.00 | $312,500.00

14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY $140.00 $1,400.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $300.00 $3,000.00

15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF $45.00 $1,935.00 $40.00 $1,720.00 $115.00 $4,945.00

16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF $45.00 $12,600.00 $60.00 | $16,800.00 $85.00 | $23,800.00

17 Wheel Stop 21.00 (UN $110.00 $2,310.00 $180.00 $3,780.00 $450.00 $9,450.00

18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00|SY $7.25 $9,135.00 $10.00 | $12,600.00 $50.00 | $63,000.00
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Landberg Construction LLC Vulcan Consl‘;]rg'ction Group, Senco Metals, LLC The Earle Asphalt Co.
82 Tuckahoe Road, Dorothy,| 3 Hance Drive, Cookstown, 318 McLean Blvd Unit 4 PO Box 556, Farmingdale,
NJ 08317 NJ 08511 Paterson, NJ 07504 NJ 07727-0556
P: (609)829-2131 P: (848)525-1201 P: (973) 342-1742 P: (732)308-1113 x 206
F: (609)909-1647 F: (848)997-1230 F: (732)308-1034
NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19  |Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8') (Includes Installation) 1.00(LS $67,000.00 $67,000.00 | $120,000.00 | $120,000.00 | $245,000.00 | $245,000.00
20 |Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF $60.00 $17,400.00 $30.00 $8,700.00 $70.00 | $20,300.00
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00
22 |Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,800.00 $4,800.00
23  |Play Equipment Installation 1.00(LS $150,000.00 | $150,000.00 | $100,000.00 | $100,000.00 | $285,000.00 | $285,000.00
24  |Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF $29.00 $149,350.00 $25.00 | $128,750.00 $23.00 | $118,450.00
25 Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY $400.00 $532.00 $300.00 $399.00 $500.00 $665.00
26 |Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF $3.25 $1,267.50 $4.00 $1,560.00 $20.00 $7,800.00
27  |4"-6" River Rock 30.00|SY $115.00 $3,450.00 $70.00 $2,100.00 $200.00 $6,000.00
28 |6"-8" River Rock 40.00(SY $115.00 $4,600.00 $70.00 $2,800.00 $280.00 | $11,200.00
29 |Landscape 1.00(LS $65,000.00 $65,000.00 | $68,000.00 [ $68,000.00 | $155,000.00 | $155,000.00
30 |[Top Soil and Seed 1.00(LS $35,000.00 $35,000.00 | $20,000.00 [ $20,000.00 | $48,000.00 | $48,000.00
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00(LS $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,800.00 $4,800.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: $854,719.50 $860,634.00 $1,690,985.00 NO BID

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Fred M. Schiavone
Construction, Inc.

Furino and Sons, Inc.

Pioneer General Contracting
Co., Inc

RNM Construction, LLC

2057 Tuckahoe Road,
Franklinville, NJ 08322

P: (856)697-4558 x 21
F: (856)-697-5412

66 Columbia Road,
Branchburg, NJ 08876

P: (908)756-7736 x 129
F: (908)842-0241

PO Box 67 Bradley Beach,
NJ 07720

P: (732)-807-3158
F: (732)807-3159

45 Hockamick Road
Cookstown, NJ 08511

P: (609)-722-1270

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS
2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF
5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF
6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00(LF
7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN
8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00{UN
9 [Inlet Type 'A’ 1.00|UN
10 Doghouse Inlet Type 'A' 1.00|UN
1 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN
12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00|UN
13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY
14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY
15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF
16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF
17 Wheel Stop 21.00 |UN
18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00|SY
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Fred M. Schiavone
Construction, Inc.

Furino and Sons, Inc.

Pioneer General Contracting
Co., Inc

RNM Construction, LLC

2057 Tuckahoe Road,
Franklinville, NJ 08322

P: (856)697-4558 x 21
F: (856)-697-5412

66 Columbia Road,
Branchburg, NJ 08876

P: (908)756-7736 x 129
F: (908)842-0241

PO Box 67 Bradley Beach,
NJ 07720

P: (732)-807-3158
F: (732)807-3159

45 Hockamick Road
Cookstown, NJ 08511

P: (609)-722-1270

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19 Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8") (Includes Installation) 1.00|LS
20 Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN
22 Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN
23 Play Equipment Installation 1.00|LS
24 Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF
25 Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY
26 Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF
27 4"-6" River Rock 30.00(SY
28 6"-8" River Rock 40.00|SY
29 Landscape 1.00|LS
30 Top Soil and Seed 1.00|LS
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00|LS
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

mathematically corrected value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Shore Top Construction
Corp

West Bay Construction, Inc.

23 Yellowbrook Rd Freehold
NJ 07728

P: (732)-835-2600
F: (732)-377-7774

133 Pleasant Ave Absecon,
NJ 08201

P: (609)-380-7065
F: (609)-573-5955

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
1 Site Clearing, Excavation and Earthwork 1.00|LS
2 Clean Borrow Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
3 Over Excavation (If and Where Directed) 375.00|CY
4 6"Perforated HDPE Pipe 215.00|LF
5 8" HDPE Pipe 40.00|LF
6 12" HDPE Pipe 85.00(LF
7 6" Nyloplast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 5.00 |UN
8 12" Nylopast Inline Drain with Solid Cover 2.00{UN
9 [Inlet Type 'A’ 1.00|UN
10 Doghouse Inlet Type 'A' 1.00|UN
1 Inserta Tee Yard Drain 1.00|UN
12 Reconstruct Yard Drain 2.00|UN
13 Concrete, 4" Thick 1,250.00|SY
14 Concrete, 6" Thick 10.00|SY
15 Concrete Curb 43.00|LF
16 Playground Curb 280.00|LF
17 Wheel Stop 21.00 |UN
18 DGA, 4"Thick 1,260.00|SY
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 03/03/2026 at 11:00 AM

JAKE'S LAW INCLUSIVE PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS

JOHN F. KENNEDY PARK

CITY OF BURLINGTON
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
40006 02

Shore Top Construction
Corp

West Bay Construction, Inc.

23 Yellowbrook Rd Freehold
NJ 07728

P: (732)-835-2600
F: (732)-377-7774

133 Pleasant Ave Absecon,
NJ 08201

P: (609)-380-7065
F: (609)-573-5955

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
19 Pedestrain Bridge (25'x8") (Includes Installation) 1.00|LS
20 Chain Link Fence, 4' High 290.00|LF
21 6' Wide man Gate 2.00|UN
22 Chain Link Fence,10' Maintenance Gate 1.00|UN
23 Play Equipment Installation 1.00|LS
24 Poured in Place Rubber Surfacing 5,150.00(SF
25 Detectable Warning Surface, Brick Pavers 1.33|SY
26 Epoxy Resin Striping, 4" Wide 390.00|LF
27 4"-6" River Rock 30.00(SY
28 6"-8" River Rock 40.00|SY
29 Landscape 1.00|LS
30 Top Soil and Seed 1.00|LS
31 Green Acres Construction Sign 1.00|LS
TOTAL AMOUNT BID: NO BID NO BID

mathematically corrected value
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