
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
BASE BID 

1 Labor - Regular Time - Job Superintendent 20 Hrs $67.00 $1,340.00
2 Labor - Regular Time - Mechanic 230 Hrs $150.00 $34,500.00
3 Labor - Regular Time - Mechanic’s Helper 230 Hrs $105.00 $24,150.00
4 Labor - Regular Time - Electrician 225 Hrs $160.00 $36,000.00
5 Labor – Regular Time - Laborer 45 Hrs $129.00 $5,805.00
6 Labor – Regular Time – Welder 20 Hrs $134.00 $2,680.00
7 Labor – Regular Time - Instrumentation Electrician 160 Hrs $160.00 $25,600.00
8 Labor – Over Time –Job Superintendent 20 Hrs $77.00 $1,540.00
9 Labor – Over Time - Mechanic 25 Hrs $206.00 $5,150.00

10 Labor – Over Time – Mechanic’s Helper 25 Hrs $77.00 $1,925.00
11 Labor – Over Time - Electrician 45 Hrs $226.00 $10,170.00
12 Labor – Over Time - Laborer 20 Hrs $185.00 $3,700.00
13 Labor – Over Time – Welder 10 Hrs $144.00 $1,440.00
14 Labor – Over Time – Instrumentation Electrician 40 Hrs $211.00 $8,440.00
15 Materials Support Services - Allowance $20,000 LS 1.10 $22,000.00

16 Supply Spare Recirculation Pump, Treatment Plant (If & 
Where Directed) 1 UN $33,500.00 $33,500.00

17 Supply Replacement T-6 Pump Parts, Complete Rotating 
Assembly (If & Where Directed) 1 UN $11,800.00 $11,800.00

18 Supply Replacement T-6 Pump Parts, Ware Plate with 
Eradicator Cutting Grooves (If & Where Directed) 1 UN $1,973.00 $1,973.00

19 Supply Spare Grinder, Treatment Plant (If & Where 
Directed) 1 UN $32,000.00 $32,000.00

20 Supply Blower Motor (If & Where Directed) 1 UN $25,500.00 $25,500.00

21 Supply Spare Pump, Korman Pump Station (If & Where 
Directed) 1 UN $36,850.00 $36,850.00

22 Supply Spare Grinder, Korman Pump Station (If & Where 
Directed) 1 UN $50,900.00 $50,900.00

23 Supply Spare Pump, Berkley Ave Pump Station (If & 
Where Directed) 1 UN $30,100.00 $30,100.00

24 Supply Spare Grinder, Berkley Ave Pump Statio (If & 
Where Directed) 1 UN $56,800.00 $56,800.00

25 Supply Spare Pump, New Jersey Ave Pump Station (If & 
Where Directed) 1 UN $20,860.00 $20,860.00

26 Supply Spare Pump, Riverfront Pump Station (If & Where 
Directed) 1 UN $17,900.00 $17,900.00

Bid Opening 12/09/2025 at 10:45 AM

P: (856)697-1900P: (856)786-9434

No Bid

F: (856)-697-0757F: (856)786-0642

No Bid

P: (973)478-5200

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID:

2026 MAINTENANCE CONTRACT
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
44000 21

Montana Construction Corp., 
Inc.

1566 Harding Highway, 
Newfield, NJ 08344-5220

1352 Taylors Lane, Cinaminson, 
NJ 08077-2510

Wind River Environmental Waters and Bugbee, Inc.

5 Holland Street, Salunga, 
PA 17538 Waters and Bugbee, Inc.

Mobile Dredging & Video 
Pipe Svs., Inc.Municipal Maintenance, Inc.

80 Contant Ave, Lodi, NJ 
07644-1704

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

P: (978)333-5039 P: (609)584-1100

No Bid

F: (978)567-0728 F: (609)584-2200

$502,623.00 No Bid



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

Bid Opening 12/09/2025 at 10:45 AM

P: (856)697-1900P: (856)786-9434
F: (856)-697-0757F: (856)786-0642

P: (973)478-5200

2026 MAINTENANCE CONTRACT
BOROUGH OF PALMYRA

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
44000 21

Montana Construction Corp., 
Inc.

1566 Harding Highway, 
Newfield, NJ 08344-5220

1352 Taylors Lane, Cinaminson, 
NJ 08077-2510

Wind River Environmental Waters and Bugbee, Inc.

5 Holland Street, Salunga, 
PA 17538 Waters and Bugbee, Inc.

Mobile Dredging & Video 
Pipe Svs., Inc.Municipal Maintenance, Inc.

80 Contant Ave, Lodi, NJ 
07644-1704

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

P: (978)333-5039 P: (609)584-1100
F: (978)567-0728 F: (609)584-2200

A27
A27.1 Korman Pump Station 1 EA $1,800.00 $1,800.00
A27.2 NJ Avenue Pump Station 1 EA $1,900.00 $1,900.00
A27.3 Riverfront Pump Station 1 EA $1,800.00 $1,800.00

A28 Supply Clarifier Drive 1 LS $43,800.00 $43,800.00

A29 Supply & Install Valves in Clarifier 2 UN $29,430.00 $58,860.00

A30 Supply Manway Gasket & Spare Nuts & Bolts 1 LS $4,590.00 $4,590.00

A31 Modify EQ Tank Drain 1 LS $43,200.00 $43,200.00

$545,823.00
$658,573.00

TOTAL AMOUNT  ALTERNATE BID#5:
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID#5:

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 + #2 + #3 + #4 + #5:

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 + #2 + #3 + #4:
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID#4:

TOTAL AMOUNT  ALTERNATE BID#4:

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 + #2 + #3:
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID#3:

TOTAL AMOUNT  ALTERNATE BID#3:

ALTERNATE BID#5 - ITEM A31 - MODIFY EQ TANK DRAIN

Supply New Trash Baskets for Pump Stations

TOTAL AMOUNT  ALTERNATE BID#1:

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 + #2:
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID#2:

TOTAL AMOUNT  ALTERNATE BID#2:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

$4,590.00
$507,213.00
$615,373.00

$43,200.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID#1:

ALTERNATE BID#1 - ITEM A27 - SUPPLY NEW TRASH BASKETS FOR PUMP STATIONS

ALTERNATE BID#2 - ITEM A28 - SUPPLY CLARIFIER DRIVE AND MOTOR

ALTERNATE BID#3 - ITEM A29 - SUPPLY & INSTALL VALVES IN CLARIFIER

ALTERNATE BID#4 - ITEM A30 - SUPPLY MANWAY GASKETS & SPARE NUTS & BOLTS

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

$58,860.00
$561,483.00
$610,783.00

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

$5,500.00
$508,123.00

$43,800.00
$546,423.00
$551,923.00

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid


