
NO DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

Base Bid

1 Maintenance & Protection of Traffic 1            LS $500.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

2 Township Police Traffic Directors 1            Allow. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

3 Protruding Lateral Elimination, as required 5            UN $615.00 $3,075.00 $750.00 $3,750.00

4 8” Sewer Main Line Pipe 3,200     LF $48.00 $153,600.00 $45.00 $144,000.00

5 Reestablish Sewer Lateral 73          UN $27.00 $1,971.00 $50.00 $3,650.00

6 Test/Seal Sewer Lateral 73          UN $720.00 $52,560.00 $845.00 $61,685.00

7 Refurbish Manhole 140        VF $720.00 $100,800.00 $975.00 $136,500.00

8 Remove & Replace Mahole Step (I&WD) 10          UN $240.00 $2,400.00 $368.00 $3,680.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID: $319,906.00 $360,765.00 NO BID NO BID

P: 814-270-7602 P: 732-531-0602

Freehold, NJ 07728

F: 732-625-9309

Ocean, NJ 07712

Trenchless Solultions

210 Bennet Road 1001 Hopewell Ave

21918 00

Vortex Services, LLC Sewer Rat

BID OPENING: 10/09/2025 AT 10:00 AM MOUNT LAUREL MUA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS, INC. Contract 2025-06
SUMMARY OF BIDS FY-26 SANITARY SEWER REHABILITATION PROJECT- MILL RUN

Earle Co.

PO Box 556
Farmingdale, NJ 07727

P: 732-308-1113 x 206
F: 732-308-1034

Mobile Dredging &

Video Pipe Svs. Inc.

1566 Harding Highway
Newfield, NJ 08344-5220

P: 856-697-1900
F: 856-697-0757



NO DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT

Base Bid

1 Maintenance & Protection of Traffic 1            LS

2 Township Police Traffic Directors 1            Allow.

3 Protruding Lateral Elimination, as required 5            UN

4 8” Sewer Main Line Pipe 3,200     LF

5 Reestablish Sewer Lateral 73          UN

6 Test/Seal Sewer Lateral 73          UN

7 Refurbish Manhole 140        VF

8 Remove & Replace Mahole Step (I&WD) 10          UN

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID:

BID OPENING: 10/09/2025 AT 10:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS, INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

NO BIDNO BID NO BID NO BID

F:609-584-2200
P: 636-385-1080P:  570-468-7938P: 215-785-2242 P: 609-584-1100

Dunmore, PA 18512

F: 636-385-1100

Bristol, PA 19007 Hamilton, NJ 08691 O'Fallon, MO 63366-1922

& Rehabilitation Procedures

1000 Dunham Drive1237 Hayes Blvd. 75 South Gold Drive 864 Hoff Road

21918 00

InfraHorseSewer & Water Evaluation Waters and Bugbee, Inc. SAK Construction, LLC

MOUNT LAUREL MUA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ

Contract 2025-06
FY-26 SANITARY SEWER REHABILITATION PROJECT- MILL RUN



NO DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT

Base Bid

1 Maintenance & Protection of Traffic 1            LS

2 Township Police Traffic Directors 1            Allow.

3 Protruding Lateral Elimination, as required 5            UN

4 8” Sewer Main Line Pipe 3,200     LF

5 Reestablish Sewer Lateral 73          UN

6 Test/Seal Sewer Lateral 73          UN

7 Refurbish Manhole 140        VF

8 Remove & Replace Mahole Step (I&WD) 10          UN

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID:

BID OPENING: 10/09/2025 AT 10:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS, INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

NO BID

P: 856-697-1906
F: 1-866-570-8187

Suite 700
Cincinnati, OH 45209

3825 Edwards Road

21918 00

Construct Connect

MOUNT LAUREL MUA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ

Contract 2025-06
FY-26 SANITARY SEWER REHABILITATION PROJECT- MILL RUN


