ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS, INC.

2024 & 2025 NJDOT Road Improvement Programs, Cherrix Ave & Washington Ave

BID SUMMARY REPORT TOWNSHIP OF EDGEWATER PARK
BID OPENING: 4/9/2025 at 10 AM 63055 07 & 08
Engineers Estimate Earle Co. Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc. Arawak Paving Co., Inc.
ENVIRONMENTAL 815 East Gate Drive #103 ‘PO Box 556 PO Box 530 7503 Weymouth Road
RESOLUTIONS, INC. Mount Laurel, NJ 08054 Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Hammonton, NJ 08037 Hammonton, NJ 08037
Engiacers « liasers " Scientsts  Surveyoes P: (856) 235-7170 P: (732)-308-1113 x 206 P: (609)-561-4161 x 208 P: (609)-561-4100
NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
Base BID 1#: CHERRIX AVE No Bid Recived
1 Clearing Site 1|LS $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $34,653.23 $34,653.23 $22,774.35 $22,774.35]
2 |Base Repair (If and Where Directed) 940|SY $5.00 $4,700.00| $0.01 $9.40] $0.01 $9.40
3 |8" Full Depth Reclamation 65[SY $27.00 $1,755.00) $34.00 $2,210.00 $32.65 $2,122.25
4 |HMA Milling, 0" - 3" Thick 6300|SY $7.00 $44,100.00] $4.88 $30,744.00] $9.20 $57,960.00
5 |HMA 9.5M64 Surface Course 775|TONS $100.00 $77,500.00 $99.00 $76,725.00 $116.50 $90,287.50
6 |Fabric Joint Sealing (If and Where Directed) 2500|LF $3.00 $7,500.00 $0.01 $25.00 $0.50 $1,250.00
7 |Polymerized Joint Adhesive 2050|LF $3.00 $6,150.00) $0.01 $20.50 $0.01 $20.50
8  |Raised Crosswalk 2|UN $2,500.00 $5,000.00) $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $8,200.00 $16,400.00
9 [6"x9"x18" Concrete Vertical Curb 1832|LF $65.00 $119,080.00 $43.00 $78,776.00 $45.00 $82,440.00]
10 [Monolithic Concrete Curb and Gutter 95|LF $85.00 $8,075.00] $75.00 $7,125.00 $85.00 $8,075.00
11 |Concrete Header Curb (If and Where Directed) S0[LF $50.00 $2,500.00) $30.00 $1,500.00 $45.00 $2,250.00
12 |Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 215|SY $110.00 $23,650.00] $145.00 $31,175.00 $120.00 $25,800.00
13 __|Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If and Where Directed) 25|SY $110.00 $2,750.00) $120.00 $3,000.00 $120.00 $3,000.00
14 |Detectable Warning Surface 16|SY $300.00 $4,800.00 $400.00 $6,400.00 $400.00 $6,400.00
15 |Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick, Reinforced 56|SY $160.00 $8,960.00 $145.00 $8,120.00 $140.00 $7,840.00
16 |Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick, Reinforced (If and Where Directed) 10|Sy $160.00 $1,600.00 $130.00 $1,300.00 $140.00 $1,400.00
17 |Reconstruct Inlet, Type B, Using New Frame & Grate 8|UN $3,000.00 $24,000.00 $1,200.00 $9,600.00 $2,200.00 $17,600.00
18 |Reconstruct Inlet, Type B, Using Existing Frame & Grate 1|UN $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
19 |Inlet Eco Head 9|UN $400.00 $3,600.00) $450.00 $4,050.00 $400.00 $3,600.00
20 |Remove and Replace Manhole Frame & Casting 9[UN $1,200.00 $10,800.00 $750.00 $6,750.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00
21 |Traffic Stripes, Thermoplastic, 8" 475(LF $1.00 $475.00] $1.60 $760.00 $2.00 $950.00
22 |Traffic Stripes, Thermoplastic, 24" 354|LF $5.00 $1,770.00 $5.00 $1,770.00 $5.00 $1,770.00
23 _|Regulatory and Warning Sign 47|UN $250.00 $11,750.00 $100.00 $4,700.00 $250.00 $11,750.00
24 |Tree Removal, Over 24" to 30" Diameter 3|UN $1,500.00 $4,500.00] $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00
25 |Tree Removal, Over 30" to 36" Diameter 1|UN $2,000.00 $2,000.000 $ 3,500.00 $3,500.00] $ 4,500.00 $4,500.00
26 |Tree Removal, Over 36" Diameter 1|UN $2,500.00 $2,500.004 $ 4,000.00 $4,000.00] $ 5,000.00 $5,000.00
27 [Street Tree 5|UN $750.00 $3,750.000 $ 500.00 $2,500.00| $ 500.00 $2,500.00
28 |Fuel Price Adjustment 400(DOL $1.00 $400.00§ $ 1.00 $400.00| $ 1.00 $400.00
29 |Asphalt Price Adjustment 700|DOL $1.00 $700.00] $ 1.00 $700.00| $ 1.00 $700.00
TOTAL BASE BID #1: $406,865.00 $342,513.13 $398,799.00 o Bid Recived
Base BID #2: WASHINGTON AVE
30 [Clearing Site 1|LS $20,000.00 $20,000.00{ $ 24,228.85 $24,228.85| $ 15,703.95 $15,703.95
31 [Base Repair (If and Where Directed) 425|SY $5.00 $2,125.00] $ 0.01 $4.25] $ 0.01 $4.25
32 [8" Full Depth Reclamation 3320|SY $27.00 $89,640.00) $ 34.00 $112,880.00| $ 32.65 $108,398.00
33 [HMA Milling, 0" - 3" Thick 920|SY $7.00 $6,440.00] $ 4.88 $4,489.60] $ 9.20 $8,464.00
34 [HMA 9.5M64 Surface Course 710{TONS $100.00 $71,000.00{ $ 99.00 $70,290.00 $ 116.50 $82,715.00
35 [Fabric Joint Sealing (If and Where Directed) 500(LF $3.00 $1,500.00] $ 0.01 $5.00] $ 0.50 $250.00
36 |Polymerized Joint Adhesive 1480(LF $3.00 $4,440.00| $ 0.01 $14.80] $ 0.01 $14.80
37 [6”x9"x18" Concrete Vertical Curb 1290|LF $65.00 $83,850.00) $ 43.00 $55,470.00| $ 45.00 $58,050.00
38 [Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 14(SY $110.00 $1,540.00] $ 145.00 $2,030.00| $ 120.00 $1,680.00
39 [Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick, Reinforced 45(SY $160.00 $7,200.00| $ 145.00 $6,525.00] $ 140.00 $6,300.00
40 |Reconstruct Inlet, Type B, Open Bottom 2|UN $3,000.00 $6,000.00| $ 7,000.00 $14,000.00| $ 1,000.00 $2,000.00
41 |15" Perforated Corrugated Plastic Pipe 80|LF $120.00 $9,600.00] $ 100.00 $8,000.00| $ 200.00 $16,000.00
42 |Remove and Replace Manhole Frame & Casting 2|UN $1,200.00 $2,400.00] $ 750.00 $1,500.00 $ 1,000.00 $2,000.00
43 | Traffic Stripes, Long-Life Epoxy Resin, 6" 330|LF $1.00 $330.00] $ 6.25 $2,062.50| $ 4.00 $1,320.00
44 |Regulatory and Warning Sign 12[UN $250.00 $3,000.00] $ 100.00 $1,200.00| $ 250.00 $3,000.00
45 |Tree Removal, Over 24" to 30" Diameter 1[UN $1,500.00 $1,500.00] $ 2,400.00 $2,400.00] $ 4,000.00 $4,000.00
46 |Tree Removal, Over 30" to 36" Diameter 1|UN $2,000.00 $2,000.00] $ 3,500.00 $3,500.00] $ 4,500.00 $4,500.00
47 [Street Tree 2|UN $750.00 $1,500.00] $ 500.00 $1,000.00| $ 500.00 $1,000.00
48 |Fuel Price Adjustment 200|DOL $1.00 $200.00) $ 1.00 $200.00| $ 1.00 $200.00
TOTAL BASE BID #2: $314,265.00 $309,800.00 $315,600.00 o Bid Recived
TOTAL BASE BID #1 + TOTAL BASE BID #2: $721,130.00 $652,313.13 $714,399.00 No Bid Recived




ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS, INC.

BID SUMMARY REPORT
BID OPENING: 4/9/2025 at 10 AM

2024 & 2025 NJDOT Road Improvement Programs, Cherrix Ave & Washington Ave

TOWNSHIP OF EDGEWATER PARK
63055 07 & 08

Paving Plus,LLC

Black Rock Enterprises LLC

Command Co., Inc.

ENVIRONMENTAL. EO on 508 1316 Erjglishtown Road 1318 Antwerp Avenue
RESOLUTIONS, INC. Franklinville, NJ 08322 Old Bridge, NJ 08857 Egg Harbor City, NJ 08215
Engineers  Fanners * Seentsts - Surveyors P: (856)-404-9166 P: (732)-967-6400 P: (609)-965-0399
NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT|  UNITPR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
Base BID 1#: CHERRIX AVE No Bid Recived No Bid Recived No Bid Recived No Bid Recived
1 Clearing Site 1|LS
2 |Base Repair (If and Where Directed) 940|SY
3 |8" Full Depth Reclamation 65|SY
4 HMA Milling, 0" - 3" Thick 6300|SY
5 |HMA 9.5M64 Surface Course 775[TONS
6 |Fabric Joint Sealing (If and Where Directed) 2500|LF
7 |Polymerized Joint Adhesive 2050(LF
8 |Raised Crosswalk 2|UN
9 [6”x9"x18" Concrete Vertical Curb 1832|LF
10 |Monolithic Concrete Curb and Gutter 95]|LF
11 |Concrete Header Curb (If and Where Directed) 50|LF
12 [Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 215(sy
13 |Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If and Where Directed) 25|SY
14 |Detectable Warning Surface 16(SY
15 |Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick, Reinforced 56|SY
16 |Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick, Reinforced (If and Where Directed) 10(SY
17 |Reconstruct Inlet, Type B, Using New Frame & Grate 8[UN
18 |Reconstruct Inlet, Type B, Using Existing Frame & Grate 1|UN
19 [Inlet Eco Head 9|UN
20 |Remove and Replace Manhole Frame & Casting 9[UN
21 |Traffic Stripes, Thermoplastic, 8" 475|LF
22 |Traffic Stripes, Thermoplastic, 24" 354 (LF
23 |Regulatory and Warning Sign 47|UN
24 |Tree Removal, Over 24" to 30" Diameter 3|UN
25 |Tree Removal, Over 30" to 36" Diameter 1|UN
26 |Tree Removal, Over 36" Diameter 1[UN
27 [Street Tree 5|UN
28 |Fuel Price Adjustment 400|DOL
29 |Asphalt Price Adjustment 700(DOL
TOTAL BASE BID #1: o Bid Recived o Bid Recived o Bid Recived o Bid Recived
Base BID #2: WASHINGTON AVE
30 |Clearing Site 1|LS
31 [Base Repair (If and Where Directed) 425|SY
32 |8" Full Depth Reclamation 3320|SY
33 |HMA Milling, 0" - 3" Thick 920|SY
34 |HMA 9.5M64 Surface Course 710[TONS
35 |Fabric Joint Sealing (If and Where Directed) 500(LF
36 |Polymerized Joint Adhesive 1480(LF
37 |6"x9"x18" Concrete Vertical Curb 1290(LF
38 |Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 14|SY
39 [Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick, Reinforced 45|SY
40 [Reconstruct Inlet, Type B, Open Bottom 2|UN
41 |15" Perforated Corrugated Plastic Pipe 80|LF
42 |Remove and Replace Manhole Frame & Casting 2|UN
43 |[Traffic Stripes, Long-Life Epoxy Resin, 6" 330|LF
44  |Regulatory and Warning Sign 12|UN
45 [Tree Removal, Over 24" to 30" Diameter 1|UN
46 [Tree Removal, Over 30" to 36" Diameter 1[UN
47 |Street Tree 2|UN
48 |Fuel Price Adjustment 200(DOL
TOTAL BASE BID #2: o Bid Recived o Bid Recived o Bid Recived o Bid Recived
TOTAL BASE BID #1 + TOTAL BASE BID #2: No Bid Recived No Bid Recived No Bid Recived No Bid Recived




