
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS MISCELLANEOUS CONCRETE WORK
SUMMARY OF BIDS CITY OF BURLINGTON

BID OPENING: 02/19/2025 AT 1:30 PM BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

40599 00

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

Base Bid - City Hall, Fire Building, Legion Building, Armory Building, Keegan Rec. Center, Public Works Garage

1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 460.17 SY 117.00$            53,839.89$       135.00$            62,122.95$       140.00$            64,423.80$       150.00$            69,025.50$       

2 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick (If & Where Directed) 66.11 SY 135.00$            8,924.85$         150.00$            9,916.50$         150.00$            9,916.50$         200.00$            13,222.00$       

3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"X18" (If & Where Directed) 261.00 LF 70.00$              18,270.00$       50.00$              13,050.00$       45.00$              11,745.00$       35.00$              9,135.00$         

Alternate Bid #1 - Lyceum Hall

A1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 7.67 SY 117.00$            897.39$            150.00$            1,150.50$         140.00$            1,073.80$         150.00$            1,150.50$         

A2 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick (If & Where Directed) 8.75 SY 135.00$            1,181.25$         165.00$            1,443.75$         150.00$            1,312.50$         200.00$            1,750.00$         

A3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 17.00 LF 60.00$              1,020.00$         50.00$              850.00$            45.00$              765.00$            35.00$              595.00$            

Alternate Bid #2 - Kennedy Park

B1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 25.00 SY 117.00$            2,925.00$         150.00$            3,750.00$         140.00$            3,500.00$         150.00$            3,750.00$         

B2 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick (If & Where Directed) 36.50 SY 135.00$            4,927.50$         165.00$            6,022.50$         150.00$            5,475.00$         200.00$            7,300.00$         

B3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 50.00 LF 60.00$              3,000.00$         40.00$              2,000.00$         45.00$              2,250.00$         35.00$              1,750.00$         

Alternate Bid #3 - Water Plant

C1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 139.00 SY 113.00$            15,707.00$       150.00$            20,850.00$       140.00$            19,460.00$       150.00$            20,850.00$       

Alternate Bid #4 - Quaker School

D1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 36.44 SY 117.00$            4,263.48$         150.00$            5,466.00$         140.00$            5,101.60$         150.00$            5,466.00$         

Alternate Bid #5 - Allen School

E1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 65.33 SY 117.00$            7,643.61$         150.00$            9,799.50$         140.00$            9,146.20$         150.00$            9,799.50$         

E3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 84.00 LF 60.00$              5,040.00$         50.00$              4,200.00$         45.00$              3,780.00$         35.00$              2,940.00$         

indicates mathematically corrected value based on governing unit prices.

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

Trenton, NJ 08638 Medfird, NJ 08055

F: 609-771-6802 F: 609-801-2533

P: 732-213-5892

F: 609-339-2649

P: 609-693-1212

88,533.70$                                    89,236.60$                                    94,878.00$                                    
3,495.50$                                      

Rusling Paving & Capela Construction, Inc. Manny's Concrete

Lacey Township, NJ 08731

P: 609-771-4303 P: 609-535-5367

81,034.74$                                    85,089.45$                                    86,085.30$                                    91,382.50$                                    

Concrete LLC
AJR Masonry LLC

Waretown, NJ 08758
719 Old Shore Road2 Beach Haven Way8 Irven Street 3 Poleridge Park 

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 84,133.38$                                    
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #1 3,098.64$                                      3,444.25$                                      3,151.30$                                      

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1 & 2 94,985.88$                                    100,306.20$                                  100,461.60$                                  107,678.00$                                  
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #2 10,852.50$                                    11,772.50$                                    11,225.00$                                    12,800.00$                                    

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1, 2, & 3 110,692.88$                                  121,156.20$                                  119,921.60$                                  128,528.00$                                  
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #3 15,707.00$                                    20,850.00$                                    19,460.00$                                    20,850.00$                                    

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #4 4,263.48$                                      5,466.00$                                      5,101.60$                                      5,466.00$                                      

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1, 2, 3, 4, & 5 127,639.97$                                  140,621.70$                                  137,949.40$                                  146,733.50$                                  
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #5

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1, 2, 3, & 4 114,956.36$                                  126,622.20$                                  125,023.20$                                  133,994.00$                                  

12,683.61$                                    13,999.50$                                    12,926.20$                                    12,739.50$                                    
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID OPENING: 02/19/2025 AT 1:30 PM

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT

Base Bid - City Hall, Fire Building, Legion Building, Armory Building, Keegan Rec. Center, Public Works Garage

1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 460.17 SY
2 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick (If & Where Directed) 66.11 SY
3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"X18" (If & Where Directed) 261.00 LF

Alternate Bid #1 - Lyceum Hall

A1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 7.67 SY
A2 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick (If & Where Directed) 8.75 SY
A3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 17.00 LF

Alternate Bid #2 - Kennedy Park

B1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 25.00 SY
B2 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick (If & Where Directed) 36.50 SY
B3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 50.00 LF

Alternate Bid #3 - Water Plant

C1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 139.00 SY

Alternate Bid #4 - Quaker School

D1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 36.44 SY

Alternate Bid #5 - Allen School

E1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 65.33 SY
E3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 84.00 LF

indicates mathematically corrected value based on governing unit prices.

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #1

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1 & 2
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #2

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1, 2, & 3
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #3

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #4

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1, 2, 3, 4, & 5
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #5

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1, 2, 3, & 4

MISCELLANEOUS CONCRETE WORK
CITY OF BURLINGTON

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

40599 00

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

147.00$            67,644.99$       175.00$            80,529.75$       188.00$            86,511.96$       230.45$            106,046.18$     

147.00$            9,718.17$         200.00$            13,222.00$       332.00$            21,948.52$       216.55$            14,316.12$       

57.00$              14,877.00$       55.00$              14,355.00$       67.00$              17,487.00$       69.30$              18,087.30$       

147.00$            1,127.49$         175.00$            1,342.25$         219.00$            1,679.73$         338.98$            2,599.98$         

147.00$            1,286.25$         200.00$            1,750.00$         414.00$            3,622.50$         417.14$            3,649.98$         

57.00$              969.00$            55.00$              935.00$            103.00$            1,751.00$         52.94$              899.98$            

147.00$            3,675.00$         175.00$            4,375.00$         189.00$            4,725.00$         250.00$            6,250.00$         

147.00$            5,365.50$         200.00$            7,300.00$         368.00$            13,432.00$       223.28$            8,149.72$         

57.00$              2,850.00$         55.00$              2,750.00$         77.00$              3,850.00$         62.00$              3,100.00$         

147.00$            20,433.00$       175.00$            24,325.00$       206.00$            28,634.00$       178.27$            24,779.53$       

147.00$            5,356.68$         175.00$            6,377.00$         223.00$            8,126.12$         318.68$            11,612.70$       

147.00$            9,603.51$         175.00$            11,432.75$       192.00$            12,543.36$       212.00$            13,849.96$       

57.00$              4,788.00$         55.00$              4,620.00$         75.00$              6,300.00$         58.33$              4,899.72$         

125,947.48$                                  138,449.60$                                  92,240.16$                                    108,106.75$                                  

95,622.90$                                    112,134.00$                                  133,000.71$                                  145,599.53$                                  
3,382.74$                                      4,027.25$                                      7,053.23$                                      7,149.93$                                      

F: 856-832-4681

P: 856-832-4680 P: 609-968-3445

F: 732-984-7454

P: 732-984-7464 P: 732-807-3158

F: 732-807-3159

Adhzeen Design, Inc.

Bradley Beach, NJ 07720

Pioneer General Think Pavers GC Concrete

PO Box 67 125 Kings Highway 505 New Road, Suite 6
Marlboro, NJ 07746 Mt. Royal, NJ 08061 Somers Point, NJ 08244

Contracting Co., Inc. Hardscaping, LLC

34 School Road E.

11,890.50$                                    14,425.00$                                    22,007.00$                                    17,499.72$                                    
107,513.40$                                  126,559.00$                                  155,007.71$                                  163,099.25$                                  

20,433.00$                                    24,325.00$                                    28,634.00$                                    24,779.53$                                    
127,946.40$                                  150,884.00$                                  183,641.71$                                  187,878.78$                                  

157,261.00$                                  191,767.83$                                  199,491.48$                                  
5,356.68$                                      6,377.00$                                      8,126.12$                                      11,612.70$                                    

218,241.16$                                  147,694.59$                                  173,313.75$                                  210,611.19$                                  
14,391.51$                                    16,052.75$                                    18,843.36$                                    18,749.68$                                    

133,303.08$                                  
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID OPENING: 02/19/2025 AT 1:30 PM

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT

Base Bid - City Hall, Fire Building, Legion Building, Armory Building, Keegan Rec. Center, Public Works Garage

1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 460.17 SY
2 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick (If & Where Directed) 66.11 SY
3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"X18" (If & Where Directed) 261.00 LF

Alternate Bid #1 - Lyceum Hall

A1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 7.67 SY
A2 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick (If & Where Directed) 8.75 SY
A3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 17.00 LF

Alternate Bid #2 - Kennedy Park

B1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 25.00 SY
B2 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick (If & Where Directed) 36.50 SY
B3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 50.00 LF

Alternate Bid #3 - Water Plant

C1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 139.00 SY

Alternate Bid #4 - Quaker School

D1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 36.44 SY

Alternate Bid #5 - Allen School

E1 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 65.33 SY
E3 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 84.00 LF

indicates mathematically corrected value based on governing unit prices.

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #1

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1 & 2
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #2

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1, 2, & 3
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #3

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #4

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1, 2, 3, 4, & 5
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #5

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. 1, 2, 3, & 4

MISCELLANEOUS CONCRETE WORK
CITY OF BURLINGTON

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

40599 00

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

198.00$            91,113.66$       246.00$            113,201.82$     

225.00$            14,874.75$       330.00$            21,816.30$       

125.00$            32,625.00$       144.00$            37,584.00$       

198.00$            1,518.66$         620.00$            4,755.40$         

225.00$            1,968.75$         544.00$            4,760.00$         

125.00$            2,125.00$         300.00$            5,100.00$         

198.00$            4,950.00$         370.00$            9,250.00$         

225.00$            8,212.50$         275.00$            10,037.50$       

125.00$            6,250.00$         146.00$            7,300.00$         

198.00$            27,522.00$       215.00$            29,885.00$       

198.00$            7,215.12$         311.00$            11,332.84$       

198.00$            12,935.34$       233.00$            15,221.89$       

125.00$            10,500.00$       130.00$            10,920.00$       

23,435.34$                                    26,141.89$                                    
221,810.78$                                  281,164.75$                                  NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

7,215.12$                                      11,332.84$                                    
198,375.44$                                  255,022.86$                                  NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

27,522.00$                                    29,885.00$                                    
191,160.32$                                  243,690.02$                                  NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

19,412.50$                                    26,587.50$                                    
163,638.32$                                  213,805.02$                                  NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

5,612.41$                                      14,615.40$                                    
144,225.82$                                  187,217.52$                                  NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

F: 732-262-7798 F: 609-840-6071 F: 609-698-2422 F: 1-866-570-8187

138,613.41$                                  172,602.12$                                  NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

Suite 12C Williamstown, NJ 08094 Little Egg Harbor Twp, NJ 08087 Cincinatti, Ohio 45209
Brick, NJ 08723
P: 732-262-7449 P: 609-653-0133 P: 609-698-2122 P: 800-364-2059

Diamond Construction Ocean Construction, LLC Crest Construction Group Construction Information
Systems, CIS Leads

35 Beaverson Boulevard 822 Glassboro Road 880 Route 9 North 3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700
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