ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

CCTYV OF VARIOUS SANITARY SEWER STRUCTURES

SUMMARY OF BIDS WILLINGBORO MUA
WILLINGBORO TOWNSHIP, BURLINGTON COUNTY
Bid Opening 7/29/2025 @ 10:30 AM 64902 00
Mobile Dredging & American Pipe Copperhead Custom GE Mechanical
Video Pipe Services, LLC Cleaning, LLC. Environmental Services
1566 Harding Highway || 122 State Highway 34 |[ 3017 Veterans Highway [| 2316 South Main Road

[Newfield, NJ 08344-5220
P: 856-697-1900

gstevenson@mdvpinc.com

Farmingdale, NJ 07727
P: 732-751-0006

ed@americanpipecleaningllc.com

Bristol, PA 19007
P: 215-752-0770

Rob@copperheadcustom.com

Vineland, NJ 08360
P:856-691-4371x46

jrumsey@gemechanical.com

NO | DESCRIPTION RTY UNIT|| UNIT PR. | AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT
Televising at 2 Touraine Court,
1 e 1|LS $2,600.00( $2,600.00
omplete
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE
Al Televising at 36 Tweestone Lane, s $3.600.00| $3.600.00
Complete
A2 Televising at Tempest Lane, s $1.800.00| $1.800.00
Complete
A3 Televising at Twin Hill Drive, s $1.300.00| $1.300.00
Complete
A4 Televising at Thornleigh Place, 1lLs $1.300.00| $1,300.00
Complete
A5 |Televising at Toledo Lane, Complete | 1|LS $1,300.00| $1,300.00
A6 Televisiing at 21 Shelbourne Lane, 1lLs $1.800.00| $1.800.00
Complete
A7 Televising at 64 Sheffield Drive, s $1.300.00| $1.300.00
Complete
AR Televising at 84 Sheffield Drive, 1lLs $1.300.00| $1,300.00
Complete
A9 |Televising at Elk Pass, Complete 1|LS $2,600.00| $2,600.00
A10(Televising at Empire Lane, Complete | 1|LS $3,850.00( $3,850.00
All Televising at 77 Edgemont Lane, s $5.200.00| $5.200.00
Complete
Al2 Televising at Rittenhouse Court, 1lLs $2.100.00| $2.100.00
Complete
A13|Televising at Radnor Court, 1|Ls $5,110.00| $5,110.00
Complete
Ald Televising at Raeburn Court, 1lLs $3.837.00| $3.837.00
Complete




AlS Televising at Randolph Place, LS $3.400.00| $3.400.00
Complete

Al6 Televising at Ruscombe Court, LS $5.200.00| $5.200.00
Complete

Al7 Televising at 49 Ironside Court, LS $2.600.00| $2.600.00
Complete

AlS Televising at Gramercy Lane, LS $7.700.00| $7.700.00
Complete

A19 Televising at 26 Garner Lane, LS $10.232.00] $10,232.00
Complete

A20 Televising at 20 Glenview Lane, LS $5.116.00| $5.116.00
Complete

A2l Televising at 50 Gardenbrook Lane, LS $3.581.00| $3.581.00
Complete

A2 Televising at Newport Lane, LS $5.755.00| $5.755.00
Complete

A23 Televising at Pennypacker Drive, LS $4.092.00| $4.092.00
Complete

A24 Televising at Pennypacker Drive, LS $5.116.00| $5.116.00
Complete

A25 Televising at 80 Pheasant Lane, LS $2.558.00| $2.558.00
Complete

A26 Televising at 20 Parson Lane, LS $4.100.00| $4.100.00
Complete

Ag7|Televising at Harmon Lane, LS | $10,232.00[$10,232.00
Complete

A28 Televising at Hazelwood Circle, LS $5.116.00| $5.116.00
Complete

A29(Televising at Harper Lane, Complete LS $5,116.00| $5,116.00

A30(Televising at Surrey Lane, Complete LS $1,700.00( $1,700.00

A31|Televising at Sunset Road, Complete LS $3,300.00| $3,300.00

A2 Televising at Sharpless Boulevard, LS $7.674.00| $7.674.00
Complete

A33 Televising at 11 Miniature Lane, LS $5.116.00| $5.116.00
Complete

A34 Televising at Middlebury Lane, LS $3.581.00| $3.581.00
Complete

A35 Televising at 2 Budhollow Lane, LS $2.558.00| $2.558.00
Complete

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE + ALTERNATES $142,840.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID




ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 7/29/2025 @ 10:30 AM

CCTYV OF VARIOUS SANITARY SEWER STRUCTURES
WILLINGBORO MUA
WILLINGBORO TOWNSHIP, BURLINGTON COUNTY
64902 00

Montana Construction

Vortex Services, LLC.

80 Constand Avenue
Lodi, NJ 07644
P: 973-478-5200

enny@montanaconstructioninc.co

210 Bennet Road
Freehold, NJ 07728
P: 732-625-9300

courtney@votexcompanies.com

NO | DESCRIPTION RTY UNIT|| UNIT PR. | AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT
Televising at 2 Touraine Court,
1 C 1|LS
omplete
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE
Al Televising at 36 Tweestone Lane, s
Complete
A2 Televising at Tempest Lane, s
Complete
A3 Televising at Twin Hill Drive, s
Complete
A4 Televising at Thornleigh Place, 1lLs
Complete
AS |Televising at Toldeo Lane, Complete | 1|LS
A6 Televisiing at 21 Shelbourne Lane, 1lLs
Complete
A7 Televising at 64 Sheffield Drive, s
Complete
AR Televising at 84 Sheffield Drive, 1lLs
Complete
A9 |Televising at Elk Pass, Complete 1|LS
A10(Televising at Empire Lane, Complete | 1|LS
All Televising at 77 Edgemont Lane, s
Complete
Al2 Televising at Rittenhouse Court, 1lLs
Complete
Al3 Televising at Radnor Court, s
Complete
Ald Televising at Raeburn Court, 1lLs
Complete




Televising at Randolph Place,

AlS Complete LS

Al6 Televising at Ruscombe Court, LS
Complete

Al7 Televising at 49 Ironside Court, LS
Complete

AlS Televising at Gramercy Lane, LS
Complete

A19 Televising at 26 Garner Lane, LS
Complete

A20 Televising at 20 Glenview Lane, LS
Complete

A2l Televising at 50 Gardenbrook Lane, LS
Complete

A2 Televising at Newport Lane, LS
Complete

A23 Televising at Pennypacker Drive, LS
Complete

A24 Televising at Pennypacker Drive, LS
Complete

A25 Televising at 80 Pheasant Lane, LS
Complete

A26 Televising at 20 Parson Lane, LS
Complete

A27 Televising at Harmon Lane, LS
Complete

A28 Televising at Hazelwood Circle, LS
Complete

A29(Televising at Harper Lane, Complete LS

A30(Televising at Surrey Lane, Complete LS

A31(Televising at Sunset Road, Complete LS

A2 Televising at Sharpless Boulevard, LS
Complete

A33 Televising at 11 Miniature Lane, LS
Complete

A34 Televising at Middlebury Lane, LS
Complete

A35 Televising at 2 Budhollow Lane, LS

Complete

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE + ALTERNATES

NO BID

NO BID




