
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS 2023 ROAD PROGRAM
SUMMARY OF BIDS CITY OF BEVERLY

BID OPENING: 04/16/2025 AT 11:00 AM BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

41102 00

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
BASE BID: JENNINGS STREET - ELIZABETH STREET TO CHURCH STREET

1 HMA Milling, 4" 1170.0 SY 18.00$           21,060.00$    15.00$           17,550.00$    

2 Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 180.0 TON 125.00$         22,500.00$    125.00$         22,500.00$    

3 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 1.5" Thick 110.0 TON 164.00$         18,040.00$    170.00$         18,700.00$    

4 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 100.0 SY 0.01$             1.00$             0.01$             1.00$             

5 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 26.0 SY 135.00$         3,510.00$      135.00$         3,510.00$      

6 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick 50.0 SY 165.00$         8,250.00$      165.00$         8,250.00$      

7 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 800.0 LF 35.00$           28,000.00$    40.00$           32,000.00$    

8 Traffic Markings Lines, 24" 15.0 LF 50.00$           750.00$         20.00$           300.00$         

9 Curb Painting 125.0 LF 1.50$             187.50$         1.60$             200.00$         

10 Regulatory and Warning Sign 3.0 UN 250.00$         750.00$         275.00$         825.00$         

11 Tree Removal, Over 6" to 12" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UN 489.63$         489.63$         1,000.00$      1,000.00$      

12 Tree Removal, Over 12" to 18" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 3.0 UN 1,000.00$      3,000.00$      1,200.00$      3,600.00$      

13 Tree Removal, Over 18" to 24" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN 2,000.00$      4,000.00$      1,500.00$      3,000.00$      

14 Remove Shrub 2.0 UN 350.00$         700.00$         0.01$             0.02$             

15 Large Deciduous Tree, 2-2 1/2" Caliper (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN 600.00$         1,200.00$      1,200.00$      2,400.00$      

16 Topsoil and Seed, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 5.0 SY 95.00$           475.00$         0.01$             0.05$             

17 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL 100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         

18 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL 100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         

ALTERNATE BID #1: PERKINS ROAD - JENNINGS STREET TO PARKER STREET

A1 HMA Milling, 4" 510.0 SY 10.00$           5,100.00$      15.00$           7,650.00$      

A2 Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 80.0 TON 90.00$           7,200.00$      125.00$         10,000.00$    

A3 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 1.5" Thick 50.0 TON 100.00$         5,000.00$      170.00$         8,500.00$      

A4 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 250.0 SY 0.01$             2.50$             0.01$             2.50$             

A5 Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 4" Thick 100.0 SY 70.00$           7,000.00$      80.00$           8,000.00$      

A6 Stone Driveway, 4" Thick 30.0 SY 60.00$           1,800.00$      50.00$           1,500.00$      

A7 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 40.0 SY 150.00$         6,000.00$      135.00$         5,400.00$      

A8 Monolithic Concrete Curb and Gutter 90.0 LF 65.00$           5,850.00$      65.00$           5,850.00$      

A9 Inlet, Type A 3.0 UN 5,000.00$      15,000.00$    3,500.00$      10,500.00$    

A10 Reconstructed Inlet, Type A, Using Existing Casting 2.0 UN 1,500.00$      3,000.00$      2,500.00$      5,000.00$      

A11 Reconstructed Manhole, Using Existing Casting 1.0 UN 1,585.00$      1,585.00$      2,800.00$      2,800.00$      

A12 Bicycle Safe Grate 2.0 UN 500.00$         1,000.00$      325.00$         650.00$         

A13 Construct 12" DIP 30.0 LF 350.00$         10,500.00$    225.00$         6,750.00$      

A14 Construct 12" PCPP 85.0 LF 160.00$         13,600.00$    140.00$         11,900.00$    

A15 Grout Existing Pipe 1.3 CY 1,250.00$      1,562.50$      3,000.00$      3,750.00$      

A16 Traffic Markings, Symbols 5.0 SF 11.00$           55.00$           10.85$           54.25$           

A17 Curb Painting 30.0 LF 1.50$             45.00$           1.65$             49.50$           

A18 Regulatory and Warning Sign 2.0 UN 250.00$         500.00$         275.00$         550.00$         

A19 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL 100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         

A20 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL 100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         

ALTERNATE BID #2: CHURCH STREET - JENNINGS STREET TO PARKER STREET

B1 HMA Milling, 4" 875.0 SY 7.00$             6,125.00$      15.00$           13,125.00$    

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Dorothy, NJ 08317

F: 732-308-1034 F: 609-909-1647 F: 609-567-4750

P: 609-561-4100

Hammonton, NJ 08037

F: 856-728-2895

P: 856-404-9166

Paving Plus, LLC

PO Box 4647503 Weymouth RoadPO Box 556 82 Tuckahoe Road

203,142.32$                            NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

Earle Co. Landberg Construction, Arawak Paving Co., Inc.

Glassboro, NJ 08028

P: 732-308-1113 P: 609-829-2131

113,113.13$                            114,036.07$                            NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

LLC

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 198,113.13$                            
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #1 85,000.00$                              89,106.25$                              



ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS 2023 ROAD PROGRAM
SUMMARY OF BIDS CITY OF BEVERLY

BID OPENING: 04/16/2025 AT 11:00 AM BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

41102 00

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Dorothy, NJ 08317

F: 732-308-1034 F: 609-909-1647 F: 609-567-4750

P: 609-561-4100

Hammonton, NJ 08037

F: 856-728-2895

P: 856-404-9166

Paving Plus, LLC

PO Box 4647503 Weymouth RoadPO Box 556 82 Tuckahoe Road

Earle Co. Landberg Construction, Arawak Paving Co., Inc.

Glassboro, NJ 08028

P: 732-308-1113 P: 609-829-2131

LLC

B2 Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 135.0 TON 150.00$         20,250.00$    125.00$         16,875.00$    

B3 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 1.5" Thick 82.0 TON 180.00$         14,760.00$    170.00$         13,940.00$    

B4 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 50.0 SY 0.01$             0.50$             0.01$             0.50$             

B5 Traffic Markings Lines, 6" 160.0 LF 4.00$             640.00$         3.50$             560.00$         

B6 Traffic Markings Lines, 24" 75.0 LF 15.00$           1,125.00$      59.00$           4,425.00$      

B7 Curb Painting 220.0 LF 1.50$             330.00$         1.60$             352.00$         

B8 Regulatory and Warning Sign 1.0 UN 250.00$         250.00$         275.00$         275.00$         

B9 Tree Removal, 6" Diameter and Under (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN 259.75$         519.50$         1,100.00$      2,200.00$      

B10 Tree Removal, Over 6" to 12" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN 500.00$         1,000.00$      1,200.00$      2,400.00$      

B11 Tree Removal, Over 12" to 18" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN 1,000.00$      2,000.00$      1,500.00$      3,000.00$      

B12 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL 100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         

B13 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL 100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         

ALTERNATE BID #3: PARKER STREET - CHURCH STREET TO PARKER STREET

C1 HMA Milling, 4" 430.0 SY 5.00$             2,150.00$      15.00$           6,450.00$      

C2 Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 68.0 TON 85.00$           5,780.00$      125.00$         8,500.00$      

C3 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 1.5" Thick 42.0 TON 90.00$           3,780.00$      170.00$         7,140.00$      

C4 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 50.0 SY 0.01$             0.50$             0.01$             0.50$             

C5 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 207.0 LF 40.00$           8,280.00$      36.00$           7,452.00$      

C6 Reset Granite Curb 86.0 LF 50.00$           4,300.00$      36.00$           3,096.00$      

C7 Traffic Markings Lines, 24" 14.0 LF 9.25$             129.50$         59.00$           826.00$         

C8 Curb Painting 80.0 LF 1.00$             80.00$           1.60$             128.00$         

C9 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL 100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         

C10 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL 100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 & #2 & #3 270,013.13$                            294,287.32$                            NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #3 24,700.00$                              33,792.50$                              

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 & #2 245,313.13$                            260,494.82$                            NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #2 47,200.00$                              57,352.50$                              



ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID OPENING: 04/16/2025 AT 11:00 AM

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT
BASE BID: JENNINGS STREET - ELIZABETH STREET TO CHURCH STREET

1 HMA Milling, 4" 1170.0 SY

2 Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 180.0 TON

3 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 1.5" Thick 110.0 TON

4 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 100.0 SY

5 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 26.0 SY

6 Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick 50.0 SY

7 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 800.0 LF

8 Traffic Markings Lines, 24" 15.0 LF

9 Curb Painting 125.0 LF

10 Regulatory and Warning Sign 3.0 UN

11 Tree Removal, Over 6" to 12" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UN

12 Tree Removal, Over 12" to 18" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 3.0 UN

13 Tree Removal, Over 18" to 24" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN

14 Remove Shrub 2.0 UN

15 Large Deciduous Tree, 2-2 1/2" Caliper (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN

16 Topsoil and Seed, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 5.0 SY

17 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL

18 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL

ALTERNATE BID #1: PERKINS ROAD - JENNINGS STREET TO PARKER STREET

A1 HMA Milling, 4" 510.0 SY

A2 Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 80.0 TON

A3 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 1.5" Thick 50.0 TON

A4 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 250.0 SY

A5 Hot Mix Asphalt Driveway, 4" Thick 100.0 SY

A6 Stone Driveway, 4" Thick 30.0 SY

A7 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 40.0 SY

A8 Monolithic Concrete Curb and Gutter 90.0 LF

A9 Inlet, Type A 3.0 UN

A10 Reconstructed Inlet, Type A, Using Existing Casting 2.0 UN

A11 Reconstructed Manhole, Using Existing Casting 1.0 UN

A12 Bicycle Safe Grate 2.0 UN

A13 Construct 12" DIP 30.0 LF

A14 Construct 12" PCPP 85.0 LF

A15 Grout Existing Pipe 1.3 CY

A16 Traffic Markings, Symbols 5.0 SF

A17 Curb Painting 30.0 LF

A18 Regulatory and Warning Sign 2.0 UN

A19 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL

A20 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL

ALTERNATE BID #2: CHURCH STREET - JENNINGS STREET TO PARKER STREET

B1 HMA Milling, 4" 875.0 SY

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #1

2023 ROAD PROGRAM
CITY OF BEVERLY

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

41102 00

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

F: 856-832-4681

P: 856-832-4680 P: 800-364-2059

F: 1-866-570-8187

Think Pavers 

Cincinatti, Ohio 45209

Construct Connect

3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700

Mt. Royal, NJ 08061
125 Kings Highway

Hardscaping, LLC



ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID OPENING: 04/16/2025 AT 11:00 AM

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT
B2 Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 135.0 TON

B3 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 1.5" Thick 82.0 TON

B4 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 50.0 SY

B5 Traffic Markings Lines, 6" 160.0 LF

B6 Traffic Markings Lines, 24" 75.0 LF

B7 Curb Painting 220.0 LF

B8 Regulatory and Warning Sign 1.0 UN

B9 Tree Removal, 6" Diameter and Under (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN

B10 Tree Removal, Over 6" to 12" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN

B11 Tree Removal, Over 12" to 18" Diameter (If & Where Directed) 2.0 UN

B12 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL

B13 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL

ALTERNATE BID #3: PARKER STREET - CHURCH STREET TO PARKER STREET

C1 HMA Milling, 4" 430.0 SY

C2 Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course, 2.5" Thick 68.0 TON

C3 Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 1.5" Thick 42.0 TON

C4 Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 50.0 SY

C5 Concrete Vertical Curb, 6"x8"x18" 207.0 LF

C6 Reset Granite Curb 86.0 LF

C7 Traffic Markings Lines, 24" 14.0 LF

C8 Curb Painting 80.0 LF

C9 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL

C10 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.00 DOL

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 & #2 & #3
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #3

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 & #2
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #2

2023 ROAD PROGRAM
CITY OF BEVERLY

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

41102 00

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
F: 856-832-4681

P: 856-832-4680 P: 800-364-2059

F: 1-866-570-8187

Think Pavers 

Cincinatti, Ohio 45209

Construct Connect

3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700

Mt. Royal, NJ 08061
125 Kings Highway

Hardscaping, LLC

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED


