
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

BASE BID

1 Excavation & Site Grading 1 LS $14,526.00 $14,526.00 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $109,300.00 $109,300.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

2 Electric Service to Electric Panel, Complete 1 LS $11,985.00 $11,985.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $21,100.00 $21,100.00 $18,950.00 $18,950.00

3 Electric Service to Pavilion, Complete 1 LS $2,963.00 $2,963.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00

4 Pavilion Floodlight & Pavilion Receptacle 1 LS $3,450.00 $3,450.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,035.00 $1,035.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

5 Post Top Light with Duplex Receptacle 3 UN $10,307.34 $30,922.02 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $8,900.00 $26,700.00 $11,800.00 $35,400.00

6
Post Top Light with Duplex Receptacle & Junction Box for 

Camera
4 UN $9,993.50 $39,974.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00 $11,500.00 $46,000.00 $11,900.00 $47,600.00

7 Relocate Yard Drain 2 UN $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $725.00 $1,450.00 $40,000.00 $80,000.00

8 Install  NewYard Drain 3 UN $1,400.00 $4,200.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00 $27,000.00 $81,000.00

9 Install PVC, 6" Diameter 106 LF $43.00 $4,558.00 $15.00 $1,590.00* $56.00 $5,936.00 $50.00 $5,300.00

10 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 330 SY $172.19 $56,822.70 $125.00 $41,250.00 $120.00 $39,600.00 $80.00 $26,400.00

11 Concrete Stairs and Handrails, Complete 1 LS $18,700.00 $18,700.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

12 Decorative Pavers on 4" Concrete Base 616 SF $28.60 $17,617.60 $20.00 $12,320.00 $40.00 $24,640.00 $20.00 $12,320.00

13 Decorative Black Aluminum Picket Rail on Seawall 1 LS $73,700.00 $73,700.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $103,000.00 $103,000.00

14 Interprative Educational Sign 2 UN $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00

15 Dedication Plaque 2 UN $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $800.00 $1,600.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00

16 No Fishing Sign - Rail Mount 4 UN $40.00 $160.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $200.00 $800.00 $1,200.00 $4,800.00

17 Park Rules Sign 2 UN $105.00 $210.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $1,400.00 $2,800.00

18 Bulletin Board 1 UN $1,680.00 $1,680.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00

19 Bench 6' 9 UN $2,108.23 $18,974.07* $2,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,600.00 $23,400.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00

20 Picnic Table - 8' Accessible 2 UN $3,650.00 $7,300.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00* $6,700.00 $13,400.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00

21 Round Bistro Table - 3' Accessible 1 UN $3,708.00 $3,708.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

22 Bike Rack 2 UN $680.00 $1,360.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $500.00 $1,000.00

23 Litter Receptacle 2 UN $2,050.00 $4,100.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,300.00 $4,600.00 $500.00 $1,000.00

24 Recycle Receptacle 2 UN $2,050.00 $4,100.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00

25 Library Box Relocation 1 UN $600.00 $600.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $770.00 $770.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

26 Pet Waste Station 2 UN $900.00 $1,800.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $500.00 $1,000.00

27 Sod 7750 SF $1.02 $7,905.00* $2.50 $19,375.00 $3.00 $23,250.00 $0.50 $3,875.00

28 Lawn Seeding 13500 SF $0.33 $4,455.00 $0.50 $6,750.00 $0.30 $4,050.00 $0.20 $2,700.00

29 Deciduous Trees 1 LS $1,590.00 $1,590.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

30 Shrubs, Perennials & Groundcover 1 LS $9,972.00 $9,972.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $37,000.00 $37,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

31 Water Service for Irrigation 1 LS $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

32 Irrigation System with Smart Controller 1 LS $26,420.00 $26,420.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE

* Denotes Mathematically Corrected Value

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

Bid Opening 03/12/2025 @ 11:00 AM 39003 03

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC. HISTORIC WATERFRONT PARK

SUMMARY OF BIDS TOWNSHIP OF DELANCO

Landscaping

Lawn & Garden Capela Construction, Inc. Command Co., Inc. Think Pavers, LLC

3340 S. Lincoln Ave. 3 Poleridge Park 1318 Antwerp Ave. 125 Kings Highway

Vineland, NJ 08361 Medford, NJ 08055 Egg Harbor City, NJ 08215 Mt. Royal, NJ 08061

P: (856) 691-3129 P: (609) 535-5367 P: (609) 965-0399 P: (856) 832-4680

F: (856) 691-0511 F: (609) 801-2533 F: (609) 965-0441 F: (856) 832-4681 

$384,452.39* $442,285.00* $610,231.00 $623,545.00



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

1 Excavation & Site Grading 1 LS

2 Electric Service to Electric Panel, Complete 1 LS

3 Electric Service to Pavilion, Complete 1 LS

4 Pavilion Floodlight & Pavilion Receptacle 1 LS

5 Post Top Light with Duplex Receptacle 3 UN

6
Post Top Light with Duplex Receptacle & Junction Box for 

Camera
4 UN

7 Relocate Yard Drain 2 UN

8 Install  NewYard Drain 3 UN

9 Install PVC, 6" Diameter 106 LF

10 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 330 SY

11 Concrete Stairs and Handrails, Complete 1 LS

12 Decorative Pavers on 4" Concrete Base 616 SF

13 Decorative Black Aluminum Picket Rail on Seawall 1 LS

14 Interprative Educational Sign 2 UN

15 Dedication Plaque 2 UN

16 No Fishing Sign - Rail Mount 4 UN

17 Park Rules Sign 2 UN

18 Bulletin Board 1 UN

19 Bench 6' 9 UN

20 Picnic Table - 8' Accessible 2 UN

21 Round Bistro Table - 3' Accessible 1 UN

22 Bike Rack 2 UN

23 Litter Receptacle 2 UN

24 Recycle Receptacle 2 UN

25 Library Box Relocation 1 UN

26 Pet Waste Station 2 UN

27 Sod 7750 SF

28 Lawn Seeding 13500 SF

29 Deciduous Trees 1 LS

30 Shrubs, Perennials & Groundcover 1 LS

31 Water Service for Irrigation 1 LS

32 Irrigation System with Smart Controller 1 LS

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE

* Denotes Mathematically Corrected Value

Bid Opening 03/12/2025 @ 11:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

$110,000.00 $110,000.00

$11,000.00 $11,000.00

$6,000.00 $6,000.00

$5,000.00 $5,000.00

$15,000.00 $45,000.00

$15,200.00 $60,800.00

$2,000.00 $4,000.00

$1,200.00 $3,600.00

$30.00 $3,180.00

$310.00 $102,300.00

$14,000.00 $14,000.00

$14.00 $8,624.00

$185,000.00 $185,000.00

$1,000.00 $2,000.00

$1,000.00 $2,000.00

$1,000.00 $4,000.00

$1,000.00 $2,000.00

$1,100.00 $1,100.00

$1,500.00 $13,500.00

$5,000.00 $10,000.00*

$2,100.00 $2,100.00

$2,100.00 $4,200.00

$2,000.00 $4,000.00

$2,000.00 $4,000.00

$2,000.00 $2,000.00

$1,100.00 $2,200.00

$3.10 $24,025.00

$1.50 $20,250.00

$5,000.00 $5,000.00

$90,000.00 $90,000.00

$10,000.00 $10,000.00

$32,000.00 $32,000.00

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

39003 03

HISTORIC WATERFRONT PARK

TOWNSHIP OF DELANCO

Contractors, Inc.

Bott Electrical C. Stevenson & Son Caruso LandscapeGlobal Construction

Contractor, Inc. Contractors

1517 East State Street 3111 Route 38, Suite 11-188 950 Mt. Holly Road 775 Mountain Blvd.

Trenton, NJ 08609

Watchung, NJ 07069

Mount Laurel, NJ 08054 Edgewater Park, NJ 08010 Suite 105

P: (609) 815-1300 P: (609) 257-3517 P: (609) 871-1666

F: (609) 584-5500 F: N/A 

P: (908) 756-3300

$792,879.00*

F: N/A F: (908) 756-3303

NO BID NO BID NO BID



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

1 Excavation & Site Grading 1 LS

2 Electric Service to Electric Panel, Complete 1 LS

3 Electric Service to Pavilion, Complete 1 LS

4 Pavilion Floodlight & Pavilion Receptacle 1 LS

5 Post Top Light with Duplex Receptacle 3 UN

6
Post Top Light with Duplex Receptacle & Junction Box for 

Camera
4 UN

7 Relocate Yard Drain 2 UN

8 Install  NewYard Drain 3 UN

9 Install PVC, 6" Diameter 106 LF

10 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 330 SY

11 Concrete Stairs and Handrails, Complete 1 LS

12 Decorative Pavers on 4" Concrete Base 616 SF

13 Decorative Black Aluminum Picket Rail on Seawall 1 LS

14 Interprative Educational Sign 2 UN

15 Dedication Plaque 2 UN

16 No Fishing Sign - Rail Mount 4 UN

17 Park Rules Sign 2 UN

18 Bulletin Board 1 UN

19 Bench 6' 9 UN

20 Picnic Table - 8' Accessible 2 UN

21 Round Bistro Table - 3' Accessible 1 UN

22 Bike Rack 2 UN

23 Litter Receptacle 2 UN

24 Recycle Receptacle 2 UN

25 Library Box Relocation 1 UN

26 Pet Waste Station 2 UN

27 Sod 7750 SF

28 Lawn Seeding 13500 SF

29 Deciduous Trees 1 LS

30 Shrubs, Perennials & Groundcover 1 LS

31 Water Service for Irrigation 1 LS

32 Irrigation System with Smart Controller 1 LS

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE

* Denotes Mathematically Corrected Value

Bid Opening 03/12/2025 @ 11:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

39003 03

HISTORIC WATERFRONT PARK

TOWNSHIP OF DELANCO

Scalfo Electric, Inc.Coastline Excavating & Construct Connect Pioneer General

Site Services, LLC. Contracting Co., Inc.

37 Indian Trail 3825 Edwards Road PO Box 67 3539 N. Mill Road

Vineland, NJ 08360

Cincinnati, OH 45209

Southampton, NJ 08088 Suite #700 Bradley Beach, NJ 07720

P: (856) 986-8363 P: (800) 364-2059 P: (732) 807-3158 P: (856) 692-5196

F: N/A F: (866) 570-8187 F: (732) 807-3159 F: (856) 692-0660

NO BIDNO BID NO BID NO BID


