
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS 2024 ROAD PROGRAM
SUMMARY OF BIDS TOWNSHIP OF EASTAMPTON

BID OPENING: 03/11/2025 AT 11:00 AM BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

43035 24

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

NJDOT MA - Base Bid: Kensington Drive - Knightsbridge Rd To Kensington Dr

1 HMA Milling, 2.5" 17500.0 SY 4.00$             70,000.00$    10.00$           175,000.00$  7.90$             138,250.00$  8.60$             150,500.00$  
2 Mastic One-Crafco (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 1750.0 LF 3.00$             5,250.00$      4.00$             7,000.00$      3.00$             5,250.00$      0.01$             17.50$           
3 Crafco Roadsaver 201 (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 1750.0 LF 3.00$             5,250.00$      2.00$             3,500.00$      1.60$             2,800.00$      0.01$             17.50$           
4 Hma Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 1750.0 SY 0.01$             17.50$           0.01$             17.50$           0.01$             17.50$           0.01$             17.50$           
5 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2.5" Thick 3025.0 TON 93.00$           281,325.00$  60.00$           181,500.00$  90.00$           272,250.00$  80.00$           242,000.00$  
6 Traffic Director, Flagger (If & Where Directed) 276.0 HOUR 86.63$           23,909.88$    86.63$           23,909.88$    86.63$           23,909.88$    86.63$           23,909.88$    
7 6" X 8" X 18" Concrete Vertical Curb 250.0 LF 40.00$           10,000.00$    40.00$           10,000.00$    50.00$           12,500.00$    106.00$         26,500.00$    
8 Curb Piece 25.0 UNIT 400.00$         10,000.00$    500.00$         12,500.00$    370.00$         9,250.00$      450.00$         11,250.00$    
9 6" X 10" Header Curb (If & Where Directed) 260.0 LF 45.00$           11,700.00$    15.00$           3,900.00$      50.00$           13,000.00$    67.00$           17,420.00$    

10 Turf Repair Strip 525.0 LF 3.00$             1,575.00$      0.01$             5.25$             3.00$             1,575.00$      8.00$             4,200.00$      
11 Dectectable Warning Surface 12.0 SY 750.00$         9,000.00$      250.00$         3,000.00$      450.00$         5,400.00$      245.00$         2,940.00$      
12 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 200.0 SY 125.00$         25,000.00$    105.00$         21,000.00$    130.00$         26,000.00$    250.00$         50,000.00$    
13 Bicycle Safe Grate 1.0 UNIT 400.00$         400.00$         437.31$         437.31$         348.37$         348.37$         700.00$         700.00$         
14 Reconstructed Inlet Type B, Using Existing Casting 4.0 UNIT 1,800.00$      7,200.00$      1,250.00$      5,000.00$      1,500.00$      6,000.00$      800.00$         3,200.00$      
15 Parge Inlet 19.0 UNIT 780.00$         14,820.00$    400.00$         7,600.00$      750.00$         14,250.00$    450.00$         8,550.00$      
16 Tree Removal Up To 18" Dia. (If & Where Directed) 5.0 UNIT 0.01$             0.05$             1,405.00$      7,025.00$      1,200.00$      6,000.00$      1,900.00$      9,500.00$      
17 Traffic Stripes, 6" 610.0 LF 1.98$             1,207.80$      2.00$             1,220.00$      2.20$             1,342.00$      2.00$             1,220.00$      
18 Traffic Stripes, 24" 365.0 LF 7.92$             2,890.80$      8.00$             2,920.00$      5.40$             1,971.00$      5.00$             1,825.00$      
19 Regulatory Sign 35.3 SF 49.50$           1,744.88$      45.00$           1,586.25$      45.00$           1,586.25$      43.00$           1,515.75$      
20 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.0 DOLLAR 600.00$         600.00$         600.00$         600.00$         600.00$         600.00$         600.00$         600.00$         
21 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.0 DOLLAR 300.00$         300.00$         300.00$         300.00$         300.00$         300.00$         300.00$         300.00$         

Alternate Bid No. 1 Wexford Court
A1 HMA Milling, 3" 920.0 SY 4.00$             3,680.00$      11.00$           10,120.00$    7.90$             7,268.00$      6.00$             5,520.00$      
A2 Mastic One-Crafco (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 100.0 LF 0.01$             1.00$             4.00$             400.00$         3.00$             300.00$         0.01$             1.00$             
A3 Crafco Roadsaver 201 (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 100.0 LF 0.01$             1.00$             2.00$             200.00$         1.60$             160.00$         0.01$             1.00$             
A4 HMA Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 100.0 SY 0.01$             1.00$             0.01$             1.00$             0.01$             1.00$             0.01$             1.00$             
A5 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 3" Thick 160.0 TON 93.00$           14,880.00$    80.00$           12,800.00$    90.00$           14,400.00$    116.00$         18,560.00$    
A6 Traffic Director, Flagger (If & Where Directed) 16.0 HOUR 86.63$           1,386.08$      86.63$           1,386.08$      86.63$           1,386.08$      86.63$           1,386.08$      
A7 6" X 8" X 18" Concrete Vertical Curb 12.0 LF 50.00$           600.00$         40.00$           480.00$         50.00$           600.00$         108.00$         1,296.00$      
A8 Tree Removal Up To 18" Dia. (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UNIT 0.01$             0.01$             1,445.05$      1,445.05$      1,174.92$      1,174.92$      1,900.00$      1,900.00$      
A9 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 7.0 SY 200.00$         1,400.00$      105.00$         735.00$         130.00$         910.00$         270.00$         1,890.00$      

Alternate Bid No. 2 Strathmere Road
B1 HMA Milling, 2" 1660.0 SY 4.00$             6,640.00$      8.50$             14,110.00$    7.90$             13,114.00$    6.00$             9,960.00$      
B2 Mastic One-Crafco (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 180.0 LF 0.01$             1.80$             4.00$             720.00$         3.00$             540.00$         0.01$             1.80$             
B3 Crafco Roadsaver 201 (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 180.0 LF 0.01$             1.80$             2.00$             360.00$         1.60$             288.00$         0.01$             1.80$             
B4 HMA Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 180.0 SY 0.01$             1.80$             0.01$             1.80$             0.01$             1.80$             0.01$             1.80$             
B5 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 220.0 TON 93.00$           20,460.00$    80.00$           17,600.00$    90.00$           19,800.00$    132.00$         29,040.00$    
B6 Traffic Director, Flagger (If & Where Directed) 16.0 HOUR 86.63$           1,386.08$      86.63$           1,386.08$      86.63$           1,386.08$      86.63$           1,386.08$      
B7 Tree Removal Up To 18" Dia. (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UNIT 0.01$             0.01$             1,211.93$      1,211.93$      1,160.12$      1,160.12$      1,900.00$      1,900.00$      
B8 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 7.0 SY 200.00$         1,400.00$      105.00$         735.00$         130.00$         910.00$         270.00$         1,890.00$      

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. #1 & #2 534,031.49$                           531,713.13$                           606,000.00$                           630,919.69$                           
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #2 29,891.49$                             36,124.81$                             37,200.00$                             44,181.48$                             

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

Old Bridge, NJ 08857 Farmingdale, NJ 07727
Pilesgrove, NJ 08098

F: 732-967-6402 F: 732-308-1034 F: 609-567-4750

P: 609-561-4100

Hammonton, NJ 08037

495,588.32$                           568,800.00$                           586,738.21$                           
30,555.08$                             

F: 856-769-5630

P: 856-769-8244

Black Rock Enterprises, Earle Co. Arawak Paving Co., Inc.

PO Box 430

P: 732-967-6400 P: 732-308-1113

482,190.91$                           468,021.19$                           542,600.00$                           556,183.13$                           

LLC

7503 Weymouth Road1316 Englishtown Road PO Box 556

Co., Inc.
R. E. Pierson Construction

426 Swedesboro Road

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 504,140.00$                           
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #1 21,949.09$                             27,567.13$                             26,200.00$                             



ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS 2024 ROAD PROGRAM
SUMMARY OF BIDS TOWNSHIP OF EASTAMPTON

BID OPENING: 03/11/2025 AT 11:00 AM BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

43035 24

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

Old Bridge, NJ 08857 Farmingdale, NJ 07727
Pilesgrove, NJ 08098

F: 732-967-6402 F: 732-308-1034 F: 609-567-4750

P: 609-561-4100

Hammonton, NJ 08037

F: 856-769-5630

P: 856-769-8244

Black Rock Enterprises, Earle Co. Arawak Paving Co., Inc.

PO Box 430

P: 732-967-6400 P: 732-308-1113

LLC

7503 Weymouth Road1316 Englishtown Road PO Box 556

Co., Inc.
R. E. Pierson Construction

426 Swedesboro Road

Alternate Bid No. 3 Newbury Lane
C1 HMA Milling, 2" 1260.0 SY 4.00$             5,040.00$      8.50$             10,710.00$    7.90$             9,954.00$      6.00$             7,560.00$      
C2 Mastic One-Crafco (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 140.0 LF 0.01$             1.40$             4.00$             560.00$         3.00$             420.00$         0.01$             1.40$             
C3 Crafco Roadsaver 201 (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 140.0 LF 0.01$             1.40$             2.00$             280.00$         1.60$             224.00$         0.01$             1.40$             
C4 HMA Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 140.0 SY 0.01$             1.40$             0.01$             1.40$             0.01$             1.40$             0.01$             1.40$             
C5 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 170.0 TON 93.00$           15,810.00$    80.00$           13,600.00$    90.00$           15,300.00$    132.00$         22,440.00$    
C6 Traffic Director, Flagger (If & Where Directed) 16.0 HOUR 86.63$           1,386.08$      86.63$           1,386.08$      86.63$           1,386.08$      86.63$           1,386.08$      
C7 Curb Piece 1.0 UNIT 400.00$         400.00$         500.00$         500.00$         370.00$         370.00$         600.00$         600.00$         
C8 Parge Inlet 1.0 UNIT 900.00$         900.00$         400.00$         400.00$         750.00$         750.00$         450.00$         450.00$         
C9 Tree Removal Up To 18" Dia. (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UNIT 0.01$             0.01$             1,327.52$      1,327.52$      1,184.52$      1,184.52$      1,900.00$      1,900.00$      

C10 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 7.0 SY 200.00$         1,400.00$      105.00$         735.00$         130.00$         910.00$         270.00$         1,890.00$      

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. #1 & #2 & #3 558,971.78$                           561,213.13$                           636,500.00$                           667,149.97$                           
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #3 24,940.29$                             29,500.00$                             30,500.00$                             36,230.28$                             



ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID OPENING: 03/11/2025 AT 11:00 AM

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT

NJDOT MA - Base Bid: Kensington Drive - Knightsbridge Rd To Kensington Dr

1 HMA Milling, 2.5" 17500.0 SY
2 Mastic One-Crafco (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 1750.0 LF
3 Crafco Roadsaver 201 (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 1750.0 LF
4 Hma Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 1750.0 SY
5 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2.5" Thick 3025.0 TON
6 Traffic Director, Flagger (If & Where Directed) 276.0 HOUR
7 6" X 8" X 18" Concrete Vertical Curb 250.0 LF
8 Curb Piece 25.0 UNIT
9 6" X 10" Header Curb (If & Where Directed) 260.0 LF

10 Turf Repair Strip 525.0 LF
11 Dectectable Warning Surface 12.0 SY
12 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 200.0 SY
13 Bicycle Safe Grate 1.0 UNIT
14 Reconstructed Inlet Type B, Using Existing Casting 4.0 UNIT
15 Parge Inlet 19.0 UNIT
16 Tree Removal Up To 18" Dia. (If & Where Directed) 5.0 UNIT
17 Traffic Stripes, 6" 610.0 LF
18 Traffic Stripes, 24" 365.0 LF
19 Regulatory Sign 35.3 SF
20 Asphalt Price Adjustment 1.0 DOLLAR
21 Fuel Price Adjustment 1.0 DOLLAR

Alternate Bid No. 1 Wexford Court
A1 HMA Milling, 3" 920.0 SY
A2 Mastic One-Crafco (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 100.0 LF
A3 Crafco Roadsaver 201 (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 100.0 LF
A4 HMA Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 100.0 SY
A5 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 3" Thick 160.0 TON
A6 Traffic Director, Flagger (If & Where Directed) 16.0 HOUR
A7 6" X 8" X 18" Concrete Vertical Curb 12.0 LF
A8 Tree Removal Up To 18" Dia. (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UNIT
A9 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 7.0 SY

Alternate Bid No. 2 Strathmere Road
B1 HMA Milling, 2" 1660.0 SY
B2 Mastic One-Crafco (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 180.0 LF
B3 Crafco Roadsaver 201 (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 180.0 LF
B4 HMA Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 180.0 SY
B5 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 220.0 TON
B6 Traffic Director, Flagger (If & Where Directed) 16.0 HOUR
B7 Tree Removal Up To 18" Dia. (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UNIT
B8 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 7.0 SY

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. #1 & #2
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #2

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #1

2024 ROAD PROGRAM
TOWNSHIP OF EASTAMPTON

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

43035 24

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

Paving Plus, LLC

Lanoka Harbor, NJ 08734

Swift & Son, Inc. Construct Connect

505 Dugout Drive 30 Technology Parkway
Glassboro, NJ 08028

PO Box 464
South, Suite 100

Norcross, GA 30092-2925

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

NO BID RECEIVED

NO BID RECEIVED

F: 866-570-8187

P: 800-364-2059

F: 856-728-2895

P: 856-404-9166 P: 609-242-1442

F: 609-242-1443



ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BID OPENING: 03/11/2025 AT 11:00 AM

NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT

Alternate Bid No. 3 Newbury Lane
C1 HMA Milling, 2" 1260.0 SY
C2 Mastic One-Crafco (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 140.0 LF
C3 Crafco Roadsaver 201 (If & Where Directed) Or Approved Equal 140.0 LF
C4 HMA Pavement Repair (If & Where Directed) 140.0 SY
C5 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 170.0 TON
C6 Traffic Director, Flagger (If & Where Directed) 16.0 HOUR
C7 Curb Piece 1.0 UNIT
C8 Parge Inlet 1.0 UNIT
C9 Tree Removal Up To 18" Dia. (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UNIT

C10 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed) 7.0 SY

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ALT. #1 & #2 & #3
TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #3

2024 ROAD PROGRAM
TOWNSHIP OF EASTAMPTON

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

43035 24

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

Paving Plus, LLC

Lanoka Harbor, NJ 08734

Swift & Son, Inc. Construct Connect

505 Dugout Drive 30 Technology Parkway
Glassboro, NJ 08028

PO Box 464
South, Suite 100

Norcross, GA 30092-2925

F: 866-570-8187

P: 800-364-2059

F: 856-728-2895

P: 856-404-9166 P: 609-242-1442

F: 609-242-1443

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED


