
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

BASE BID

1 Drain, Clean, and Isolate Flocculation Basin 2 UN $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00

2
Remove and Dispose of Existing Flocculator 
Mechanism 

2 UN $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $17,250.00 $34,500.00 $28,000.00 $56,000.00 $14,000.00 $28,000.00

3
Inspect and Repair Concrete in Flocculation 
Basins

3A Concrete Repair, Type A 30 SF $150.00 $4,500.00 $130.00 $3,900.00 $54.00 $1,620.00 $100.00 $3,000.00

3B Concrete Repair, Type B 30 SF $250.00 $7,500.00 $235.00 $7,050.00 $182.00 $5,460.00 $150.00 $4,500.00

3C Concrete Repair, Type C 10 CF $550.00 $5,500.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $545.00 $5,450.00 $250.00 $2,500.00

3D Concrete Repair, Type D 10 SF $600.00 $6,000.00 $710.00 $7,100.00 $212.00 $2,120.00 $380.00 $3,800.00

3E Sealant Repair 35 LF $100.00 $3,500.00 $95.00 $3,325.00 $51.00 $1,785.00 $80.00 $2,800.00

3F Crack Injector 120 LF $100.00 $12,000.00 $100.00 $12,000.00 $109.00 $13,080.00 $92.00 $11,040.00

3G Concrete Walkway Corner Repair "Type 1" 1 UN $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,250.00 $7,250.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00

4
Apply Epoxy Coating to Dry Well Floor and 
Walls

1 LS $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,175.00 $8,175.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

5
Remove and Replace Damaged Block from 
CMU Liner in Flash Mixer Basins

15 SF $500.00 $7,500.00 $400.00 $6,000.00 $800.00 $12,000.00 $800.00 $12,000.00

6
Furnish and Install Flocculator Mechanisms 
and Drive - Complete

2 UN $225,000.00 $450,000.00 $175,000.00 $350,000.00 $232,000.00 $464,000.00 $237,500.00 $475,000.00

Bid Opening 11/21/2024 @ 10:00 AM 40008 43

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC. WATER TREATMENT PLANT FLOCCULATOR REHABILITATION

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 
SUMMARY OF BIDS BURLINGTON CITY

Engineer's Estimate Sovereign Consulting Inc.
Municipal Maintenance 

Company
MBE Mark III

111-A North Gold Drive 1352 Taylors Lane 213 Main Street
Cinnaminson, NJ 08077 Madison, NJ 07940

P: 609-433-9849 P: 856-786-9434 P: 973-377-9240

Robbinsville, NJ 08691

F: NO FAX F: 856-786-0642 F: 973-377-7840

 Page 1 of 8



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

Bid Opening 11/21/2024 @ 10:00 AM 40008 43

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC. WATER TREATMENT PLANT FLOCCULATOR REHABILITATION

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 
SUMMARY OF BIDS BURLINGTON CITY

Engineer's Estimate Sovereign Consulting Inc.
Municipal Maintenance 

Company
MBE Mark III

111-A North Gold Drive 1352 Taylors Lane 213 Main Street
Cinnaminson, NJ 08077 Madison, NJ 07940

P: 609-433-9849 P: 856-786-9434 P: 973-377-9240

Robbinsville, NJ 08691

F: NO FAX F: 856-786-0642 F: 973-377-7840

7
Remove and Replace Baffle Wall Boards in 
Flocculator Basins (if and where directed)

170 LF $75.00 $12,750.00 $60.00 $10,200.00 $80.00 $13,600.00 $175.00 $29,750.00

8 Remove and Replace Flash Mixers 2 UN $60,000.00 $120,000.00 $50,000.00 $100,000.00 $50,000.00 $100,000.00 $42,500.00 $85,000.00

9
Remove and Replace Baffle Walls in Flash 
Mixer Basins

4 UN $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00

10
Remove and Replace Mud Valves and 
Extension Stems

2 UN $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $12,500.00 $25,000.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $11,250.00 $22,500.00

11 Disinfection, Testing and Startup

11A Flocculator Basins 2 UN $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00

11B Flash Mixer Basins 2 UN $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00

12 Unforseen Conditions (if and where directed) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

ALTERNATE #1

A5
Demolish and Reconstruct CMU Liner in Flash 
Mixer Basins, Complete

2 UN $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $24,400.00 $48,800.00 $30,000.00 $60,000.00

5
Remove and Replace Damaged Block from 
CMU Liner in Flash Mixer Basins

-15 SF $500.00 ($7,500.00) $400.00 ($6,000.00) $800.00 ($12,000.00) $800.00 ($12,000.00)

TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATE #1

$769,715.00 $762,390.00TOTAL BASE BID PRICE $750,250.00 $614,500.00

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE $22,500.00 $10,000.00 $36,800.00

ALLOWANCE

$48,000.00

$772,750.00 $624,500.00 $806,515.00 $810,390.00
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

1 Drain, Clean, and Isolate Flocculation Basin 2 UN

2
Remove and Dispose of Existing Flocculator 
Mechanism 

2 UN

3
Inspect and Repair Concrete in Flocculation 
Basins

3A Concrete Repair, Type A 30 SF

3B Concrete Repair, Type B 30 SF

3C Concrete Repair, Type C 10 CF

3D Concrete Repair, Type D 10 SF

3E Sealant Repair 35 LF

3F Crack Injector 120 LF

3G Concrete Walkway Corner Repair "Type 1" 1 UN

4
Apply Epoxy Coating to Dry Well Floor and 
Walls

1 LS

5
Remove and Replace Damaged Block from 
CMU Liner in Flash Mixer Basins

15 SF

6
Furnish and Install Flocculator Mechanisms 
and Drive - Complete

2 UN

Bid Opening 11/21/2024 @ 10:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

$500.00 $1,000.00 $8,800.00 $17,600.00

$25,000.00 $50,000.00 $42,000.00 $84,000.00

$125.00 $3,750.00 $75.00 $2,250.00

$225.00 $6,750.00 $205.00 $6,150.00

$475.00 $4,750.00 $610.00 $6,100.00

$675.00 $6,750.00 $250.00 $2,500.00

$90.00 $3,150.00 $70.00 $2,450.00

$95.00 $11,400.00 $121.00 $14,520.00

$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $11,475.00 $11,475.00

$5,900.00 $5,900.00 $39,015.00 $39,015.00

$200.00 $3,000.00 $725.00 $10,875.00

$274,275.00 $548,550.00 $225,000.00 $450,000.00

40008 43

Rapid Pump & Meter Service Co. C. Stevenson & Son, Inc. Derstine Company, LLC

WATER TREATMENT PLANT FLOCCULATOR REHABILITATION

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 
BURLINGTON CITY

Clyde N. Lattimer & Son

285 Straight Street PO Box AY 950 Mt. Holly Road 320 Cowpath Road
Souderton, PA 18964

228 North Route 73
Berlin, NJ 08009

P: 856-768-3700

Paterson, NJ 07509 Edgewater Park, NJ 08010

P: 973-345-5600 P: 609-871-1666
F: 856-768-1104 F: 973-345-0301 F: 609-871-2987 F: 215-723-6081

P: 215-723-4798
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

Bid Opening 11/21/2024 @ 10:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

7
Remove and Replace Baffle Wall Boards in 
Flocculator Basins (if and where directed)

170 LF

8 Remove and Replace Flash Mixers 2 UN

9
Remove and Replace Baffle Walls in Flash 
Mixer Basins

4 UN

10
Remove and Replace Mud Valves and 
Extension Stems

2 UN

11 Disinfection, Testing and Startup

11A Flocculator Basins 2 UN

11B Flash Mixer Basins 2 UN

12 Unforseen Conditions (if and where directed)

ALTERNATE #1

A5
Demolish and Reconstruct CMU Liner in Flash 
Mixer Basins, Complete

2 UN

5
Remove and Replace Damaged Block from 
CMU Liner in Flash Mixer Basins

-15 SF

TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATE #1

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ALLOWANCE

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

40008 43

Rapid Pump & Meter Service Co. C. Stevenson & Son, Inc. Derstine Company, LLC

WATER TREATMENT PLANT FLOCCULATOR REHABILITATION

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 
BURLINGTON CITY

Clyde N. Lattimer & Son

285 Straight Street PO Box AY 950 Mt. Holly Road 320 Cowpath Road
Souderton, PA 18964

228 North Route 73
Berlin, NJ 08009

P: 856-768-3700

Paterson, NJ 07509 Edgewater Park, NJ 08010

P: 973-345-5600 P: 609-871-1666
F: 856-768-1104 F: 973-345-0301 F: 609-871-2987 F: 215-723-6081

P: 215-723-4798

$100.00 $17,000.00 $232.00 $39,440.00

$40,000.00 $80,000.00 $42,000.00 $84,000.00

$1,000.00 $4,000.00 $13,750.00 $55,000.00

$13,000.00 $26,000.00 $10,500.00 $21,000.00

$500.00 $1,000.00 $3,915.00 $7,830.00

$500.00 $1,000.00 $3,915.00 $7,830.00

$5,000.00 $5,000.00

$30,000.00 $60,000.00 $11,200.00 $22,400.00

$200.00 ($3,000.00) $725.00 ($10,875.00)

NO BID NO BID$784,000.00 $867,035.00

$57,000.00 $11,525.00 NO BID NO BID

$841,000.00 $878,560.00 NO BID NO BID
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

1 Drain, Clean, and Isolate Flocculation Basin 2 UN

2
Remove and Dispose of Existing Flocculator 
Mechanism 

2 UN

3
Inspect and Repair Concrete in Flocculation 
Basins

3A Concrete Repair, Type A 30 SF

3B Concrete Repair, Type B 30 SF

3C Concrete Repair, Type C 10 CF

3D Concrete Repair, Type D 10 SF

3E Sealant Repair 35 LF

3F Crack Injector 120 LF

3G Concrete Walkway Corner Repair "Type 1" 1 UN

4
Apply Epoxy Coating to Dry Well Floor and 
Walls

1 LS

5
Remove and Replace Damaged Block from 
CMU Liner in Flash Mixer Basins

15 SF

6
Furnish and Install Flocculator Mechanisms 
and Drive - Complete

2 UN

Bid Opening 11/21/2024 @ 10:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

40008 43

Spectraserv, Inc. Sub-Level Installations, Inc.

WATER TREATMENT PLANT FLOCCULATOR REHABILITATION

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 
BURLINGTON CITY

Dodge Construction Network
JVS Industrial & Commercial 

Contractors, Inc.

PO Box 698154 Silver Lake Avenue 75 Jacobus Avenue2860 S State Highway 161, Suite 
160 #501 Edison, NJ 08817

Grand Prairie, TX 75052-7361
P: 844-326-3826 P: 732-543-2777 P: 973-589-0277

F: NO FAX F: 732-543-2775 F: 973-589-0415 F: 609-257-6059

South Kearny, NJ 07032 Mount Laurel, NJ 08054

P: 609-513-0195
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

Bid Opening 11/21/2024 @ 10:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

7
Remove and Replace Baffle Wall Boards in 
Flocculator Basins (if and where directed)

170 LF

8 Remove and Replace Flash Mixers 2 UN

9
Remove and Replace Baffle Walls in Flash 
Mixer Basins

4 UN

10
Remove and Replace Mud Valves and 
Extension Stems

2 UN

11 Disinfection, Testing and Startup

11A Flocculator Basins 2 UN

11B Flash Mixer Basins 2 UN

12 Unforseen Conditions (if and where directed)

ALTERNATE #1

A5
Demolish and Reconstruct CMU Liner in Flash 
Mixer Basins, Complete

2 UN

5
Remove and Replace Damaged Block from 
CMU Liner in Flash Mixer Basins

-15 SF

TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATE #1

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ALLOWANCE

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

40008 43

Spectraserv, Inc. Sub-Level Installations, Inc.

WATER TREATMENT PLANT FLOCCULATOR REHABILITATION

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 
BURLINGTON CITY

Dodge Construction Network
JVS Industrial & Commercial 

Contractors, Inc.

PO Box 698154 Silver Lake Avenue 75 Jacobus Avenue2860 S State Highway 161, Suite 
160 #501 Edison, NJ 08817

Grand Prairie, TX 75052-7361
P: 844-326-3826 P: 732-543-2777 P: 973-589-0277

F: NO FAX F: 732-543-2775 F: 973-589-0415 F: 609-257-6059

South Kearny, NJ 07032 Mount Laurel, NJ 08054

P: 609-513-0195

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

1 Drain, Clean, and Isolate Flocculation Basin 2 UN

2
Remove and Dispose of Existing Flocculator 
Mechanism 

2 UN

3
Inspect and Repair Concrete in Flocculation 
Basins

3A Concrete Repair, Type A 30 SF

3B Concrete Repair, Type B 30 SF

3C Concrete Repair, Type C 10 CF

3D Concrete Repair, Type D 10 SF

3E Sealant Repair 35 LF

3F Crack Injector 120 LF

3G Concrete Walkway Corner Repair "Type 1" 1 UN

4
Apply Epoxy Coating to Dry Well Floor and 
Walls

1 LS

5
Remove and Replace Damaged Block from 
CMU Liner in Flash Mixer Basins

15 SF

6
Furnish and Install Flocculator Mechanisms 
and Drive - Complete

2 UN

Bid Opening 11/21/2024 @ 10:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

40008 43

Thomas P. Carney, Inc. Construct Connect

WATER TREATMENT PLANT FLOCCULATOR REHABILITATION

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 
BURLINGTON CITY

F: 215-860-2743
P: 609-685-6033

2490 Village Road
Langhorne, PA 19047

3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700

P: 800-364-2059

Cincinnati, OH 45209

F: 1-866-570-8187
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

Bid Opening 11/21/2024 @ 10:00 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

7
Remove and Replace Baffle Wall Boards in 
Flocculator Basins (if and where directed)

170 LF

8 Remove and Replace Flash Mixers 2 UN

9
Remove and Replace Baffle Walls in Flash 
Mixer Basins

4 UN

10
Remove and Replace Mud Valves and 
Extension Stems

2 UN

11 Disinfection, Testing and Startup

11A Flocculator Basins 2 UN

11B Flash Mixer Basins 2 UN

12 Unforseen Conditions (if and where directed)

ALTERNATE #1

A5
Demolish and Reconstruct CMU Liner in Flash 
Mixer Basins, Complete

2 UN

5
Remove and Replace Damaged Block from 
CMU Liner in Flash Mixer Basins

-15 SF

TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATE #1

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ALLOWANCE

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

40008 43

Thomas P. Carney, Inc. Construct Connect

WATER TREATMENT PLANT FLOCCULATOR REHABILITATION

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 
BURLINGTON CITY

F: 215-860-2743
P: 609-685-6033

2490 Village Road
Langhorne, PA 19047

3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700

P: 800-364-2059

Cincinnati, OH 45209

F: 1-866-570-8187

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
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