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Lowest total amount base bid: 

Sludge Polymer (per gallon)

TOTAL AMOUNT  BASE BID: $20,840.00 $13,125.75

$25.2606 $15.91
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hydrated Lime (per pound) $0.4220 $0.465
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$12,555.00TOTAL AMOUNT  BASE BID: $11,394.00

Liquid Sodium Bisulfite (per gallon) $8.5156 $4.277 $4.05
NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL AMOUNT  BASE BID: $170,312.00 $85,540.00 $81,000.00

Powdered Activated Carbon (per pound) $1.52 $1.6203
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL AMOUNT  BASE BID: $48,640.00 $51,849.60

Potassium Permanganate (per 55lb drum) $198.4557 $198.55
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL AMOUNT  BASE BID: $8,930.51 $8,934.75

Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (per gallon) $2.9484 $1.98
NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL AMOUNT  BASE BID: $70,761.60 $47,520.00
NO BID

UNIT PR.

Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite (per gallon) $4.5992 $2.548 $2.59 $2.45

DESCRIPTION UNIT PR. UNIT PR. UNIT PR. UNIT PR. UNIT PR.

NO BID NO BID 
TOTAL AMOUNT  BASE BID: $203,744.56 $112,876.40 $114,737.00 $108,535.00

F: (215) 785-1585 F: (732) 938-6630 F: (313) 571-6765

P: (310) 885-4555 P: (215) 785-3000 P: (732) 938-9110 P: (313) 921-1200 x 4140 P: (800) 848-7659 P: (215) 337-5403

319 Activated Carbon Drive, 

Mount Hope, WV 25880

3015 Staee Road Croydon, 

PA 19021

1151 B Highway #33  

Farmingdale, NJ 07727

10900 Harper Avenue 

Detroit, MI 48213

1 Chemical Plant Road 

Riceboro, GA 31323

68 Shelbourne Road Richboro, 

PA 18954

2025 SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF VARIOUS CHEMICALS

CITY OF BURLINGTON

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY

40008 09

Carbon Activated Corporation
George S. Coyne Chemical 

Co., Inc.
Miracle Chemical 

Company
PVS Chemicals, Inc. SNF Polydyne Univar Soultions USA, Inc.

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 12/4/2024 at 10:00 AM


