
NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

1 Milling, 0"-2" Thick 2750 SY
$9.50 $26,125.00 $4.00 $11,000.00

-$                  -$               -$                  -$               

2 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 365 TN
$130.00 $47,450.00 $95.00 $34,675.00

-$                  -$               -$                  -$               

3 Base Repair 135 SY
$30.00 $4,050.00 $20.00 $2,700.00

-$                  -$               -$                  -$               

4 Remove & Replace Parking Spot Bumpers 8 UN
$500.00 $4,000.00 $50.00 $400.00 -$                  

-$               
-$                  

-$               

5 Long-Life Traffic Paint Striping, Base Bid 1 LS $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $48,000.00 $48,000.00
-$                  -$               -$                  -$               

A1.1 Milling, 0"-2" Thick 470 SY
$9.50 $4,465.00 $4.00 $1,880.00 -$                  

-$               
-$                  

-$               

A1.2 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 75 TN
$130.00 $9,750.00 $95.00 $7,125.00 -$                  

-$               
-$                  

-$               

A1.3 Long-Life Traffic Paint Striping, Alternate Bid 1 LS
$2,500.00 $2,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 -$                  

-$               
-$                  

-$               

A1.1 Slurry Seal Coat, Existing Paving 470 SY
$5.50 $2,585.00 $11.00 $5,170.00 -$                  

-$               
-$                  

-$               

A1.3 Long-Life Traffic Paint Striping, Alternate Bid 1 LS $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $11,800.00 $11,800.00 -$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

NO BIDTOTAL ALTERNATE BID NO.2: $5,085.00 $16,970.00 NO BID

BID SUMMARY EVESHAM FIRE DISTRICT MAIN STREET STATION

SEPTEMBER 17, 2024 AT 1:00PM REPAVING PROJECT

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS 22800 03

Think Pavers Construct Connect Diamond ConstructionEngineers Estimate

3825 Edwards Road, STE #700 125 Kings Highway 3825 Edwards Road, STE #700 35 Beaverson Blvd, STE #12C

Cincinatti, OH 45209 Mt. Royal, NJ 08061 Cincinatti, OH 45209 Brick, NJ 08723

F- (866) 570-8187 F- (856) 832-4681 F- (866) 570-8187 F- (732) 262-7795

P- (800) 364-2059 P- (856)-832-4680 P- (800) 364-2059 P- (732) 262-7449

ALTERNATE BID NO. 2

ALTERNATE BID NO. 1

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID NO.1: $16,715.00 $15,005.00

BASE BID

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE:   $89,125.00 $96,775.00 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID



NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT

1 Milling, 0"-2" Thick 2750 SY

2 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 365 TN

3 Base Repair 135 SY

4 Remove & Replace Parking Spot Bumpers 8 UN

5 Long-Life Traffic Paint Striping, Base Bid 1 LS

A1.1 Milling, 0"-2" Thick 470 SY

A1.2 HMA 12.5M64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 75 TN

A1.3 Long-Life Traffic Paint Striping, Alternate Bid 1 LS

A1.1 Slurry Seal Coat, Existing Paving 470 SY

A1.3 Long-Life Traffic Paint Striping, Alternate Bid 1 LS

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID NO.2: 

BID SUMMARY

SEPTEMBER 17, 2024 AT 1:00PM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS

ALTERNATE BID NO. 2

ALTERNATE BID NO. 1

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID NO.1: 

BASE BID

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE:   

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

-$                  -$               -$                  -$               

-$                  -$               -$                  -$               

-$                  -$               -$                  -$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  -$               -$                  -$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

-$                  
-$               

NO BID NO BID

EVESHAM FIRE DISTRICT MAIN STREET STATION

REPAVING PROJECT

22800 03

Earle Company Richard T Barrett Paving Co., Inc.

P.O. Box 556 400 Prospect Street

Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Trenton, NJ 08618

F- (732) 308-1034 F- (609) 396-0572

P- (732) 308-1113 x206 P- (609) 882-2236

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID


