ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 08/13/2024 @ 11:30 AM

3rd Street Sewer Repair Project
Borough of Palmyra
Burlington County, New Jersey
44020 10

Coastline Excavating & Site . . River Front Recycling &
. Booth Mech: 1 Inc. Think P
Services, LLC 00 cehamicalne i ravers Aggregate, LLC
37 Indian Trail 42 N Lippincott Ave. 125 King Highway 20 Maple Avenue

Southampton, NJ 08088

P: 856-986-8363

Maple Shade, NJ 08052

P: 856-252-7465

Mt. Royal, NJ 08061

P: 856-832-4680

Lumberton, NJ 08048

P: 609-267-4110

F:N/A F: N/A F: 856-832-4681 F: 609-267-8906
NO | DESCRIPTION | oty JuNIT| UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNIT PR._ [  AMOUNT UNIT PR. | AMOUNT UNIT PR. | AMOUNT
BASE BID
1 |Construct 12" SDR 26 PVC Sanitary Sewer 615|LF $275.00[ $ 169,125.00 $300.00 $184,500.00 $260.00 [ $159,900.00 $405.00| $249,075.00
2 |Reconstructed Manhole,New Casting 3|UNIT $3,500.00) §  10,500.00 $8,000.00 $24,000.00 $19,000.00 $57,000.00 $2,125.00 $6,375.00
3 |Construct Sewer Lateral (Wye, Caps, & Bends) 16{UNIT $600.00( $ 9,600.00 $450.00 $7,200.00 $722.00 $11,552.00 $1,700.00|  $27,200.00
4 |Construct Sewer Lateral 4" SDR 35 PVC 80|LF $60.00 [ $ 4,800.00 $450.00 $36,000.00 $275.00 $22,000.00 $350.00 $28,000.00
5 |Construct Sewer Lateral 4" SDR 35 PVC (If & Where Directed) 235|LF $80.00| $  18,800.00 $68.00 $15,980.00 $100.00 $23,500.00 $100.00 $23,500.00
6 |Sewer Lateral Cleanout 4" SDR 35 PVC (If & Where Directed) 2|UNIT $1,100.00 | $ 2,200.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,100.00 $6,200.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00
7 |Trench Restoration Type I - Third Street 350|LF $90.00 [ $  31,500.00 $38.00 $13,300.00 $10.00 $3,500.00 $105.00 $36,750.00
8 |Trench Restoration Type III - Unpaved Areas 250|LF $30.00| $ 7,500.00 $17.00 $4,250.00 $5.00 $1,250.00 $25.00 $6,250.00
9 |Remove and Replace Concrete Curb, 6"x8"x18" 100{LF $65.00 [ $ 6,500.00 $108.00 $10,800.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $150.00 $15,000.00
10 |Remove and Replace Concrete Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 160|LF $65.00] §  10,400.00 $21.00 $3,360.00 $50.00 $8,000.00 $25.00 $4,000.00
11 |ADA Compliant Curb Ramp 1{UNIT $5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 $6,515.00 $6,515.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $2,750.00 $2,750.00
12 |Remove & Replace Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 30|SF $60.00 [ $ 1,800.00 $66.50 $1,995.00 $50.00 $1,500.00 $60.00 $1,800.00
13 |Remove and Replace Concrete Gutter 50(SF $65.00| $ 3,250.00 $81.00 $4,050.00 $80.00 $4,000.00 $115.00 $5,750.00
14 |Remove Tree 1JUNIT $1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 $1,050.00 $1,050.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 3 282,975.00 315,000.00 322,402.00 414,350.00
ALTERNATE BID #1
Al.1 [Milling, 2: Thick 1400|SY $15.00 | $ 21,000.00 $7.50 $10,500.00 $6.25 $8,750.00 $4.60 $6,440.00
A1.2 |HMA Surface Course, 12.5M64, 4" Thick 160| TN $130.00 [ $  20,800.00 $132.00 $21,120.00 $140.00 $22,400.00 $150.00 $24,000.00
A1.3 [Subbase Repair, 3" Base Paving (If & Where Directed) 20(CY $85.00| $ 1,700.00 $175.00 $3,500.00 $172.00 $3,440.00 $125.00 $2,500.00
Al.4 |Traffic Striping 40|LF $35.00 | $ 1,400.00 $46.00 $1,840.00 $30.00 $1,200.00 $4.00 $160.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID #1 PRICE 3 44,900.00 36,960.00 35,790.00 33,100.00
TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 PRICE 327,875.00 351,960.00 358,192.00 447,450.00

|:| Indicates mathematically corrected amount based on governing unit prices.




ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 08/13/2024 @ 11:30 AM

3rd Street Sewer Repair Project
Borough of Palmyra
Burlington County, New Jersey
44020 10

Earle Co.

South State, Inc. General
Contractors

Neri's Construction & Rental,
Inc.

Seacoast Construction, Inc.

PO Box 556
Farmingdale, NJ 07727

P: 732-308-1113 x 206
F:732-308-1034

202 Reeves Rd PO Box 68
Bridgeton, NJ 08302

P: 609-381-0694
F: 856-455-3461

849 Clayton Road
Williamstown, NJ 08094

P: 856-629-2408
F:N/A

15 Addington Court
East Brunswick, NJ 08816

P: 732-238-6963
F: 732-238-6083

NO | DESCRIPTION [ oy [uUNIT|[ UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNIT PR. | AMOUNT UNIT PR. | AMOUNT UNIT PR. | AMOUNT
BASE BID
1 [Construct 12" SDR 26 PVC Sanitary Sewer 615|LF $500.00( $307,500.00 $524.00[ $322,260.00 $415.00 [ $255,225.00 $495.00] $304,425.00
2 |Reconstructed Manhole,New Casting 3[UNIT $20,262.71 $60,788.13 $8,000.00 $24,000.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $9,500.00 $28,500.00
3 [Construct Sewer Lateral (Wye, Caps, & Bends) 16|UNIT $5,000.00 $80,000.00 $4,900.00 $78,400.00 $1,000.00 $16,000.00 $12,000.00] $192,000.00
4 |Construct Sewer Lateral 4" SDR 35 PVC 80|LF $3.00 $240.00 $2.50 $200.00 $340.00 $27,200.00 $350.00 $28,000.00
5 |Construct Sewer Lateral 4" SDR 35 PVC (If & Where Directed) 235|LF $3.00 $705.00 $2.50 $587.50 $300.00 $70,500.00 $350.00f  $82,250.00
6 [Sewer Lateral Cleanout 4" SDR 35 PVC (If & Where Directed) 2|UNIT $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $200.00 $400.00 $9,100.00 $18,200.00 $2,750.00 $5,500.00
7 |Trench Restoration Type I - Third Street 350|LF $25.00 $8,750.00 $80.00 $28,000.00 $60.00 $21,000.00 $72.00 $25,200.00
8 |Trench Restoration Type III - Unpaved Areas 250|LF $20.00 $5,000.00 $35.00 $8,750.00 $50.00 $12,500.00 $45.00[  $11,250.00
9 |Remove and Replace Concrete Curb, 6"x8"x18" 100|LF $45.00 $4,500.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 $130.00 $13,000.00 $75.00 $7,500.00
10 |Remove and Replace Concrete Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 160|LF $45.00 $7,200.00 $70.00 $11,200.00 $130.00 $20,800.00 $75.00 $12,000.00
11 |ADA Compliant Curb Ramp 1{UNIT $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $750.00 $750.00
12 |Remove & Replace Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 30(SF $40.00 $1,200.00 $225.00 $6,750.00 $50.00 $1,500.00 $22.00 $660.00
13 |Remove and Replace Concrete Gutter 50(SF $35.00 $1,750.00 $125.00 $6,250.00 $150.00 $7,500.00 $150.00 $7,500.00
14 |Remove Tree 1{UNIT $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 488,633.13 502,797.50 || $ 518,225.00 | $ 708,035.00
ALTERNATE BID #1
A1.1 |Milling, 2: Thick 1400(SY $7.50 $10,500.00 $11.00 $15,400.00 $19.00 $26,600.00 $18.00 $25,200.00
A1.2 |[HMA Surface Course, 12.5M64, 4" Thick 160| TN $138.00 $22,080.00 $178.00 $28,480.00 $340.00 $54,400.00 $215.00 $34,400.00
A1.3 |Subbase Repair, 3" Base Paving (If & Where Directed) 20|CY $50.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $6,000.00 $250.00 $5,000.00 $125.00 $2,500.00
Al.4 | Traffic Striping 40|LF $37.50 $1,500.00 $30.00 $1,200.00 $330.00 $13,200.00 $30.00 $1,200.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID #1 PRICE 35,080.00 51,080.00) $ 99,200.00 || $ 63,300.00
TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 PRICE 523,713.13 553,877.50 || $ 617,425.00 || $ 771,335.00

|:| Indicates mathematically corrected amount based on governing unit prices.




ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

3rd Street Sewer Repair Project
Borough of Palmyra
Burlington County, New Jersey

Bid Opening 08/13/2024 @ 11:30 AM 44020 10
Construct Connect DiMeglio Construction Co., Inc.
3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700 594 White Horse Pike
Cincinatti, OH 45209 Atco, NJ 0004
P: 800-364-2059 P: 856-767-1351
F: 1-866-570-8187 F: 856-767-3642
NO | DESCRIPTION [ oy [UNIT| UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNIT PR._ | AMOUNT
BASE BID
1 |Construct 12" SDR 26 PVC Sanitary Sewer 615|LF
2 |Reconstructed Manhole,New Casting 3|UNIT
3 |Construct Sewer Lateral (Wye, Caps, & Bends) 16[UNIT
4 |Construct Sewer Lateral 4" SDR 35 PVC 80|LF
5 |Construct Sewer Lateral 4" SDR 35 PVC (If & Where Directed) 235|LF
6 [Sewer Lateral Cleanout 4" SDR 35 PVC (If & Where Directed) 2|UNIT
7 |Trench Restoration Type I - Third Street 350|LF
8 |Trench Restoration Type III - Unpaved Areas 250|LF
9 |Remove and Replace Concrete Curb, 6"x8"x18" 100|LF
10 |Remove and Replace Concrete Curb, 6"x8"x18" (If & Where Directed) 160|LF
11 |ADA Compliant Curb Ramp 1|UNIT
12 |Remove & Replace Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 30|SF
13 |Remove and Replace Concrete Gutter 50|SF
14 [Remove Tree 1JUNIT
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED
ALTERNATE BID #1
Al.1 [Milling, 2: Thick 1400|SY
Al1.2 |HMA Surface Course, 12.5M64, 4" Thick 160| TN
A1.3 [Subbase Repair, 3" Base Paving (If & Where Directed) 20|CY
Al.4 [Traffic Striping 40|LF
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID #1 PRICE NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED
TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1 PRICE NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

|:| Indicates mathematically corrected amount based on governing unit prices.




