ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS

CONTRACT 2024-12

SUMMARY OF BIDS CHELSEA PLACE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
BID OPENING: 08/07/2024 AT 10:00 AM MOUNT LAUREL MUA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ
21915 00
Landberg Construction, Earle Co. South State, Inc. Coastline Excavating &

LLC.

General Contractors

Site Services. LLC.

82 Tuckahoe Road
Dorothy, NJ 08317
P: 609-829-2131
F: 609-909-1647

PO Box 556
Farmingdale, NJ 07727
P:732-308-1113 x 206

F: 732-308-1034

PO Box 68
Bridgeton, NJ 08302
P: 609-381-0694

37 Indian Trail
Southampton, NJ 08088
P: 856-986-8363

NO DESCRIPTION QTY JUNIT UNITPR. | AMOUNT || UNITPR. | AMOUNT || UNITPR. | AMOUNT || UNITPR. | AMOUNT

Base Bid

1 |6" cLDIP Water Main 640.00 |LF $135.00]  $86,400.00 $175.00] $ 112,000.00 $120.00| $ 76,800.00 $130.00]  $83,200.00
2 6" X 6" Tapping Sleeve and Valve 1.00 |[UN $11300.00(  $11,30000($ 900000 | S 9.000.00 s 10.000.00 | § 10,000.00 $8,500.00]  $8,500.00]
3 6" 45-degree DI MJ Bend 2.00 [UN $625.00 $1,250.00|| $450.00( $  900.00 $600.00| $  1,200.00 $700.00 $1,4oo.oo||
4 [6"X 6" DI MJ Tee 1.00 [UN $1,000.00(  $1,000.00] $500.00( $  500.00 $950.00( $  950.00 $800.00 $800.00]
5 |Fire Hydrant, Complete 2.00 |[UN $9,500.00 $19,ooo.oo|| $12,500.00] $ 25,000.00 ||  $17,000.00 § 34,000.00 |  $12,000.00 $24,ooo.oo||
6 |3/4" Corportation 16.00 |UN $525.00 58400000  $2.850.00/ S 45600.00 $2,100.00] $ 33.600.00 $600.00  $9.600.00]
7 |3/4" Type "K" Copper Water Service 550.00 |LF $65.00(  $35.750.00] $5.00| $  2,750.00 $10.00{ $  5,500.00 $35.00]  $19250.00]
8 [3/4" Curb Stope and Box 16.00 JUN $725.00]  $11,600.00] $240.00| $  3.840.00 $2.200.00] $ 35.200.00 $700.00{  $11,200.00]
9 [Abandonment of Water Main 640.00 |LF $7.50 $4,800.00|| $2.50| $  1,600.00 $15.00/ $  9,600.00 $8.00 $5,120.00||
10 |Sacrificial Anode 23.00 [UN $475.00]  $10,925.00] $275.00| $  6,325.00 $115.00] $  2,645.00 $700.00{  $16,100.00]
11 [Refurbish Type "B" Inlet, Complete (If and 1.00 |UN $2,500.00]  $2,500.00|  $1.673.13|$  1,673.13 $3,500.00| $  3,500.00 $2,200.00]  $2,200.00

Where Directed)
12 [Monument Box (If and Where Directed) 1.00 [UN $230.00 $23o.oo|| $200.00{ $  200.00 $100.00( $  100.00 $500.00 $500.oo||
13 [Concrete Sidewalk (If and Where Directed) 5.00 |sy $220.00 $1,1oo.oo|| $125.00($  625.00 $700.00| $  3,500.00 $60.00 $3oo.oo||
14 g‘i)rzccrgde)l)r”ewayApm“ (If and Where 10.00 |SY $240.00 $2,400.00|| $125.00{ $  1,250.00 $350.00{ $  3,500.00 $80.00 $800.00||
15 [Monolithic Concrete Curb and Gutter (If and 30.00 |LF $80.00]  $2,400.00 $65.00{ $  1,950.00 $150.00| $  4,500.00 $120.00]  $3,600.00
Where Directed)
16 |Concrete Gutter 140.00 |SF $35.00  54.900.00] $30.00( $  4,200.00 $50.00( $  7,000.00 $65.00  59,100.00]
17 EZE‘;‘I’;j‘ Replace Handicapped Ramp, 2.00 |[UN $5,500.00 $11,000.00|| $4,500.00| §  9,000.00 $5,000.00| $ 10,000.00 |  $12,875.00 $25,750.00||
18 [2" Mill and Overlay 2,800.00 |SY $20.00 $56,ooo.oo|| $16.00] $ 44,800.00 $16.00] $ 44,800.00 $27.00 $75,600.00||
19 [Leveling Course (If and Where Directed) 10.00 [TONS $90.00 $9oo.oo|| $80.00[ $  800.00 $90.00[ $  900.00 $110.00 $1,1oo.oo||
20 |Install Tracer Wire Test Station 2.00 [UN $250.00 $500.00 $300.00( $  600.00 $1,000.00[ $  2,000.00 $500.00]  $1,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID: $272,355.00 $272,613.13 $289,295.00 $299,120.00




ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS
BID OPENING: 08/07/2024 AT 10:00 AM

CONTRACT 2024-12
CHELSEA PLACE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT
MOUNT LAUREL MUA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ
21915 00

Think Pavers

A to Z Site Contractors,

Inc.

Construct Connect

James R. Ientile, Inc.

125 King Highway
Mt. Royal, NJ 08061
P: 856-832-4680
F: 856-832-4681

50 Houston Avenue
Suite 1
Jackson, NJ 08527
P: 732-886-8000
F: 732-886-0045

3825 Edwards Road
Suite 700
Cincinnati, OH 45209
P: 800-364-2059
F: 1-866-570-8187

28 Vanderburg Road
Marlboro, NJ 07746
P: 732-303-0637
F: 732-303-0631

NO DESCRIPTION [ QIY.JUNIT UNITPR. | AMOUNT || UNITPR. | AMOUNT || UNITPR. | AMOUNT || UNITPR. | AMOUNT
Base Bid

1 |6" CLDIP Water Main 640.00 |LF $215.00]  $137,600.00

2 [6" X 6" Tapping Sleeve and Valve 1.00 [UN $10,000.00]  $10,000.00]
3 |6" 45-degree DI MJ Bend 2.00 |[UN $2.400.00)  $4.800.00]
4 [6"X 6" DIMJ Tee 1.00 [UN $4,800.00(  $4.800.00]
5 |Fire Hydrant, Complete 2.00 |[UN $10,500.00]  $21,000.00]
6 |3/4" Corportation 16.00 |UN $740.00]  $11,840.00]
7 |3/4" Type "K" Copper Water Service 550.00 |LF $65.00 $35,750.00||
8 [3/4" Curb Stope and Box 16.00 |UN $950.00 $15,2oo.oo||
9 | Abandonment of Water Main 640.00 |LF $13.00  $8320.00]
10 [Sacrificial Anode 23.00 |[UN $760.00]  $17.480.00]
1 Refurbisl'l Type "B" Inlet, Complete (If and 1.00 |UN $4.400.00 $4’400.00"

Where Directed)
12 [Monument Box (If and Where Directed) 1.00 [UN $155.00 $155.00]
13 [Concrete Sidewalk (If and Where Directed) 5.00 [sy $511.00  52.555.00]
14 g‘i’rzccrgde)l)riveway Apron (If and Where 10.00 [SY $260.00 $2,600.00||
15 Monolith'ic Concrete Curb and Gutter (If and 30.00 [LF $158.00 $4.740.0 0||
Where Directed)
16 |Concrete Gutter 140.00 [SF 524.00  $3360.00]
17 EZE‘;‘I’;j‘ Replace Handicapped Ramp, 2.00 [UN $4,900.00 $9,800.00||
18 [2" Mill and Overlay 2,800.00 |SY $20.00(  $56,000.00]
19 |Leveling Course (If and Where Directed) 10.00 [TONS $110.00 $1,100.00||
20 [(Install Tracer Wire Test Station 2.00 [UN $1,800.00 $3,600.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID: $355,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID




ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

CONTRACT 2024-12

CHELSEA PLACE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT

BID OPENING: 08/07/2024 AT 10:00 AM MOUNT LAUREL MUA
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ
21915 00
Kiely Civil, LLC.
1 Radar Way
Tinton Falls, NJ 07724
P: 732-813-6707
F: 732-222-3051
NO DESCRIPTION | QTY.|UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
Base Bid
1 |6" CLDIP Water Main 640.00 |LF
2 |6" X 6" Tapping Sleeve and Valve 1.00 |UN
3 |6" 45-degree DI MJ Bend 2.00 [UN
4 6" X 6" DIMJ Tee 1.00 [UN
5 |Fire Hydrant, Complete 2.00 [UN
6 |3/4" Corportation 16.00 [UN
7 |3/4" Type "K" Copper Water Service 550.00 |LF
8 [3/4" Curb Stope and Box 16.00 [UN
9 |Abandonment of Water Main 640.00 |LF
10 |Sacrificial Anode 23.00 ([UN
1 l\jve}fzrr:l];lilr;[;zz) B" Inlet, Complete (If and 1.00 |UN
12 |Monument Box (If and Where Directed) 1.00 |UN
13 |Concrete Sidewalk (If and Where Directed) 5.00 |SY
14 g;)rr;(;rtztde)Driveway Apron (If and Where 1000 |sY
15 hvgirelilglilfeizg(;rete Curb and Gutter (If and 30.00 [LF
16 |Concrete Gutter 140.00 |SF
17 g(e)ﬁg\{; é& Replace Handicapped Ramp, 500 [lUN
18 [2" Mill and Overlay 2,800.00 |SY
19 |Leveling Course (If and Where Directed) 10.00 [TONS
20 |Install Tracer Wire Test Station 2.00 [UN
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID: NO BID




