ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS

LEGION FIELD TENNIS COURTS / BASKETBALL COURT IMPROVEMENTS

BID SUMMARY BOROUGH OF PALMRYA
BID OPENING 07/9/24 AT 11:00 AM BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ
44515 60
Think Pavers Hardscaping, LLC Shore Top Construction Corp. Landberg Construction, LLC Senco Metals, LLC
125 King Highway 23 Yellowbrook Road 82 Tuckahoe Road 318 McLean Blvd., Unit 4
ENVIRONMENTAL Mt. Royal, NJ 08061 Freehold, NJ 07728 Dorothy, NJ 08317 Paterson, NJ 07504
RESOLUTIONS, INC.
Engincers * Plansiers * Scientists * Surveyors
P: 856-832-4680 P: 732-835-2600 P: 609-829-2131 P: 973-342-1742
F: 856-832-4681 F: 732-377-7774 F: 609-909-1647 F: 973-200-1342
NO | DESCRIPTION [QYT [UNIT|| UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. | AMOUNT UNITPR. [ AMOUNT
TENNIS COURTS
1 |Tennis Court Acrylic Surfacing, Complete 1|LS $95,000.00f $§  95,000.00 $98,000.00f §  98,000.00 $62,000.00f §  62,000.00 $790,000.00 $  790,000.00
2 |Bleacher System, Complete 1{UN $20,000.00[ §  20,000.00 $8,500.00] $ 8,500.00 §$13,800.00[ §  13,800.00 §75,000.00f §  75,000.00
3 [Seating Bench 8|UN $2,750.00f $  22,000.00 $2,800.00f $  22,400.00 $3,100.00/ $  24,800.00 $3,000.00/ $  24,000.00
4 |Concrete Pad, 6" Thick 20[{SY $120.00f $ 2,400.00 $100.00f $ 2,000.00 $300.00f $ 6,000.00 $1,200.00] §  24,000.00
TENNIS COURTS SUBTOTAL:| $ 139,400.00 || $ 130,900.00 || $ 106,600.00 || $ 913,000.00
5 |HMA Milling, 2" or Less 632|SY $5.00| $ 3,160.00 $5.00[ $ 3,160.00 $21.00( $  13,272.00 $142.400$  89,996.80
6 |Install Petromat 632(SY $5.00( $ 3,160.00 $5.00( $ 3,160.00 $24.00($  15,168.00 $87.02(|$  54,996.64
7 |Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 76| TON $100.00f $ 7,600.00 $200.00( $  15,200.00 $211.00( $  16,036.00 $1,250.00f $  95,000.00
8 |Install Court Fishing System 632(SY $15.00( $ 9,480.00 $22.00( $  13,904.00 $20.25(1$  12,798.00 $118.67]| $  74,999.44
9 _[Temporary 6' High Chainlink Fence 1{LS $1.00| $ 1.00 $500.00f $ 500.00 $10,000.00 §  10,000.00 §$25,000.00f §  25,000.00
BASKETBALL COURT SUBTOTAL:|| $ 23,401.00 || $ 35,924.00 || $ 67,274.00 || $ 339,992.88
CONSTRUCTION TOTAL:[ $ 162,801.00 | $ 166,824.00 | $ 173,874.00 | $ 1,252,992.88
Abhzeen Design Inc. American Athletics - Track and Nickolaus Construction Co. Construct Connect
Turf
34 School Road E. 2050 US - 260 PO Box 2322 3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700
ENVIRONMENTAL Marlboro, NJ 07746 Southampton, NJ 08088 Vincentown, NJ 08088 Cincinnatti, OH 45209
RESOLUTIONS, INC.
Enginoees - Planacrs - Scfaatlsts - Sarveyors P: 732-984-7464 P: 609-859-1414 P: 609-859-8668 P: 800-364-2059
F: 732-984-7454 F: 609-859-1791 F: 609-859-3674 F: 1-800-570-8187
NO | DESCRIPTION [OYT [UNIT [ UNITPR. | AMOUNT [ UNITPR. | AMOUNT
TENNIS COURTS
1 |Tennis Court Acrylic Surfacing, Complete 1|1LS
2 |Bleacher System, Complete 1|UN
3 [Seating Bench 8|UN
4 |Concrete Pad, 6" Thick 20(SY
TENNIS COURTS SUBTOTAL: NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED
5 [HMA Milling, 2" or Less 632|SY
6 |Install Petromat 632|SY
7 [Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5 M 64 Surface Course, 2" Thick 76/ TON
8 |Install Court Fishing System 632|SY
9 |Temporary 6' High Chainlink Fence 1{LS
BASKETBALL COURT SUBTOTAL: NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED
CONSTRUCTION TOTAL:| NO BID RECEIVED | NO BID RECEIVED | NO BID RECEIVED | NO BID RECEIVED
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