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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

1 HMA MILLING 1.5" OR LESS 6,500 SY $6.70 $43,550.00 $5.25 $34,125.00

2 HMA 12.5M64 SURFACE COURSE, 2.5" THICK 1,025 TONS $85.00 $87,125.00 $96.50 $98,912.50

3 BASE REPAIR (IF & WHERE DIRECTED) 650 SY $1.00 $650.00 $12.50 $8,125.00

4 HMA DRIVEWAY, 3" THICK 70 SY $50.00 $3,500.00 $50.00 $3,500.00

5 BICYCLE SAFE GRATE 2 UNITS $350.00 $700.00 $500.00 $1,000.00

6 REMOVE EXISTING SIGN ASSEMBLY 1 UNIT $150.00 $150.00 $131.88 $131.88

7 WARNING SIGN 20 SF $60.00 $1,200.00 $60.00 $1,200.00

8 REGULATORY SIGN 30 SF $55.00 $1,650.00 $55.00 $1,650.00

9 TRAFFIC STRIPES, 4" EPOXY RESIN 11,100 LF $0.50 $5,550.00 $0.50 $5,550.00

10 TRAFFIC STRIPES, 6" THERMOPLASTIC 135 LF $1.20 $162.00 $1.25 $168.75

11 TRAFFIC MARKINGS LINES, 24" THERMOPLASTIC 100 LF $5.00 $500.00 $5.00 $500.00

12 TRAFFIC MARKINGS, THERMOPLASTIC 20 SF $32.00 $640.00 $32.50 $650.00

13 RESET SIGNS 1 UNIT $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

14 TANGENT GUIDE RAIL TERMINAL 4 UNITS $4,335.75 $17,343.00 $3,600.00 $14,400.00

15 NONVEGETATIVE SURFACE, POROUS HMA, 4" THICK 520 SY $43.00 $22,360.00 $70.00 $36,400.00

16 BEAM GUIDE RAIL 535 LF $32.00 $17,120.00 $40.00 $21,400.00

17 ASPHALT PRICE ADJUSTMENT 200 DOLLAR $1.00 $200.00 $1.00 $200.00

18 FUEL PRICE ADJUSTMENT 100 DOLLAR $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00

TOWNSHIP OF SPRINGFIELD, BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ

BASE BID #1: ISLAND ROAD PHASE II

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID #1 $202,700.00 $228,213.13 NO BID

Fax 609-567-4750 Fax 732-308-1034 Fax 609-561-0920

Phone 609-561-4100 Phone 732-308-1113 X 206 Phone 609-561-4161 X 208

Hammonton, NJ 08037 Farmington, NJ 07727 Hammonton, NJ 08037

7503 Weymouth Road PO Box 556 PO Box 530

Arawak Paving Company Earle Co. Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc.

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS FY2023 NJDOT MUNICIPAL AID GRANT/ROAD IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM, ISLAND ROAD PHASE II

SUMMARY OF BIDS SPRINGFIELD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL IMPROVEMENTS

Bid Opening 5/17/24 @ 11AM
31368-05F & 31368-01C

FY2024 NJDOT MUNICIPAL AID GRANT/ROAD IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM, ISLAND ROAD PHASE III



.

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

TOWNSHIP OF SPRINGFIELD, BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ

Fax 609-567-4750 Fax 732-308-1034 Fax 609-561-0920

Phone 609-561-4100 Phone 732-308-1113 X 206 Phone 609-561-4161 X 208

Hammonton, NJ 08037 Farmington, NJ 07727 Hammonton, NJ 08037

7503 Weymouth Road PO Box 556 PO Box 530

Arawak Paving Company Earle Co. Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc.

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS FY2023 NJDOT MUNICIPAL AID GRANT/ROAD IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM, ISLAND ROAD PHASE II

SUMMARY OF BIDS SPRINGFIELD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL IMPROVEMENTS

Bid Opening 5/17/24 @ 11AM
31368-05F & 31368-01C

FY2024 NJDOT MUNICIPAL AID GRANT/ROAD IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM, ISLAND ROAD PHASE III

1a HMA MILLING 1.5" OR LESS 6100 SY $7.00 $42,700.00 $5.25 $32,025.00

2a HMA 12.5M64 SURFACE COURSE, 2.5" THICK 950 TONS $85.00 $80,750.00 $96.50 $91,675.00

3a BASE REPAIR (IF & WHERE DIRECTED) 600 SY $1.00 $600.00 $12.50 $7,500.00

4a HMA DRIVEWAY, 3" THICK 30 SY $55.00 $1,650.00 $50.00 $1,500.00

5a WARNING SIGN 40 SF $50.00 $2,000.00 $60.00 $2,400.00

6a REGULATORY SIGN 5 SF $50.00 $250.00 $65.00 $325.00

7a TRAFFIC STRIPES, 4" EPOXY RESIN 11,900 LF $0.50 $5,950.00 $0.50 $5,950.00

8a TRAFFIC MARKINGS , THERMOPLASTIC 50 SF $32.00 $1,600.00 $32.50 $1,625.00

9a ASPHALT PRICE ADJUSTMENT 200 DOLLAR $1.00 $200.00 $1.00 $200.00

10a FUEL PRICE ADJUSTMENT 100 DOLLAR $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID #1 & #2 $338,500.00 $371,513.13 NO BID

BASE BID #2: ISLAND ROAD PHASE III

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID #2 $135,800.00 $143,300.00 NO BID



.

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

TOWNSHIP OF SPRINGFIELD, BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ

Fax 609-567-4750 Fax 732-308-1034 Fax 609-561-0920

Phone 609-561-4100 Phone 732-308-1113 X 206 Phone 609-561-4161 X 208

Hammonton, NJ 08037 Farmington, NJ 07727 Hammonton, NJ 08037

7503 Weymouth Road PO Box 556 PO Box 530

Arawak Paving Company Earle Co. Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc.

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS FY2023 NJDOT MUNICIPAL AID GRANT/ROAD IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM, ISLAND ROAD PHASE II

SUMMARY OF BIDS SPRINGFIELD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL IMPROVEMENTS

Bid Opening 5/17/24 @ 11AM
31368-05F & 31368-01C

FY2024 NJDOT MUNICIPAL AID GRANT/ROAD IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM, ISLAND ROAD PHASE III

19 REMOVAL OF PAVEMENT 1250 SY $4.50 $5,625.00 $17.50 $21,875.00

20 BORROW EXCAVATION 100 CY $1.00 $100.00 $45.00 $4,500.00

21 8" FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION 4,280 SY $33.00 $141,240.00 $30.00 $128,400.00

22 REMOVE ACCESSIBLE PARKING STRIPING 1 LS $562.75 $562.75 $591.60 $591.60

23 HMA 9.5M64 SURFACE COURSE, 3" THICK 770 TON $110.00 $84,700.00 $109.25 $84,122.50

24 CONCRETE VERTICAL CURB 248 LF $50.00 $12,400.00 $40.00 $9,920.00

25 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK 175 SY $140.00 $24,500.00 $125.00 $21,875.00

26 DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE 3 SY $450.00 $1,350.00 $300.00 $900.00

27 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY APRON, 6" THICK 10 SY $160.00 $1,600.00 $160.00 $1,600.00

28 YARD DRAIN 2 UNITS $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00

29 6" PCPP IN STONE TRENCH 32 LF $100.00 $3,200.00 $95.00 $3,040.00

30 TOPSOIL & SEED 1,250 SY $5.00 $6,250.00 $12.50 $15,625.00

31 REMOVE & REPLACE TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGN 24 UNITS $220.00 $5,280.00 $200.00 $4,800.00

32 TRAFFIC STRIPES, LONG-LIFE EPOXY RESIN, 4" WIDE 3,145 LF $1.65 $5,189.25 $1.50 $4,717.50

33 TRAFFIC STRIPES, LONG-LIFE EPOXY RESIN, 6" WIDE 190 LF $1.20 $228.00 $1.25 $237.50

34 TRAFFIC STRIPES, THERMOPLASTIC, 24" 55 LF $5.00 $275.00 $5.00 $275.00

35 TRAFFIC MARKINGS, THERMOPLASTIC 317 SF $7.50 $2,377.50 $7.70 $2,440.90

36 SILT FENCE 1,015 LF $1.50 $1,522.50 $2.00 $2,030.00

37 INLET FILTER TYPE 2, 4' X 4' 2 UNITS $50.00 $100.00 $25.00 $50.00

38 FUEL PRICE ADJUSTMENT 300 DOLLAR $1.00 $300.00 $1.00 $300.00

39 ASPHALT PRICE ADJUSTMENT 700 DOLLAR $1.00 $700.00 $1.00 $700.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID #3 $305,500.00 $316,000.00 NO BID

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID #1, #2 & #3 $644,000.00 $687,513.13 NO BID

BASE BID #3: SPRINGFIELD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL IMPROVEMENTS
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

TOWNSHIP OF SPRINGFIELD, BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ

Fax 609-567-4750 Fax 732-308-1034 Fax 609-561-0920

Phone 609-561-4100 Phone 732-308-1113 X 206 Phone 609-561-4161 X 208

Hammonton, NJ 08037 Farmington, NJ 07727 Hammonton, NJ 08037

7503 Weymouth Road PO Box 556 PO Box 530

Arawak Paving Company Earle Co. Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc.

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS FY2023 NJDOT MUNICIPAL AID GRANT/ROAD IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM, ISLAND ROAD PHASE II

SUMMARY OF BIDS SPRINGFIELD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL IMPROVEMENTS

Bid Opening 5/17/24 @ 11AM
31368-05F & 31368-01C

FY2024 NJDOT MUNICIPAL AID GRANT/ROAD IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM, ISLAND ROAD PHASE III

A1 TANGENT GUIDE RAIL TERMINAL 2 UNITS $4,700.00 $9,400.00 $3,950.00 $7,900.00

A2 NONVEGETATIVE SURFACE, POROUS HMA, 4" THICK 115 SY $50.00 $5,750.00 $80.00 $9,200.00

A3 BEAM GUIDE RAIL 125 LF $50.00 $6,250.00 $56.00 $7,000.00

B1 42" HDPE PIPE 140 LF $325.00 $45,500.00 $255.00 $35,700.00

B2 10' X 10' DRAINAGE STRUCTURE 1 Unit $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $37,100.00 $37,100.00

B3 INLET TYPE E 2 Units $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00

B4 CONCRET HEADWALL, 14' WIDTH 1 Unit $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $34,000.00 $34,000.00

B5 RIVER ROCK, D50=4" WIDTH FILTER FABRIC 5 C.Y. $900.00 $4,500.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00

B6 I-5 SOIL AGGREGATE 300 C.Y. $1.00 $300.00 $64.00 $19,200.00

B7 TOPSOIL & SEED 250 S.Y $12.00 $3,000.00 $10.00 $2,500.00

B8 REMOVE 14" TREE (IF & WHERE DIRECTED) 1 Unit $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID #1, #2, #3, ALTERNATE BID #1 & ALTERNATE BID NO.2
$816,400.00 $864,213.13 NO BID

$151,000.00 $152,600.00 NO BID

ALTERNATE BID #2: 155 WARNER ROAD

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #2

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID #1, #2, #3 & ALTERNATE BID #1 $665,400.00 $711,613.13 NO BID

ALTERNATE BID #1: 146 FOLWELL STATION ROAD

TOTAL AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID #1 $21,400.00 $24,100.00 NO BID


	Bid Summary

