
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNITAMOUNTUNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

BASE BID

1 Pump Station Improvements, Complete 1 LS $365,390.00 $365,390.00 $347,600.00 $347,600.00 $364,900.00 $364,900.00 $378,750.00 $378,750.00

2 Allowance (If and Where Directed) 1 LS $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 06/12/2024 @ 11:00 AM

C. Stevenson & Son, Inc. TKT Construction Co., Inc.

Maine Trail Pump Station Improvements Project

Township of Medford

Sovereign Consulting, Inc. Engineer's Estimate

$380,390.00 $362,600.00 $379,900.00 $393,750.00

Williamstown, NJ 08094Edgewater Park, NJ 08010

1228 Fawn Drive

P: 609-433-9849

Robbinsville, NJ 08691

950 Mount Holly Road 111-A North Gold Drive

Burlington County, New Jersey

25001 23 - 2021

P: 609-871-1666 P: 856-728-9229

F: N/A F: 856-728-9299 F: 609-259-8288



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

1 Pump Station Improvements, Complete 1 LS

2 Allowance (If and Where Directed) 1 LS

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 06/12/2024 @ 11:00 AM

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

$378,900.00 $378,900.00 $423,957.00 $423,957.00 $425,000.00 $425,000.00 $442,000.00 $442,000.00

$15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

Sub-Level Installations, Inc. MBE Mark IIIMunicipal Maintenance Co.
Coastline Excavating & Site 

Services, LLC

$440,000.00 $457,000.00$393,900.00 $438,957.00

P: 609-513-0195 P: 856-986-8363

F: 609-257-6059 F: N/A

Maine Trail Pump Station Improvements Project

Township of Medford

Burlington County, New Jersey

25001 23 - 2021

Mount Laurel, NJ 08054 Madison, NJ 07940Southampton, NJ 08088

P.O. Box 698 213 Main Street1352 Taylors Lane 37 Indian Trail

Cinnaminson, NJ 08077

F: 973-377-7840F: 856-786-0642

P: 856-786-9434 P: 973-377-9240



NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

BASE BID

1 Pump Station Improvements, Complete 1 LS

2 Allowance (If and Where Directed) 1 LS

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 06/12/2024 @ 11:00 AM

Vineland, NJ 08360-1593

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

P.O. Box 68 3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700

2860 S. State Highway, 

Suite 160 #501

Construct Connect
South State, Inc. General 

Contractors

NO BID RECEIVED

3539 N Mill Road

F: N/A F: 1-866-570-8187

P: 856-692-5196

F: 856-692-0660

Maine Trail Pump Station Improvements Project

Township of Medford

Burlington County, New Jersey

25001 23 - 2021

Level-1 Construction, Inc.

980 Coles Mill Road 

Grand Prarie, TXCincinnati, OH 45209Bridgeton, NJ 08302

75052-7361

Dodge Data & AnalyticsScalfo Electric, Inc. 

P: 856-629-0485

F: 856-629-0486

NO BID RECEIVED

Williamstown, NJ 08094

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED

P: 609-381-0694 P: 800-364-2059 P: 844-326-3826


