
Zurbrugg Waterfront Seawall Project    
Township of Delanco   

Burlington County, New Jersey    
39003 02  

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT
BASE BID

1 Vinyl Sheet Pile 420 LF $1,000.00 $420,000.00 $650.00 $273,000.00 $670.00 $281,400.00 $673.00 $282,660.00
2 Aluminum Sheet Pile 60 LF $1,400.00 $84,000.00 $700.00 $42,000.00 $850.00 $51,000.00 $1,000.00 $60,000.00
3 Concrete Cap 480 LF $200.00 $96,000.00 $150.00 $72,000.00 $90.00 $43,200.00 $300.00 $144,000.00
4 8" Pressure Treated Timber Pile 68 UN $1,000.00 $68,000.00 $120.00 $8,160.00 $450.00 $30,600.00 $750.00 $51,000.00
5 8" Pressure Treated Deadmen Timber Pile 54 UN $1,000.00 $54,000.00 $100.00 $5,400.00 $450.00 $24,300.00 $1,200.00 $64,800.00
6 10" Vinyl Coated Timber Pile (If and Where Directed) 1 UN $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $250.00 $250.00 $900.00 $900.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
7 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 285 SY $85.00 $24,225.00 $175.00 $49,875.00 $105.00 $29,925.00 $110.00 $31,350.00
8 15" x 15" Yard Drain 5 UN $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $750.00 $3,750.00
9 6" Check Valve 5 UN $100.00 $500.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $250.00 $1,250.00
10 6" Sch. 40 PVC Pipe 50 LF $40.00 $2,000.00 $10.00 $500.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $40.00 $2,000.00
11 Select Backfill 500 CY $80.00 $40,000.00 $50.00 $25,000.00 $60.00 $30,000.00 $48.00 $24,000.00
12 Topsoil and Sod 400 SY $20.00 $8,000.00 $5.00 $2,000.00 $35.00 $14,000.00 $35.00 $14,000.00
13 Remove Tree, 8" Diameter or Greater 10 UN $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $3,000.00 $30,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00
14 Vibration Monitoring 1 LS $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $100.00 $100.00 $9,807.00 $9,807.00
15 Allowance (If and Where Directed) 1 LS $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
16 Remove 32" Buttonwood (Sycamore) Tree 1 UN $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

Medford Lakes, NJ 08055
Cookstown, NJ 08511

$857,725.00 $549,435.00 $584,425.00 $707,117.00

F: 609-801-2533 F: 848-997-1230 F: 732-263-9472
P: 609-535-5367 P: 848-525-1201 P: 732-263-9400

West End, NJ 07740
PO Box 2046 3 Hance Drive 195 Brighton Ave.

Vulcan Construction Group, 
Inc. Marbro General Contractor

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 5/1/2024 @ 10:00 AM

Engineer's Estimate Capela Construction, Inc.



   

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
BASE BID

1 Vinyl Sheet Pile 420 LF
2 Aluminum Sheet Pile 60 LF
3 Concrete Cap 480 LF
4 8" Pressure Treated Timber Pile 68 UN
5 8" Pressure Treated Deadmen Timber Pile 54 UN
6 10" Vinyl Coated Timber Pile (If and Where Directed) 1 UN
7 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 285 SY
8 15" x 15" Yard Drain 5 UN
9 6" Check Valve 5 UN
10 6" Sch. 40 PVC Pipe 50 LF
11 Select Backfill 500 CY
12 Topsoil and Sod 400 SY
13 Remove Tree, 8" Diameter or Greater 10 UN
14 Vibration Monitoring 1 LS
15 Allowance (If and Where Directed) 1 LS
16 Remove 32" Buttonwood (Sycamore) Tree 1 UN

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 5/1/2024 @ 10:00 AM

Zurbrugg Waterfront Seawall Project    
Township of Delanco   

Burlington County, New Jersey    
39003 02  

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

$650.00 $273,000.00 $1,000.00 $420,000.00 $680.00 $285,600.00 $1,000.00 $420,000.00
$950.00 $57,000.00 $1,500.00 $90,000.00 $860.00 $51,600.00 $1,100.00 $66,000.00
$330.00 $158,400.00 $250.00 $120,000.00 $405.00 $194,400.00 $165.00 $79,200.00
$400.00 $27,200.00 $400.00 $27,200.00 $840.00 $57,120.00 $1,020.00 $69,360.00
$350.00 $18,900.00 $400.00 $21,600.00 $715.00 $38,610.00 $900.00 $48,600.00

$1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,064.00 $1,064.00 $6,425.00 $6,425.00
$200.00 $57,000.00 $90.00 $25,650.00 $200.00 $57,000.00 $147.00 $41,895.00

$3,000.00 $15,000.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $2,800.00 $14,000.00 $1,480.00 $7,400.00
$2,000.00 $10,000.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $1,140.00 $5,700.00 $480.00 $2,400.00

$300.00 $15,000.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $350.00 $17,500.00 $48.00 $2,400.00
$100.00 $50,000.00 $30.00 $15,000.00 $30.00 $15,000.00 $99.00 $49,500.00

$50.00 $20,000.00 $10.00 $4,000.00 $32.00 $12,800.00 $99.00 $39,600.00
$1,200.00 $12,000.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $1,575.00 $15,750.00 $1,735.00 $17,350.00

$15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

$761,950.00

Ocean View, NJ 08230
Cape May Court House, 

NJ 08210
PO Box 430

Pilesgrove, NJ 08098

$795,744.00 $863,630.00$750,000.00

F: 609-624-8703 F: 609-861-5839 F: 856-769-5630 F: 732-223-2460
P: 609-861-5955 P: 856-769-8244 P: 732-433-6699P: 609-624-8702

Barnegat, NJ 08005Ocean View Road
371 N. Main St.414 Woodbine 18 Hoffman Drive 426 Swedesboro Rd.

Walters Marine 
Construction, Inc. R.A. Walters & Sons, Inc. R.E. Pierson Construction 

Co., Inc.
Midlantic Construction, 

LLC



   

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
BASE BID

1 Vinyl Sheet Pile 420 LF
2 Aluminum Sheet Pile 60 LF
3 Concrete Cap 480 LF
4 8" Pressure Treated Timber Pile 68 UN
5 8" Pressure Treated Deadmen Timber Pile 54 UN
6 10" Vinyl Coated Timber Pile (If and Where Directed) 1 UN
7 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 285 SY
8 15" x 15" Yard Drain 5 UN
9 6" Check Valve 5 UN
10 6" Sch. 40 PVC Pipe 50 LF
11 Select Backfill 500 CY
12 Topsoil and Sod 400 SY
13 Remove Tree, 8" Diameter or Greater 10 UN
14 Vibration Monitoring 1 LS
15 Allowance (If and Where Directed) 1 LS
16 Remove 32" Buttonwood (Sycamore) Tree 1 UN

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 5/1/2024 @ 10:00 AM

Zurbrugg Waterfront Seawall Project    
Township of Delanco   

Burlington County, New Jersey    
39003 02  

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

$500.00 $210,000.00 $1,080.00 $453,600.00
$650.00 $39,000.00 $950.00 $57,000.00
$230.00 $110,400.00 $650.00 $312,000.00

$3,000.00 $204,000.00 $1,300.00 $88,400.00
$4,600.00 $248,400.00 $2,900.00 $156,600.00
$7,000.00 $7,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

$300.00 $85,500.00 $125.00 $35,625.00
$5,000.00 $25,000.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00

$500.00 $2,500.00 $700.00 $3,500.00
$50.00 $2,500.00 $70.00 $3,500.00

$100.00 $50,000.00 $40.00 $20,000.00
$50.00 $20,000.00 $25.00 $10,000.00

$2,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00
$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

$4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00
$1,088,300.00 $1,213,725.00 NO BID NO BID

F: N/A F: N/AF: 609-624-0957 F: N/A
P: 609-221-4533P: 609-624-9090 P: 609-381-0694 P: 609-927-6660 x 18

Clermont, NJ 08210 Bridgeton, NJ 08302 Egg Harbor, NJ 08234 Mullica Hill, NJ 08062
1030 Route 83 PO Box 68 3031 Ocean Heights Ave. 4 Lange Court

Agate Construction South State, Inc. General 
Contractors Arthur R. Henry, Inc. Gemini General Contracting, 

LLC



   

NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
BASE BID

1 Vinyl Sheet Pile 420 LF
2 Aluminum Sheet Pile 60 LF
3 Concrete Cap 480 LF
4 8" Pressure Treated Timber Pile 68 UN
5 8" Pressure Treated Deadmen Timber Pile 54 UN
6 10" Vinyl Coated Timber Pile (If and Where Directed) 1 UN
7 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick 285 SY
8 15" x 15" Yard Drain 5 UN
9 6" Check Valve 5 UN
10 6" Sch. 40 PVC Pipe 50 LF
11 Select Backfill 500 CY
12 Topsoil and Sod 400 SY
13 Remove Tree, 8" Diameter or Greater 10 UN
14 Vibration Monitoring 1 LS
15 Allowance (If and Where Directed) 1 LS
16 Remove 32" Buttonwood (Sycamore) Tree 1 UN

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE 

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC.
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 5/1/2024 @ 10:00 AM

Zurbrugg Waterfront Seawall Project
Township of Delanco

Burlington County, New Jersey
39003 02

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Paterson, NJ 07503
Hamilton, NJ 08691

F: 973-782-5958 F: 609-586-0356 F: 856-232-1243 F: 1-866-570-8187
P: 973-925-4021 P: 609-586-5005 x 130 P: 856-232-0400 P: 800-364-2059

Barnsboro Rd. Cincinatti, OH 45209
Blackwood, NJ 08012

1 AAA Drive, Bldg. 1-B 228 Blackwood- 3825 Edwards Road110 Pennsylvania Ave.

JPC Group, Inc. Construct ConnectGrade Construction IEW Construction Group


	Bid Summary

