ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
Bid Summary - UNOFFICIAL
Bid Opening 06/06/24 at 10:00 AM

BROAD STREET TANK REHABILITATION PROJECT

BURLINGTON CITY, NEW JERSEY
40353 22

BROAD STREET TANK REHABILITATION PROJECT

BURLINGTON CITY, NEW JERSEY
40353 22

ENVIRONMENTAL
RESOLUTIONS, INC.

Emgiasers - Flaamars - Sosnliel © Sarvemor

Engineer's Estimate

Dynamic Sand Blasting and
Painting, LLC

United Painters Inc.

Allied Construction Group

Inc.

Brave Industrial Paint, LLC

US Tank Painting, Inc

615 Hope Road, Bldg. #2, 2nd Floor
Eastontown, NJ 07724

P: 732-344-2969
F: 732-344-2970

70 Church Street
Flemington, NJ 08822

P: 908-323-8026

100 N Black Horse Pike, Suite 200 b
Williamstown, NJ 08094

P: 856-429-3400
F: 856-429-0696

117 EImwood Avenue

Long Branch, NJ 07740

P: 732-483-6403
F: 848-303-8660

900 Rike Drive
Millstone, NJ 08535

P: 609-448-2444
F: 609-448-9444

NO | DESCRIPTION | Qry  [UNIT][ UNITPR. || AMOUNT UNITPR. || AMOUNT || UNITPR. || AMOUNT || UNITPR. | AMOUNT | UNITPR. [ AMOUNT [ UNITPR. | AMOUNT
BASE BID -Broad Street Tank Rehabilation Project

1 [Mobilization 1|Ls $5,000.00 $5,000.00[ $40,000.00| $40,000.00[ $30,000.00{ $30,000.00| $38,000.00[ $38,000.00 $60,000.00| $60,000.00[ $60,000.00| $60,000.00
2 |Drain, Isolate, and Clean Tank 1|LS $8,000.00 $8,000.00[  $1,000.00{  $1,000.00  $1,000.00| $1,000.00] $2,500.00[  $2,500.00] $15,000.00| $15,000.00  $5,000.00| $5,000.00
3 |Foundation Repairs 1|LS $4,000.00 $4,000.00(  $1,000.00{  $1,000.00]  $5,000.00| $5,000.00] $1,800.00|  $1,800.00] $15,000.00| $15,000.00  $5,000.00| $5,000.00
4 |Tank Grounding 1|LS $4,500.00 $4,500.00[  $1,000.00|  $1,000.00] $2,000.00|  $2,000.00] $2,500.00|  $2,500.00|  $5,000.00|  $5,000.00]  $5,000.00|  $5,000.00
5  |Ladder Improvements 1|LS $10,000.00/  $10,000.00[  $3,000.00|  $3,000.00  $2,500.00|  $2,500.00  $3,800.00|  $3,800.00| $20,000.00( $20,000.00  $8,000.00| $8,000.00
6 |Roof Vent 1|LS $10,000.00/  $10,000.00f  $3,000.00|  $3,000.00  $6,000.00|  $6,000.00]  $8,500.00|  $8,500.00| $20,000.00| $20,000.00 $10,000.00| $10,000.00
7 |Access Hatch Modifications 1|LS $16,000.00/  $16,000.00[  $1,000.00|  $1,000.00  $5,000.00|  $5,000.00] $1,500.00|  $1,500.00] $25,000.00| $25,000.00  $6,000.00| $6,000.00
8 |Platform/Catwalk Modifications 1|LS $10,000.00/  $10,000.00[  $5,000.00|  $5,000.00  $5,000.00| $5,000.00] $3,800.00|  $3,800.00] $9,000.00|  $9,000.00  $7,700.00| $7,700.00
9  |Handrail Improvements 126|LF $317.46|  $40,000.00 $142.86| $18,000.36 $63.50|  $8,001.00 $131.00[ $16,506.00 $100.00[ $12,600.00 $50.00|  $6,300.00
10 [Install Lockable Door 1|UN $10,000.00|  $10,000.00 $500.00 $500.00  $3,000.00|  $3,000.00| $2,500.00| $2,500.00| $5,000.00| $5,000.00|  $4,000.00| $4,000.00
11 [Install Mixing System 1|LS || $110,000.00{ $110,000.00| $30,000.00| $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00| $40,000.00| $40,000.00] $65,000.00| $65,000.00| $125,000.00| $125,000.00
12 |Plate Steel (If & Where Directed) 50(SF $100.00 $5,000.00 $5.00 $250.00 $20.00|  $1,000.00 $1.00 $50.00 $200.00 $10,000.00 $100.00[  $5,000.00
13 [Overflow Improvements 1|LS $2,000.00 $2,000.00[  $3,000.00{  $3,000.00[  $3,000.00| $3,000.00] $2,500.00|  $2,500.00] $8,000.00|  $8,000.00  $5,000.00| $5,000.00
14  |Exterior Surface Preparation 1|LS || $450,000.00{ $450,000.00| $400,000.00 $400,000.00( $350,000.00| $350,000.00| $675,000.00| $675,000.00 $625,000.00| $625,000.00|| $363,000.00| $363,000.00
15 |Exterior Surface Painting 1|LS || $350,000.00{ $350,000.00| $100,000.00 $100,000.00f $150,000.00| $150,000.00| $275,000.00| $275,000.00/ $200,000.00| $200,000.00|| $140,000.00| $140,000.00
16 [Surface Preparation- Interior Dry Area 1|LS || $180,000.00| $180,000.00f $100,000.00| $100,000.00f $120,500.00| $120,500.00| $280,000.00| $280,000.00| $200,000.00| $200,000.00| $341,000.00| $341,000.00
17 |Surface Painting - Interior Dry Area 1|LS || $145,000.00{ $145,000.00| $100,000.00| $100,000.00f $100,000.00| $100,000.00| $160,000.00| $160,000.00] $50,000.00| $50,000.00| $80,000.00( $80,000.00
18 [Surface Preparation- Interior Wet Area 1|LS || $180,000.00{ $180,000.00| $500,000.00 $500,000.00( $400,000.00| $400,000.00| $238,000.00| $238,000.00 $350,000.00| $350,000.00|| $734,000.00| $734,000.00
19  [Surface Painting- Interior Wet Area 1|LS || $155,000.00{ $155,000.00| $100,000.00 $100,000.00( $200,000.00| $200,000.00| $120,000.00| $120,000.00 $130,000.00| $130,000.00|| $150,000.00| $150,000.00
20 |Miscellaneous Caulking 1|LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00[  $5,000.00|  $5,000.00] $5,000.00|  $5,000.00] $1,800.00|  $1,800.00 $25,000.00( $25,000.00 $10,000.00| $10,000.00
21 |Cathodic Protection System 1|LS $45,000.00|  $45,000.00 $30,000.00| $30,000.00] $25,000.00| $25,000.00 $38,000.00| $38,000.00] $26,000.00| $26,000.00 $38,000.00 $38,000.00
22 |Piping Improvements 1|LS $23,500.00]  $23,500.00 $10,000.00| $10,000.00] $10,000.00| $10,000.00] $12,000.00| $12,000.00| $40,000.00| $40,000.00 $10,000.00| $10,000.00
23 |Gate Valve Replacements 1|JUN ||$ 5,000.00 $5,000.00(  $3,000.00{  $3,000.00  $5,000.00| $5,000.00] $3,700.00|  $3,700.00] $ 3,000.00 |  $3,000.00 $10,000.00| $10,000.00
24 |Weir Modifications and Level Indicator 1|LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00[ $10,000.00| $10,000.00] $10,000.00| $10,000.00] $2,500.00|  $2,500.00| $10,000.00| $10,000.00/  $8,000.00|  $8,000.00
25 |Tank Disinfection, Water Testing, and Startup 1|LS $7,000.00 $7,000.00[  $1,000.00{  $1,000.00]  $1,000.00| $1,000.00] $1,800.00|  $1,800.00] $10,000.00| $10,000.00  $8,000.00| $8,000.00
26 |Lighting Improvements 1]LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00|  $5,000.00|  $5,000.00] $10,000.00| $10,000.00| $33,500.00| $33,500.00| $50,755.00] $50,755.00 $25,000.00| $25,000.00

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE

$1,790,000.00

$1,470,750.36

$1,488,001.00

$1,965,256.00

$1,989,355.00

$2,169,000.00

Mathematically Corrected Value
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
Bid Summary - UNOFFICIAL

BROAD STREET TANK REHABILITATION PROJECT

BURLINGTON CITY, NEW JERSEY

BROAD STREET TANK REHABILITATION PROJECT
BURLINGTON CITY, NEW JERSEY

Bid Opening 06/06/24 at 10:00 AM 40353 22 40353 22
Amstar of WNY, Inc. Guimar General K&K Palntlng & Utility Services Co., Inc. Construct Connect
Contractor Construction

ENVIRONMENTAL
RESOLUTIONS, INC.

Emgiavers - Planaars © Soeoticle - Sarvemom

825 Rein Road, SSPC-QP-1
Cheektowaga, NY 14225

P: 716-204-9755
F: 716-253-6601

554 Brickyard Road
Freehold, NJ 07728

P: 973-392-9280
F: 973-446-0189

1704 Joplin Street
Baltimore, MD 21224

P: 410-633-2381

535 Courtney Hodges Blvd.
Perry, GA 31069

P: 478-988-5266

3825 Edwards Road, Suite 700
Cincinatti, OH 45209

P: 800-364-2059
F: 1-866-570-8187

NO | DESCRIPTION | aQry  [uNIT| UNITPR. || AMOUNT | UNITPR. || AMOUNT || UNITPR. || AMOUNT | UNITPR. | AMOUNT | UNITPR. | AMOUNT
BASE BID -Broad Street Tank Rehabilation Project
1 |Mobilization 1|LS
2 Drain, Isolate, and Clean Tank 1[LS
3 |Foundation Repairs 1|LS
4 |Tank Grounding 1|LS
5 |Ladder Improvements 1|LS
6 |Roof Vent 1|LS
7 |Access Hatch Modifications 1|LS
8 |Platform/Catwalk Modifications 1|LS
9 |Handrail Improvements 126|LF
10 [Install Lockable Door 1|UN
11 [Install Mixing System 1|LS
12 |Plate Steel (If & Where Directed) 50|SF
13 [Overflow Improvements 1|LS
14 |Exterior Surface Preparation 1|LS
15 |Exterior Surface Painting 1|LS
16 |Surface Preparation- Interior Dry Area 1|LS
17 [Surface Painting - Interior Dry Area 1|LS
18 |Surface Preparation- Interior Wet Area 1|LS
19 [Surface Painting- Interior Wet Area 1|LS
20 |Miscellaneous Caulking 1|LS
21 |Cathodic Protection System 1|LS
22 |Piping Improvements 1|LS
23 |Gate Valve Replacements 1|UN
24 |Weir Modifications and Level Indicator 1|LS
25 |Tank Disinfection, Water Testing, and Startup 1|LS
26 |Lighting Improvements 1|LS

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Mathematically Corrected Value
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