
NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

1.1 Install Sign (If & Where Directed) 5.0 UN $150.00 $750.00 $30.00 $150.00 $100.00 $500.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $500.00 $2,500.00
1.2 Remove Exsisting Fence, Complete 1.0 LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $18,400.00 $18,400.00
1.3 Install Chain-link Fence, 8' High, Complete 720.0 LF $60.00 $43,200.00 $38.00 $27,360.00 $90.00 $64,800.00 $85.00 $61,200.00 $89.20 $64,224.00
1.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 2.0 UN $1,250.00 $2,500.00 $575.00 $1,150.00 $250.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $1,710.00 $3,420.00
1.5 Install Maintenance Gate, 12' Wide, Complete 4.0 UN $3,500.00 $14,000.00 $1,075.00 $4,300.00 $600.00 $2,400.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,355.00 $13,420.00
1.6 Remove Tree (If & Where Directed) 5.0 UN $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,750.00 $8,750.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,989.00 $19,945.00
1.7 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
1.8 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -

$121,909.00

2.1 Install Sign (If & Where Directed) 6.0 UN $150.00 $900.00 $30.00 $180.00 $100.00 $600.00 $500.00 $3,000.00 $500.00 $3,000.00
2.2 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
2.3 Install  Chainlink Fence, 6' High, Complete 370.0 LF $55.00 $20,350.00 $38.00 $14,060.00 $104.00 $38,480.00 $65.13 $24,098.10 $89.10 $32,967.00
2.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $575.00 $575.00 $200.00 $200.00 $501.90 $501.90 $1,747.00 $1,747.00
2.5 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
2.6 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
2.7 Install Slide Gate, 55' Wide, Complete 2.0 UN $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $700.00 $1,400.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $13,175.00 $26,350.00
2.8 Install 4" Thick Concrete Runner 168.0 SF $25.00 $4,200.00 $10.00 $1,680.00 $15.50 $2,604.00 $50.00 $8,400.00 $265.00 $44,520.00

$108,584.00

3.1 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
3.2 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
3.3 Install Chain-link Fence, 6' High , Complete 180.0 LF $55.00 $9,900.00 $38.00 $6,840.00 $65.20 $11,736.00 $65.00 $11,700.00 $98.25 $17,685.00
3.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $575.00 $575.00 $200.00 $200.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,747.00 $1,747.00
3.5 Install Maintenance Gate, 10' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $975.00 $975.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,199.00 $3,199.00
3.6 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
3.7 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
3.8 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -

$22,631.00

4.1 Install Sign (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UN $150.00 $150.00 $30.00 $30.00 $100.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00
4.2 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
4.3 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
4.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $975.00 $975.00 $200.00 $200.00 $500.00 $500.00 $2,154.00 $2,154.00
4.5 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
4.6 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
4.7 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -
4.8 Reserved - - - - - - - - - - - -

mathematically corrected value

$2,654.00

$36,700.00

$14,150.00

$1,400.00

$125,200.00

Engoneer's Estimate

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID $72,800.00 $134,720.00 $143,400.00 $255,778.00
SUBTOTAL: Recycling Yard $1,005.00 $300.00 $1,500.00

BASE BID - Recycling Yard
SUBTOTAL:  Mechanic Street Lot $8,390.00 $12,436.00 $13,200.00

BASE BID - Mechanic Street Lot 
SUBTOTAL: Sewer Treatment Plant $17,895.00 $44,284.00 $50,000.00

BASE BID - Sewer Treatment Plant
$72,950.00SUBTOTAL :Water Treatment Plant $45,510.00 $77,700.00 $78,700.00

F: 609-561-2779 F: 973-340-3935 F: 1-866-570-8187 F: 610-685-4430

BASE BID - Water Treatment Plant

P: 609-561-7597 P: 201-655-0243 P: 973-342-1742 P: 610-685-4300 x 100

453 Middle Rd 417 Crooks Avenue 318 McLean Blvd., Unit 4 2621 Centre Avenue
Hammonton, NJ 08037 Clifton, NJ 07011 Paterson, NJ 07504 Reading, PA 19605

All Vinyl Fencing, LLC Fox Fence Senco Metals, LLC Pro Max Fence Systems

BID OPENING: 03/05/2024 AT 11:45 AM BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ
40008 07-23

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

1.1 Install Sign (If & Where Directed) 5.0 UN
1.2 Remove Exsisting Fence, Complete 1.0 LS
1.3 Install Chain-link Fence, 8' High, Complete 720.0 LF
1.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 2.0 UN
1.5 Install Maintenance Gate, 12' Wide, Complete 4.0 UN
1.6 Remove Tree (If & Where Directed) 5.0 UN
1.7 Reserved - -
1.8 Reserved - -

2.1 Install Sign (If & Where Directed) 6.0 UN
2.2 Reserved - -
2.3 Install  Chainlink Fence, 6' High, Complete 370.0 LF
2.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN
2.5 Reserved - -
2.6 Reserved - -
2.7 Install Slide Gate, 55' Wide, Complete 2.0 UN
2.8 Install 4" Thick Concrete Runner 168.0 SF

3.1 Reserved - -
3.2 Reserved - -
3.3 Install Chain-link Fence, 6' High , Complete 180.0 LF
3.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN
3.5 Install Maintenance Gate, 10' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN
3.6 Reserved - -
3.7 Reserved - -
3.8 Reserved - -

4.1 Install Sign (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UN
4.2 Reserved - -
4.3 Reserved - -
4.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN
4.5 Reserved - -
4.6 Reserved - -
4.7 Reserved - -
4.8 Reserved - -

mathematically corrected value

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID
SUBTOTAL: Recycling Yard 

BASE BID - Recycling Yard
SUBTOTAL:  Mechanic Street Lot 

BASE BID - Mechanic Street Lot 
SUBTOTAL: Sewer Treatment Plant 

BASE BID - Sewer Treatment Plant
SUBTOTAL :Water Treatment Plant 

BASE BID - Water Treatment Plant

BID OPENING: 03/05/2024 AT 11:45 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

$100.00 $500.00 $250.00 $1,250.00
$15,000.00 $15,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

$125.00 $90,000.00 $73.00 $52,560.00
$1,000.00 $2,000.00 $950.00 $1,900.00
$4,000.00 $16,000.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00
$1,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,150.00 $15,750.00

- - - -
- - - -

$100.00 $600.00 $250.00 $1,500.00
- - - -

$110.00 $40,700.00 $68.00 $25,160.00
$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $870.00 $870.00

- - - -
- - - -

$29,000.00 $58,000.00 $10,200.00 $20,400.00
$95.00 $15,960.00 $4,800.00 $806,400.00

- - - -
- - - -
$115.00 $20,700.00 $68.00 $12,240.00

$2,000.00 $2,000.00 $870.00 $870.00
$14,000.00 $14,000.00 $1,440.00 $1,440.00

- - - -
- - - -
- - - -

$1,000.00 $1,000.00 $250.00 $250.00
- - - -
- - - -

$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00
- - - -
- - - -
- - - -
- - - -

$950,690.00

C. Stevenson & Son, Inc.

$80,460.00

$854,330.00

$14,550.00

$1,350.00

950 Mount Holly Road
Edgewater Park, NJ 08010

P: 609-871-1666

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED$291,460.00 NO BID RECEIVED
$6,000.00

$36,700.00

$120,260.00

$128,500.00

F: 609-387-0277 F:973-782-4823 F: 856-832-4681
P: 732-773-9716 P: 609-387-4050 P: 973-772-2593 x 102 P: 856-832-4680

156 Grand Central Parkway
Bayville, NJ 08721 Burlington, NJ 08016 Paterson, NJ 07503 Mt. Royal, NJ 08061

1106-A Jacksonville Road 100 Pennsylvania Avenue 125 King Highway
Construction Group, Inc. Hardscaping

Harris Fence, Corp. Challenger Fence Think PaversTC Landscape 
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NO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

1.1 Install Sign (If & Where Directed) 5.0 UN
1.2 Remove Exsisting Fence, Complete 1.0 LS
1.3 Install Chain-link Fence, 8' High, Complete 720.0 LF
1.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 2.0 UN
1.5 Install Maintenance Gate, 12' Wide, Complete 4.0 UN
1.6 Remove Tree (If & Where Directed) 5.0 UN
1.7 Reserved - -
1.8 Reserved - -

2.1 Install Sign (If & Where Directed) 6.0 UN
2.2 Reserved - -
2.3 Install  Chainlink Fence, 6' High, Complete 370.0 LF
2.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN
2.5 Reserved - -
2.6 Reserved - -
2.7 Install Slide Gate, 55' Wide, Complete 2.0 UN
2.8 Install 4" Thick Concrete Runner 168.0 SF

3.1 Reserved - -
3.2 Reserved - -
3.3 Install Chain-link Fence, 6' High , Complete 180.0 LF
3.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN
3.5 Install Maintenance Gate, 10' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN
3.6 Reserved - -
3.7 Reserved - -
3.8 Reserved - -

4.1 Install Sign (If & Where Directed) 1.0 UN
4.2 Reserved - -
4.3 Reserved - -
4.4 Install Access Gate, 4' Wide, Complete 1.0 UN
4.5 Reserved - -
4.6 Reserved - -
4.7 Reserved - -
4.8 Reserved - -

mathematically corrected value

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID
SUBTOTAL: Recycling Yard 

BASE BID - Recycling Yard
SUBTOTAL:  Mechanic Street Lot 

BASE BID - Mechanic Street Lot 
SUBTOTAL: Sewer Treatment Plant 

BASE BID - Sewer Treatment Plant
SUBTOTAL :Water Treatment Plant 

BASE BID - Water Treatment Plant

BID OPENING: 03/05/2024 AT 11:45 AM

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT UNIT PR. AMOUNT

NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVED NO BID RECEIVEDNO BID RECEIVED

F: 609-543-2335F:973-546-8110 F:856-432-1449
P: 973-546-4373 P:609-221-0729 856-986-8363 P: 609-839-3258

220 Vine Street296 Route 46 East PO Box 838 37 Indian Trail
Elmwood Park, NJ 07407 Sewell, NJ 08080 Southampton, NJ 08088 Hammonton, NJ 08037

EB FenceAmerican Fence Company Township Fence Coastline Excavating & 
Site Services, LLC

FENCING IMPROVEMENTS
CITY OF BURLINGTON
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