ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 11/14/2023 at 11:00am

2024 PUBLIC WORKS ON CALL CONTRACTOR FOR MISCELLANEOUS RECONSTRUCTION
TOWNSHIP OF MEDFORD
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25972 30

Coastline Excavating &
Site Services, LLC

River Front, LLC

Waters & Bugbee General
Contractors

CTX Infrastructure

37 Indian Trail
Southampton, NJ 08088

P: 856-986-8363

20 Maple Avenue
Lumberton, NJ 08048

P: 609-267-4110
F: 609-267-8906

75 South Gold Drive
Hamilton, NJ 08691

P: 609-584-1100
F: 609-584-2200

PO Box 793
Hammonton, NJ 08037

P: 609-270-7233
F: 609-270-7468

NO DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY [UNIT| UNIT PR. | AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT ([ UNIT PR. | AMOUNT
Miscellaneous Concrete
1 4" Concrete Sidewalk 16| SF $35.00 $560.00 $44.71 $715.36 $28.00 $448.00 $30.00 $480.00
2 6" Concrete Apron/Sidewalk 40 SF $55.00 $2,200.00 $76.63 $3,065.20 $30.00 $1,200.00 $35.00 $1,400.00
3 6"x8"x18" Concrete Curb 20l LF $65.00 $1,300.00 $65.48 $1,309.60 $75.00 $1,500.00 $75.00 $1,500.00
4 ADA Compliant Curb Ramp 1] Unit | $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,589.75 $5,589.75 $4,250.00 $4,250.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00
5 Concrete Gutter/Roadway (8" thick) 20| SF $65.00 $1,300.00 $53.99 $1,079.80 $65.00 $1,300.00 $65.00 $1,300.00
6 Concrete Roadway (8" thick) 20| SF $85.00 $1,700.00 $175.20 $3,504.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $1,000.00
Miscellaneous Paving
7 Milling, 2" Thick (<2,000 SY) 1,000 SY $7.00 $7,000.00 $10.33 $10,330.00 $11.00 $11,000.00 $13.00 $13,000.00
8 Milling, 2" Thick (>2,000 SY) 2,500] SY $8.00 $20,000.00 $12.22 $30,550.00 $11.00 $27,500.00 $11.00 $27,500.00
9 Milling, 6" Thick (<2,000 SY) 1,000 SY $9.00 $9,000.00 $11.87 $11,870.00 $16.00 $16,000.00 $16.00 $16,000.00
10 Milling, 6" Thick (>2,000 SY) 2,500] SY $12.00 $30,000.00 $20.29 $50,725.00 $14.00 $35,000.00 $14.00 $35,000.00
11 |IMA9.5M64 Surface Course, installed without 10] TN | $200.00 | $2,000.00 || $109.24 | $1,00240 || $215.00 | $2,150.00 || $215.00 | $2,150.00
Paver, Tamped or Rolled (<20 tons)
HMA 9.5M64 Surface Course, installed by Paver to
12 include Tack Coat, Rolling of Asphalt (20 to 200 tons) 50 TN $130.00 $6,500.00 $110.92 $5,546.00 $285.00 $14,250.00 $280.00 $14,000.00
HMA 9.5M64 Surface Course, installed by Paver to
13 include Tack Coat, Rolling of Asphalt (200 tons) 2501 TN $145.00 $36,250.00 $155.78 $38,945.00 $200.00 $50,000.00 $195.00 $48,750.00
14 |HMA 19M64 Base Course, installed without Paver, 10/ TN | $20000 | $2,000.00 | $311.08 | $3.110.80 || $305.00 | $3,050.00 | $300.00 | $3,000.00
Tamped or Rolled (<20 tons)
HMA 19M64 Base Course, installed by Paver to
15 include Rolling of Asphalt (20 to 200 tons) 501 TN $130.00 $6,500.00 $198.43 $9,921.50 $205.00 $10,250.00 $200.00 $10,000.00
HMA 19M64 Base Course, installed by Paver to
16 include Rolling of Asphalt (>200 tons) 2501 TN $145.00 $36,250.00 $145.93 $36,482.50 $155.00 $38,750.00 $150.00 $37,500.00
17 Bituminous Cold Patch 10 TN $150.00 $1,500.00 $180.82 $1,808.20 $105.00 $1,050.00 $100.00 $1,000.00
Miscellaneous Earthwork and Site Restoration
18 |Roadway Excavation, Unclassified includes General 200 ¢y | $5000 | $1,000.00 | $36.89 $737.80 || $100.00 | $2,000.00 | $100.00 | $2,000.00
Excavation
19 Quarry Blend 10 CY $65.00 $650.00 $64.35 $643.50 $65.00 $650.00 $65.00 $650.00
Select Borrow (clean, organic free, granular material
20 to be used for roadway subgrade and/or pipe trench 10{ CY $60.00 $600.00 $134.73 $1,347.30 $60.00 $600.00 $60.00 $600.00
backfill) NJDOT mixes I-2, I-5 (gravel), 1-6, I-7, or I-8
21 Portland Cement Concrete Fill 5] CY $200.00 $1,000.00 $275.33 $1,376.65 $200.00 $1,000.00 $200.00 $1,000.00
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 11/14/2023 at 11:00am

2024 PUBLIC WORKS ON CALL CONTRACTOR FOR MISCELLANEOUS RECONSTRUCTION

TOWNSHIP OF MEDFORD

BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25972 30

Coastline Excavating &
Site Services, LLC

River Front, LLC

Waters & Bugbee General
Contractors

CTX Infrastructure

37 Indian Trail
Southampton, NJ 08088

P: 856-986-8363

20 Maple Avenue
Lumberton, NJ 08048

P: 609-267-4110
F: 609-267-8906

75 South Gold Drive
Hamilton, NJ 08691

P: 609-584-1100
F: 609-584-2200

PO Box 793
Hammonton, NJ 08037

P: 609-270-7233
F: 609-270-7468

22 |Crushed Stone 3/8" to 172" 1| ™~ | $70.00 $70.00 $45.91 $45.91 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
23 |4" Topsoil and Sod 2] sy | $30.00 $600.00 $11.31 $226.20 $45.00 $900.00 $45.00 $900.00
24 |4" Topsoil and Seed 2] sy | s15.00 $300.00 $6.84 $136.80 $30.00 $600.00 $30.00 $600.00
25  |Remove Tree 1| Unit | $2,500.00 | $2,500.00 || $1,848.66 | $1,848.66 | $1,500.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,500.00
26 |Plant Tree 1| unit| $500.00 | $500.00 | $1,232.45 | $1,232.45 | $1,000.00 | $1,000.00 | $1,000.00 | $1,000.00
Storm and Sanitary Sewer Structures
27 |Reset Type "B" Inlet Frame and Head 1| Unit | $2,500.00 | $2,500.00 | $888.73 | $888.73 | $3.400.00 | $3400.00 | $3,200.00 | $3,200.00
28 |Replace Inlet Head and Grate 1| unit | $1,500.00 | $1,500.00 [ $2,402.03 | $2,402.03 | $4,000.00 | $4,000.00 | $3,800.00 | $3,800.00
29 |Cement Parging of Inlet Interior, 0-6' deep 1| Unit | $2,500.00 | $2,500.00 || $2,671.93 | $2,671.93 | $2,500.00 | $2,500.00 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00
30 |Reconstruction of Existing Inlet, 0-6' deep 1| Unit | $4,000.00 | $4,000.00 | $2,61031 | $2,61031 | $6,700.00 | $6,700.00 | $6,500.00 | $6,500.00
31 |Construct Type "A" Inlet, 0-6' Deep 1| Unit | $4,000.00 | $4,000.00 || $9,990.95 | $9,990.95 | $6,400.00 | $6,400.00 | $6,150.00 | $6,150.00
32 |Construct Type "A" Inlet, 6-10' Deep 1| Unit | $6,000.00 | $6,000.00 || $11,900.93 | $11,900.93 | $12,250.00 | $12,250.00 || $12,000.00 | $12,000.00
33 |Construct Type "B"/"E" Inlet, 0-6' Deep 1| Unit | $5,000.00 | $5,000.00 | $11,738.55 | $11,738.55 || $7,300.00 | $7,300.00 | $7,150.00 | $7,150.00
34 |Construct Type "B"/"E" Inlet, 6-10' Deep 1| Unit | $8,000.00 | $8,000.00 || $13,076.40 | $13,076.40 || $14,400.00 | $14,400.00 || $14,300.00 | $14,300.00
Miscellaneous Storm Sewer
35 [Storm Sewer Point Repair, 0-6' deep 1| Ls | $9,000.00 | $9,000.00 |/$17,089.69 | $17,089.69 || $7,700.00 | $7,700.00 | $7,500.00 | $7,500.00
36 |Storm Sewer Point Repair, 6-10' deep 1| Ls ['s15,000.00 | $15,000.00 || $17,705.90 | $17,705.90 | $15,150.00 | $15,150.00 || $15,000.00 | $15,000.00
37 |Construct 12" RCP, 0-6' deep 30| LF | s125.00 | $3,75000 || $266.00 | $7,980.00 || $155.00 | $4,650.00 || $160.00 | $4,800.00
38 |Construct 12" RCP, 6-10' deep 30| LF | $135.00 | $4,05000 || $8591 | $2,57730 || $255.00 | $7,650.00 || $260.00 | $7,800.00
39 |Construct 15" RCP, 0-6' deep 30 LF | $155.00 | $4,65000 || $81.87 | $2.456.10 | $170.00 | $5,100.00 || $175.00 | $5250.00
40 |Construct 15" RCP, 6-10' deep 30| LF | $165.00 | $4,95000 || St11.60 | $3,348.00 || $270.00 | $8,100.00 || $275.00 | $8,250.00
41 |Construct 18" RCP, 0-6' deep 30| LF | s175.00 | $5.25000 || $117.35 | $3,52050 || $180.00 | $5,400.00 || $185.00 | $5,550.00
42 |Construct 18" RCP, 6-10' deep 30| LF | s$185.00 | $5550.00 || $161.09 | $4.832.70 || $280.00 | $8,400.00 | $285.00 | $8,550.00
43 |Construct 21" RCP, 0-6' deep 30 LF | $205.00 | $6,15000 || s11727 | $3,518.10 || $190.00 | $5,700.00 || $195.00 | $5,850.00
44 |Construct 21" RCP, 6-10' deep 30| LF | s215.00 | $6,45000 || $120.15 | $3,604.50 | $290.00 | $8,700.00 | $295.00 | $8,850.00
45  |Construct 24" RCP, 0-6' deep 30 LF | $235.00 | $7,05000 || $128.65 | $3,859.50 || $200.00 | $6,000.00 || $205.00 | $6,150.00
46 |Construct 24" RCP, 6-10' deep 30| LF | s245.00 | $735000 || $131.91 | $3,95730 || $300.00 | $9,000.00 || $305.00 | $9,150.00
47 |Construct 30" RCP, 0-10' deep 30| LF | $265.00 | $7,95000 || $15822 | $4,746.60 | $210.00 | $6,300.00 || $215.00 | $6,450.00
48 |Construct 36" RCP, 0-10' deep 30| LF | $295.00 | $8,850.00 || $180.76 | $5.422.80 || $310.00 | $9,300.00 | $315.00 | $9,450.00
49 gj;;"”m 6" Perforated HDPE in Stone Trench, 0'-3 30| LF | $140.00 | $4,20000 [ $81.87 | $2.456.10 | $155.00 | $4,650.00 || $160.00 | $4,800.00
5o |Construct 12" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 30| LF | s15000 | $4,50000 || $10087 | $3,026.10 | $175.00 | $525000 | $180.00 | $5.400.00
Trench, 0'-8' deep
51 Construct 15" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 30| LF | $170.00 | $5,100.00 [ $106.35 | $3,190.50 | $195.00 | $5.850.00 || $200.00 | $6,000.00
Trench, 0'-8' deep
52 |Construct 18" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 30| LF | $20000 | $600000 || $10039 | $3.281.70 | $215.00 | $645000 | $220.00 | $6,600.00
Trench, 0'-8' deep
53 |Construct 24" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 30| LF | $270.00 | $8,100.00 [ $134.34 | $4,03020 || $235.00 | $7,050.00 || $240.00 | $7,200.00
Trench, 0'-8' deep
54 |Construct 30" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 30| LF | $280.00 | $8400.00 || $15246 | $4.573.80 | $305.00 | $9,150.00 | $310.00 | $9,300.00
Trench, 0'-8' deep
55 |Construct 36" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 30| LF | $340.00 |$10,200.00 | $166.19 | $4,985.70 || $355.00 |$10,650.00 || $360.00 | $10,800.00
Trench, 0'-8' deep
56  |Construct 12" DIP Storm Drain, 0-8' deep 50 LF | $20000 |$10,000.00 || $179.11 | $8,955.50 || $180.00 | $9,000.00 | $185.00 | $9,250.00
Unclassified Work
57  |Backhoe Rental including all Mobilization, 1| Day | $3,000.00 | $3,000.00 | $2,081.80 | $2,081.80 | $2,800.00 | $2,800.00 [ $2,750.00 | $2,750.00
Demolition, Operator, Fuel, etc.
7 Ton Trackhoe Rental with or without Concrete
58 Hammer including all Mobilization, Demobilization, 1| Day | $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,787.13 $2,787.13 $3,750.00 $3,750.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
Operator, Fuel, etc.
s9 |23 Ton Trackhoe Rental including all Mobilization, 1| Day | $4,000.00 | $4,000.00 | $3,008.38 | $3,008.38 | $3,800.00 | $3,800.00 | $3,750.00 | $3,750.00
Demobilization, Operator, Fuel, etc.
60 |7 Yard Loader Rental including all Mobilization, 1| Day | $2,000.00 | $2,000.00 | $2,400.72 | $2,400.72 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $2,250.00 | $2,250.00
Demobilization, Operator, Fuel, etc.
g1 |} Yard Loader Rental including all Mobilization, 1| Day | $2,000.00 | $2,000.00 | $2,561.20 | $2,561.20 | $750.00 | $750.00 | $2,500.00 | $2,500.00
Demobilization, Operator, Fuel, etc.
g2  |Bulldozer Rental including all Mobilization, 1| Day | $2,000.00 | $2,000.00 | $2,613.99 | $2,613.99 | $500.00 | $500.00 | $2,000.00 | $2,000.00
Demobilization, Operator, Fuel, etc.
63 10-Wheel Dump Truck Rental including Operator, 1| Day | $2,000.00 | $2,000.00 | $1,537.94 | $1,537.94 | $1,800.00 | $1,800.00 | $1,750.00 | $1,750.00
Fuel, & Unlimited Mileage
64  |6-Wheel Dump Truck Rental including Operator, 1| Day | $2,000.00 | $2,000.00 | $1,141.80 | $1,141.80 | $1,550.00 | $1,550.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,500.00
Fuel, & Unlimited Mileage
g5 |Vtility Tools with 2 Laborers. Truck to inculde 1| Day | $6,500.00 | $6,500.00 | $3.428.75 | $3.428.75 | $3,300.00 | $3,300.00 | $3,250.00 | $3,250.00
Miscellaneous Laborer Tools, Rakes, Shovels, etc.
TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID $386,780.00 $419,200.51 $467,908.00 $473,990.00
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 11/14/2023 at 11:00am

2024 PUBLIC WORKS ON CALL CONTRACTOR FOR MISCELLANEOUS RECONSTRUCTION
TOWNSHIP OF MEDFORD
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25972 30

American Asphalt

J. Fletcher Creamer & Son,
Inc.

Montana Construction, Inc.

Think Pavers

100 Main Street
West Collingswood
Heights, NJ 08059

P: 856-456-2899

F: 856-456-4398

101 E Broadway
Hackensack, NJ
07601-6851
P:201-488-9832
F:201-488-2901

80 Contant Avenue
Lodi, NJ 07644

P:973-478-5200
F: 973-478-5065

125 Kings Highway
Mt. Royal, NJ 08061

P: 856-832-4680
F: 856-832-4681

NO DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY | UNIT| UNIT PR. [ AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT ([ UNIT PR. | AMOUNT || UNIT PR. | AMOUNT
Miscellaneous Concrete
1 4" Concrete Sidewalk 16| SF
2 6" Concrete Apron/Sidewalk 40 SF
3 6"x8"x18" Concrete Curb 20l LF
4 ADA Compliant Curb Ramp 1] Unit
5 Concrete Gutter/Roadway (8" thick) 20| SF
6 Concrete Roadway (8" thick) 20| SF
Miscellaneous Paving
7 Milling, 2" Thick (<2,000 SY) 1,000{ SY
8 Milling, 2" Thick (>2,000 SY) 2,500 SY
9 Milling, 6" Thick (<2,000 SY) 1,000{ SY
10 Milling, 6" Thick (>2,000 SY) 2,500 SY
1 HMA 9.5M64 Surface Course, installed without 10l ™™
Paver, Tamped or Rolled (<20 tons)
12 HMA 9.5M64 Surface Course, installed by Paver to sol ™
include Tack Coat, Rolling of Asphalt (20 to 200 tons)
13 HMA 9.5M64 Surface Course, installed by Paver to 250l ™
include Tack Coat, Rolling of Asphalt (>200 tons)
14 HMA 19M64 Base Course, installed without Paver, 10l TN
Tamped or Rolled (<20 tons)
15 HMA 19M64 Base Course, installed by Paver to 50l TN
include Rolling of Asphalt (20 to 200 tons)
16 F-IMA 19M64‘1 Base Course, installed by Paver to 250l ™
include Rolling of Asphalt (>200 tons)
17 Bituminous Cold Patch 10 TN
Miscellaneous Earthwork and Site Restoration
18 Roadwa?/ Excavation, Unclassified includes General 20| cy
Excavation
19 Quarry Blend 10| CY
Select Borrow (clean, organic free, granular material
20 to be used for roadway subgrade and/or pipe trench 10] CY
backfill) NJDOT mixes I-2, I-5 (gravel), 1-6, I-7, or I-8
21 Portland Cement Concrete Fill 5] CY
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ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS
SUMMARY OF BIDS

Bid Opening 11/14/2023 at 11:00am

2024 PUBLIC WORKS ON CALL CONTRACTOR FOR MISCELLANEOUS RECONSTRUCTION
TOWNSHIP OF MEDFORD
BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY
25972 30

American Asphalt

J. Fletcher Creamer & Son,
Inc.

Montana Construction, Inc.

Think Pavers

100 Main Street
West Collingswood
Heights, NJ 08059

P: 856-456-2899

F: 856-456-4398

101 E Broadway
Hackensack, NJ
07601-6851
P:201-488-9832
F: 201-488-2901

80 Contant Avenue
Lodi, NJ 07644

P: 973-478-5200
F: 973-478-5065

125 Kings Highway
Mt. Royal, NJ 08061

P: 856-832-4680
F: 856-832-4681

22 Crushed Stone 3/8" to 1/2" 1| TN
23 4" Topsoil and Sod 201 SY
24 4" Topsoil and Seed 201 SY
25 Remove Tree 1| Unit
26 Plant Tree 1| Unit
Storm and Sanitary Sewer Structures
27 Reset Type "B" Inlet Frame and Head 1| Unit
28 Replace Inlet Head and Grate 1| Unit
29 Cement Parging of Inlet Interior, 0'-6' deep 1| Unit
30 Reconstruction of Existing Inlet, 0'-6' deep 1| Unit
31 Construct Type "A" Inlet, 0'-6' Deep 1| Unit
32 Construct Type "A" Inlet, 6'-10' Deep 1| Unit
33 Construct Type "B"/"E" Inlet, 0'-6' Deep 1| Unit
34 Construct Type "B"/"E" Inlet, 6'-10' Deep 1| Unit
Miscellaneous Storm Sewer
35 Storm Sewer Point Repair, 0'-6' deep 1l LS
36 Storm Sewer Point Repair, 6'-10' deep 11 LS
37 Construct 12" RCP, 0'-6' deep 30| LF
38 Construct 12" RCP, 6'-10' deep 30| LF
39 Construct 15" RCP, 0'-6' deep 30| LF
40 Construct 15" RCP, 6'-10' deep 30| LF
41 Construct 18" RCP, 0'-6' deep 30| LF
42 Construct 18" RCP, 6'-10' deep 30| LF
43 Construct 21" RCP, 0'-6' deep 30| LF
44 Construct 21" RCP, 6'-10' deep 30| LF
45 Construct 24" RCP, 0'-6' deep 30| LF
46 Construct 24" RCP, 6'-10' deep 30| LF
47 Construct 30" RCP, 0'-10' deep 30| LF
48 Construct 36" RCP, 0'-10' deep 30| LF
49 Construct 6" Perforated HDPE in Stone Trench, 0'-8 20| 1F
deep
50 Construct 12" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 30| LF
Trench, 0'-8' deep
51 Construct 15" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 20| 1F
Trench, 0'-8' deep
5 Construct 18" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 30| LF
Trench, 0'-8' deep
53 Construct 24" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 20| 1F
Trench, 0'-8' deep
54 Construct 30" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 30| LF
Trench, 0'-8' deep
55 Construct 36" HDPE Solid or Perforated in Stone 20| 1F
Trench, 0'-8' deep
56 Construct 12" DIP Storm Drain, 0'-8' deep 501 LF
Unclassified Work
Backhoe Rental including all Mobilization,
57 Demolition, Operator, Fuel, etc. !| Day
7 Ton Trackhoe Rental with or without Concrete
58 Hammer including all Mobilization, Demobilization, 1| Day
Operator, Fuel, etc.
59 25 Ton Trackhoe Rental including all Mobilization, 1l Da
Demobilization, Operator, Fuel, etc. Y
60 2 Yard Loader Rental including all Mobilization, 1l Da
Demobilization, Operator, Fuel, etc. Y
61 3 Yard Loader Rental including all Mobilization, 1l pa
Demobilization, Operator, Fuel, etc. Y
Bulldozer Rental including all Mobilization,
62 . 1| Day
Demobilization, Operator, Fuel, etc.
63 10-Wheel Dump Truck Rental including Operator, 1l pa
Fuel, & Unlimited Mileage Y
4 6-Wheel Dump Truck Rental including Operator, 1l Da
Fuel, & Unlimited Mileage Y
6 Utility Tools with 2 Laborers. Truck to inculde 1l pa
Miscellaneous Laborer Tools, Rakes, Shovels, etc. Y

TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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