



ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS Bid Summary Report Bid Opening 2/23/2023 at 10:00 AM				LOWER AETNA DAM EROSION REPAIR MEDFORD LAKES, NEW JERSEY 24045 02							
				Capela Construction, LLC.		All J's Services		SDW Construction Inc.		Decker's Inc.	
				20 Tranquility Court Southampton, NJ 08088 (P) 609-535-5367 (F) 609-801-2533		P.O. Box 384 Medford, NJ 08055 (P) 609-929-4687 N/A		251 Tennet Road Morganville, NJ 07751 (P) 908-338-3660 (F) 609-286-2255		16 Lakeside Avenue Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 (P) 856-795-7087 (F) 856-354-8630	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID											
1	Temporary Soil Erosion & Sediment Control	1	LS	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$2,800.00	\$2,800.00
2	Clearing of Vegetation & Debris	1	LS	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$2,800.00	\$2,800.00	\$4,300.00	\$4,300.00	\$6,500.00	\$6,500.00
3	Grout Spaces 2" or Greater within Exposed Area of Articulating Concrete Blocks	1	LS	\$725.00	\$725.00	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$4,680.00	\$4,680.00
4	Install 3/4" Diameter Clean Stone #57	65	CY	\$50.00	\$3,250.00	\$125.00	\$8,125.00	\$90.00	\$5,850.00	\$100.00	\$6,500.00
5	Install Well Graded Clean Fill Material	65	CY	\$20.00	\$1,300.00	\$55.00	\$3,575.00	\$35.00	\$2,275.00	\$78.00	\$5,070.00
6	Install Topsoil, 6" Thick	185	SY	\$1.00	\$185.00	\$11.00	\$2,035.00	\$6.00	\$1,110.00	\$27.00	\$4,995.00
7	Install Permanent Type Turf Reinforcement Matting	185	SY	\$10.00	\$1,850.00	\$20.00	\$3,700.00	\$9.00	\$1,665.00	\$48.00	\$8,880.00
8	Hydroseed	185	SY	\$1.00	\$185.00	\$6.19	\$1,145.15	\$10.00	\$1,850.00	\$14.00	\$2,590.00
TOTAL BASE BID				\$27,495.00		\$28,880.15		\$29,550.00		\$42,015.00	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS Bid Summary Report Bid Opening 2/23/2023 at 10:00 AM				LOWER AETNA DAM EROSION REPAIR MEDFORD LAKES, NEW JERSEY 24045 02							
				TC Landscape Construction Group, Inc.		Jerrell's Landscapes & Nurseries, Inc.		Landburg Construction, LLC.		Coastlie Excavating and Site Services, LLC	
				156 Grand Central Parkway Bayville, NJ 08721 (P) 732-773-9716 N/A		600 Creek Road Moorestown, NJ 08057 (P) 859-235-4001 N/A		82 Tuckahoe Road Dorothy, NJ 08317 (P) 609-829-2131 (F) 609-909-1647		37 Indian Trail Southampton, NJ 08088 (P) 856-986-8363 (F) 609-801-2777	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID											
1	Temporary Soil Erosion & Sediment Control	1	LS	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00		
2	Clearing of Vegetation & Debris	1	LS	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00		
3	Grout Spaces 2" or Greater within Exposed Area of Articulating Concrete Blocks	1	LS	\$5,500.00	\$5,500.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00		
4	Install 3/4" Diameter Clean Stone #57	65	CY	\$8.00	\$520.00	\$153.00	\$9,945.00	\$175.00	\$11,375.00		
5	Install Well Graded Clean Fill Material	65	CY	\$60.00	\$3,900.00	\$155.00	\$10,075.00	\$145.00	\$9,425.00		
6	Install Topsoil, 6" Thick	185	SY	\$75.00	\$13,875.00	\$50.00	\$9,250.00	\$35.00	\$6,475.00		
7	Install Permanent Type Turf Reinforcement Matting	185	SY	\$50.00	\$9,250.00	\$108.00	\$19,980.00	\$25.00	\$4,625.00		
8	Hydroseed	185	SY	\$50.00	\$9,250.00	\$25.00	\$4,625.00	\$0.01	\$1.85		
TOTAL BASE BID				\$49,295.00		\$69,875.00		\$78,901.85		NO BID	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS

Bid Summary Report

Bid Opening 2/23/2023 at 10:00 AM



ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS, INC.

Engineers • Planners • Scientists • Surveyors

LOWER AETNA DAM EROSION REPAIR

MEDFORD LAKES, NEW JERSEY

24045 02

Construct Connect, LLC.

Robbie Lane Enterprises

South State, Inc.

Spectraserv, Inc.

30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100
Norcross, GA 30092-2925
(P) 800-364-2059
(F) 866-570-8187

38 Jacksonville Road
Towaco, NJ 07082
(P) 973-769-2391
N/A

P.O. Box 68
Bridgeton, NJ 08302
(P) 609-381-0694
N/A

75 Jacobus Avenue
South Kearny, NJ 07032
(P) 973-589-0277
(F) 973-589-0415

NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID											
1	Temporary Soil Erosion & Sediment Control	1	LS								
2	Clearing of Vegetation & Debris	1	LS								
3	Grout Spaces 2" or Greater within Exposed Area of Articulating Concrete Blocks	1	LS								
4	Install 3/4" Diameter Clean Stone #57	65	CY								
5	Install Well Graded Clean Fill Material	65	CY								
6	Install Topsoil, 6" Thick	185	SY								
7	Install Permanent Type Turf Reinforcement Matting	185	SY								
8	Hydroseed	185	SY								
TOTAL BASE BID				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	