

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC. SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 09/20/2022 @ 2:00 PM				UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANK REMOVAL BOROUGH OF MAGNOLIA CAMDEN COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 50513 00							
				Aurora Environmental Inc.		The Ambient Group LLC		All J's Services		Brinks Tank & Environmental Services	
				1102 Union Avenue Union Beach, NJ 07735 P: (800) 464-0519 F: (732) 888-1190		2515 Glassboro Cross Keys Road Williamstown, NJ 08094 P: (856) 582-1765 x 103 F: (856) 582-2114		98 Old Marlton Pike Medford, NJ 08055-8725 P: (609) 929-4687		1256 Liberty Avenue Hillside, NJ 07205 P: (844) 462-7465 F: (973) 685-5686	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UN	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID											
1	Removal of Existing Underground Storage Tank	1	L.S.	\$1,800.00	\$1,800.00	\$9,380.00	\$9,380.00				
2	Stock Piling of Excavated Soil	1	L.S.	\$1,800.00	\$1,800.00	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00				
3	Site Restoration	1	L.S.	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,700.00	\$1,700.00				
4	Contaminated Soil Disposal - Non-Hazardous	80	Tons	\$68.00	\$6,880.00	\$37.00	\$2,960.00				
5	Backfill with Certified Clean Fill	80	Tons	\$28.00	\$2,240.00	\$18.00	\$1,440.00				
6	Remove & Replace Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed)	10	S.Y.	\$18.00	\$1,800.00	\$300.00	\$3,000.00				
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE				\$15,520.00		\$20,480.00		NO BID		NO BID	
ALTERNATE BID											
7	Contaminated Soil Disposal - Hazardous	80	Tons	\$125.00	\$10,000.00	\$175.00	\$14,000.00				
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ALTERNATE BID #1				\$10,000.00		\$14,000.00		NO BID		NO BID	
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1				\$25,520.00		\$34,480.00		NO BID		NO BID	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC. SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 09/20/2022 @ 2:00 PM				UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANK REMOVAL BOROUGH OF MAGNOLIA CAMDEN COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 50513 00							
				Construct Connect		TTI Environmental, Inc.		Vollers			
				30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100 Norcross, GA 30092 P: (800) 364-2059 F: (866) 570-8187		1253 N Church Street Moorestown, NJ 08057 P: (856) 840-8800 F: (856) 840-8815		PO Box 5297 North Branch, NJ 08876 P: (908) 725-1026			
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID											
1	Removal of Existing Underground Storage Tank	1	L.S.								
2	Stock Piling of Excavated Soil	1	L.S.								
3	Site Restoration	1	L.S.								
4	Contaminated Soil Disposal - Non-Hazardous	80	Tons								
5	Backfill with Certified Clean Fill	80	Tons								
6	Remove & Replace Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick (If & Where Directed)	10	S.Y.								
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID			
ALTERNATE BID											
7	Contaminated Soil Disposal - Hazardous	80	Tons								
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ALTERNATE BID #1				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID			
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID #1				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID			