

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC. SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 7/12/2022 @ 11:00AM				PALMYRA TREATMENT PLANT EMERGENCY GENERATOR PROJECT PALMYRA BOROUGH BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 44020 01A									
				Engineer's Estimate		Municipal Maintenance Co.		Eagle Construction Services, Inc.		Scalfo Electric, Inc.		LaManna Electric, Inc.	
						1352 Taylor Lane Cinnaminson, NJ 08077 P: 856-786-9434 F: 856-786-0642		1624 Jacksonville Rd Burlington, NJ 08016 P: 609-239-8000 F: 609-239-8008		3539 N Mill Rd Vineland, NJ 08360-1593 P: 856-692-5196 F: 856-692-0660		10 West Manor Way Robbinsville, NJ 08691 P: 609-259-6282 F: 609-259-9320	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID													
1	Remove and Replace Reinforced Concrete Generator Pad	8	CY	\$2,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$8,400.00	\$67,200.00	\$2,125.00	\$17,000.00
2	Remove & Replace Concrete Sidewalk	16	CY	\$250.00	\$4,000.00	\$150.00	\$2,400.00	\$1.00	\$16.00	\$450.00	\$7,200.00	\$1,100.00	\$17,600.00
3	Install Generator & Electrical Work- Complete	1	LS	\$280,000.00	\$280,000.00	\$271,520.00	\$271,520.00	\$289,514.00	\$289,514.00	\$259,100.00	\$259,100.00	\$299,300.00	\$299,300.00
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE				\$300,000.00		\$289,920.00		\$305,530.00		\$333,500.00		\$333,900.00	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC. SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 7/12/2022 @ 11:00AM				PALMYRA TREATMENT PLANT EMERGENCY GENERATOR PROJECT PALMYRA BOROUGH BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 44020 01A							
				Dec-En Electric Contracting, Inc.		Hughes Electric Co., LLC		KRS Service		Wysocki Electric, Inc.	
				3014 Tremley Point Road Linden, NJ 07036 P: 908-862-8189 F: 908-862-8171		40 Old Turnpike, #1 Pleasantville, NJ 08232 P: 609-568-5027 F: 609-568-5256		1806 Route 206 Southampton, NJ 08088 P: 609-859-3030 F: 609-589-2853		129 N River Dr. Pennsville, NJ 08070 P: 856-678-4300 F: 866-837-0941	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID											
1	Remove and Replace Reinforced Concrete Generator Pad	8	CY	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
2	Remove & Replace Concrete Sidewalk	16	CY								
3	Install Generator & Electrical Work- Complete	1	LS								
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	