

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS, INC. SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 08/25/20 at 11:00 AM				SYKESVILLE ROAD PHASE I IMPROVEMENTS CHESTERFIELD TOWNSHIP BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 42130 19C							
<i>Mathematically corrected total (typ.)</i>				Earle Asphalt Company		Gerald A Barrett		Black Rock Enterprises		Trap Rock Industries	
				PO Drawer 556 Farmingdale, NJ 07727		329 Lakedale Road Berlin, NJ 08009		1316 Englishtown Road Old Bridge, NJ 08857		PO Box 419 Kingston, NJ 08528	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID - Crosswicks-Ellisdale Road to Station 41+00											
1	2" Milling and Recycling of Pavement	8,933	SY	\$6.55	\$58,511.15	\$3.90	\$34,838.70	\$3.25	\$29,032.25		
2	Full Depth Pavement Repairs	3,000	SY	\$12.50	\$37,500.00	\$19.90	\$59,700.00	\$37.00	\$111,000.00		
3	2" Thick 9.5M64 HMA Surface Course Paving	3,600	Tons	\$73.50	\$264,600.00	\$84.90	\$305,640.00	\$79.00	\$284,400.00		
4	Refurbish Inlet	2	Units	\$1,302.89	\$2,605.78	\$1,590.00	\$3,180.00	\$2,500.00	\$5,000.00		
5	Excavate and Repair Storm Drain Sinkhole	2	Units	\$3,500.00	\$7,000.00	\$3,500.00	\$7,000.00	\$3,500.00	\$7,000.00		
6	Remove and Replace Asphalt Driveway Apron	200	SY	\$40.00	\$8,000.00	\$34.90	\$6,980.00	\$40.00	\$8,000.00		
7	4" Long Life Epoxy Striping	40,200	LF	\$0.65	\$26,130.00	\$0.33	\$13,266.00	\$0.44	\$17,688.00		
8	Bi-Directional Amber Lens RPM	130	Units	\$30.00	\$3,900.00	\$32.10	\$4,173.00	\$50.00	\$6,500.00		
9	Traffic Control Officer, Flagger	40	Hours	\$75.53	\$3,021.20	\$75.53	\$3,021.20	\$75.53	\$3,021.20		
10	Asphalt Price Adjustment	1	LS	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00		
11	Fuel Price Adjustment	1	LS	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$200.00		
TOTAL BASE BID				\$411,968.13		\$438,498.90		\$472,341.45		NO BID	
ALTERNATE BID #1 - ELLISDALE ROAD											
ALT 1/2	Full Depth Pavement Repairs	800	SY	\$37.50	\$30,000.00	\$25.90	\$20,720.00	\$45.00	\$36,000.00		
ALT 1/6	Remove and Replace Asphalt Driveway Apron	23	SY	\$40.00	\$920.00	\$39.90	\$917.70	\$75.00	\$1,725.00		
ALT 1/7	4" Long Life Epoxy Striping	1,140	LF	\$0.65	\$741.00	\$0.33	\$376.20	\$0.44	\$501.60		
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID #1				\$31,661.00		\$22,013.90		\$38,226.60			
TOTAL BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE BID #1				\$443,629.13		\$460,512.80		\$510,568.05		NO BID	
ALTERNATE BID #2 - EXTONVILLE ROAD											
ALT 2/1	2" Milling and Recycling of Pavement	870	SY	\$8.50	\$7,395.00	\$1.00	\$870.00	\$10.00	\$8,700.00		
ALT 2/2	Full Depth Pavement Repairs	950	SY	\$12.50	\$11,875.00	\$24.90	\$23,655.00	\$50.00	\$47,500.00		
ALT 2/3	2" Thick 9.5M64 HMA Surface Course Paving	235	Tons	\$110.00	\$25,850.00	\$89.90	\$21,126.50	\$135.00	\$31,725.00		
ALT 2/6	Remove and Replace Asphalt Driveway Apron	75	SY	\$40.00	\$3,000.00	\$34.90	\$2,617.50	\$75.00	\$5,625.00		
ALT 2/7	4" Long Life Epoxy Striping	2,560	LF	\$0.65	\$1,664.00	\$0.33	\$844.80	\$0.44	\$1,126.40		
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID #2				\$49,784.00		\$49,113.80		\$94,676.40			
TOTAL BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE BIDS #1 & #2				\$493,413.13		\$509,626.60		\$605,244.45		NO BID	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS, INC. SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 08/25/20 at 11:00 AM				SYKESVILLE ROAD PHASE I IMPROVEMENTS CHESTERFIELD TOWNSHIP BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 42130 19C							
<i>Mathematically corrected total (typ.)</i>				Richard T Barrett Paving		Think Pavers		Construct Connect		Arawak Paving Co.	
				400 Prospect Street Trenton, NJ 08618		125 Kings Highway Mt. Royal, NJ 08061		30 Technology Parkway S Suite 100 Norcross, GA 30092		7503 Weymouth Road Hammonton, NJ 08037	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID - Crosswicks-Ellisdale Road to Station 41+00											
1	2" Milling and Recycling of Pavement	8,933	SY								
2	Full Depth Pavement Repairs	3,000	SY								
3	2" Thick 9.5M64 HMA Surface Course Paving	3,600	Tons								
4	Refurbish Inlet	2	Units								
5	Excavate and Repair Storm Drain Sinkhole	2	Units								
6	Remove and Replace Asphalt Driveway Apron	200	SY								
7	4" Long Life Epoxy Striping	40,200	LF								
8	Bi-Directional Amber Lens RPM	130	Units								
9	Traffic Control Officer, Flagger	40	Hours								
10	Asphalt Price Adjustment	1	LS								
11	Fuel Price Adjustment	1	LS								
TOTAL BASE BID				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
ALTERNATE BID #1 - ELLISDALE ROAD											
ALT 1/2	Full Depth Pavement Repairs	800	SY								
ALT 1/6	Remove and Replace Asphalt Driveway Apron	23	SY								
ALT 1/7	4" Long Life Epoxy Striping	1,140	LF								
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID #1											
TOTAL BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE BID #1				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
ALTERNATE BID #2 - EXTONVILLE ROAD											
ALT 2/1	2" Milling and Recycling of Pavement	870	SY								
ALT 2/2	Full Depth Pavement Repairs	950	SY								
ALT 2/3	2" Thick 9.5M64 HMA Surface Course Paving	235	Tons								
ALT 2/6	Remove and Replace Asphalt Driveway Apron	75	SY								
ALT 2/7	4" Long Life Epoxy Striping	2,560	LF								
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID #2											
TOTAL BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE BIDS #1 & #2				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	