

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS BID OPENING: 4/7/21 AT 10:00 AM				SANITARY SEWER ROOT TREATMENT & POINT REPAIR EDGEWATER PARK SEWERAGE AUTHORITY BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 63507 21							
				Mobile Dredging & Video Pipe		North American Pipeline Serv. AKA Vortex Services, LLC		Standard Pipe Services, LLC		Montana Construction	
				1566 Harding Highway Newfield, NJ 08344 P: (856) 697-1900 F: (856) 697-0757		210 Bennet Road Freehold, NJ 07728 P: (732) 625-9300 F: (732) 625-9309		567 Walther Road Newark DE 19702 P: (302) 286-0701		80 Contant Avenue Lodi, NJ 07644 P: (973) 478-5200 F: (973) 478-7604	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
1	Root Treatment	1,865	LF	\$3.72	\$6,937.80	\$9.50	\$17,717.50	\$15.00	\$27,975.00		
2	Trenchless Point Repair (4' Length)	9	UNIT	\$1,450.00	\$13,050.00	\$2,400.00	\$21,600.00	\$2,000.00	\$18,000.00		
3	Additional Footage of Lining (If & Where Directed)	10	LF	\$80.00	\$800.00	\$58.00	\$580.00	\$500.00	\$5,000.00		
TOTAL AMOUNT				\$20,787.80		\$39,897.50		\$50,975.00		NO BID RECEIVED	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS BID OPENING: 4/7/21 AT 10:00 AM				SANITARY SEWER ROOT TREATMENT & POINT REPAIR EDGEWATER PARK SEWERAGE AUTHORITY BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 63507 21							
				National Water Main Cleaning		Construct Connect		Dodge Data & Analytics			
				1806 Newark Turnpike Kearny, NJ 07032 P: (973) 483-3200 F: (973) 483-5065		30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100 Norcross, GA 30092 P: (800) 364-2059 F: (866) 570-8187		2860 S. State Highway 161 Suite 160-#501 Grand Prairie, TX 75052 P: (413) 285-2416			
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
1	Root Treatment	1,865	LF								
2	Trenchless Point Repair (4' Length)	9	UNIT								
3	Additional Footage of Lining (If & Where Directed)	10	LF								
TOTAL AMOUNT				NO BID RECEIVED		NO BID RECEIVED		NO BID RECEIVED			