

<b>ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS</b> <b>SUMMARY OF BIDS</b> <b>Bid Opening 2/3/21 11:00AM</b>	<b>PUBLIC WORKS ROOF REPLACEMENT PROJECT</b> <b>WATERFORD TOWNSHIP</b> <b>CAMDEN COUNTY, NJ</b> <b>46127 00</b>
---	--

	<b>Levy Construction Company</b>	<b>MJJ Construction, LLC.</b>	<b>MiBo Construction Company</b>	<b>J.H. Williams Enterprises</b>
	134 Cuthbert Boulevard Audubon, NJ 08106  P: (856) 547-0707 F: (856) 547-2424	471 White Horse Pike Atco, NJ 08004  P: (856) 768-9440 F: (856) 768-9495	331 White Horse Pike Atco, NJ 08004  P: 856) 809-1550 F: (856) 809-1552	231 Haines Drive Moorestown, NJ 08057  P: (856) 793-7114 F: (856) 220-0017

NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>Base Bid</b>											
1	Install A-Frame Roof	1	LS	\$198,600.00	\$198,600.00	\$199,000.00	\$199,000.00	\$203,450.00	\$203,450.00	\$214,300.00	\$214,300.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID PRICE</b>				<b>\$198,600.00</b>		<b>\$199,000.00</b>		<b>\$203,450.00</b>		<b>\$214,300.00</b>	

	<b>Detweiler Roofing</b>	<b>D.A. Nolt, Inc.</b>	<b>Patriot Roofing, Inc.</b>	<b>W.J.Gross, Inc.</b>
	1578 Main Street East Earl, PA 17519  P (717) 200-4000 F: (717) 222-5271	53 Cross Keys Road Berlin, NJ 08009  P: (856) 753-4963 F: (856) 753-4963	2083 Jacksonville-Jobstown Road Jobstown, NJ 08041  F: 609) 723-6867	495 Center Street Sewell, NJ 08080  P: (856) 415-1712 F: (856) 415-1709

NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>Base Bid</b>											
1	Install A-Frame Roof	1	LS	\$274,000.00	\$274,000.00	\$385,974.00	\$385,974.00				
<b>TOTAL BASE BID PRICE</b>				<b>\$274,000.00</b>		<b>\$385,974.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	

	<b>ConstructConnect</b>	<b>Dodge Data &amp; Analytics</b>		
	30 Technology Pkwy Norcross, GA 30092  P: (800) 364-2059 F: (866) 570-8187	2860 S. State Hwy Grand Prarie, TX 75052  P: (413) 893-0645 F: (413) 247-4968		

NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>Base Bid</b>											
1	Install A-Frame Roof	1	LS								
<b>TOTAL BASE BID PRICE</b>				<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>					