

# Office/Garage Building Roof Replacement Project- Riverside Sewerage Authority

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 11/1/2019 10:00AM				SEWER PLANT OFFICE/GARAGE BUILDING ROOF REPLACEMENT PROJECT RIVERSIDE TOWNSHIP, NEW JERSEY 30424 90							
				<i>Engineer's Estimate</i>		Robert Ganter Contractors, Inc.		D.A. Nolt, Inc.		Tortorice Contractors, Inc.	
						595 E. Pumping Station Rd. Quakertown, PA 18951 P- (215) 538-3540 F- (215) 538-3543		53 Cross Keys Rd. Berlin, NJ 08009 P- (856) 753-9333 F- (856) 753-4963		161 Blackwood Barnsboro Rd. Sewell, NJ 08080 P- (856) 232-2222 F- (856) 232-7343	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>BASE BID</b>											
1	Replace Lower Building Roof, Complete	1	LS	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$56,000.00	\$56,000.00	\$90,586.00	\$90,586.00	\$79,949.00	\$79,949.00
2	Replace Wood Blocking, If/Where Directed	20	LF	\$15.00	\$300.00	\$8.00	\$160.00	\$6.50	\$130.00	\$13.00	\$260.00
3	Replace Metal Decking, If/Where Directed	40	SF	\$10.00	\$400.00	\$6.00	\$240.00	\$12.00	\$480.00	\$10.00	\$400.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID PRICE</b>				<b>\$50,700.00</b>		<b>\$56,400.00</b>		<b>\$91,196.00</b>		<b>\$80,609.00</b>	
<b>ALTERNATE BID #1</b>											
4	Replace Upper Building Roof, Complete	1	LS	\$80,000.00	\$80,000.00	\$78,000.00	\$78,000.00	\$62,271.00	\$62,271.00	\$112,342.00	\$112,342.00
<b>TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 PRICE</b>				<b>\$80,000.00</b>		<b>\$78,000.00</b>		<b>\$62,271.00</b>		<b>\$112,342.00</b>	
<b>TOTAL BASE AND ALTERNATE #1 PRICE</b>				<b>\$130,700.00</b>		<b>\$134,400.00</b>		<b>\$153,467.00</b>		<b>\$192,951.00</b>	

# Office/Garage Building Roof Replacement Project- Riverside Sewerage Authority

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 11/1/2019 10:00AM				SEWER PLANT OFFICE/GARAGE BUILDING ROOF REPLACEMENT PROJECT RIVERSIDE TOWNSHIP, NEW JERSEY 30424 90							
				USA General Contractors Corp		Detwiler Roofing		Emmons Roofing & Siding, Inc.		Jottan Inc.	
				980 Dehart Place Elizabeth, NJ 07202 P- (908) 436-3739 F- (908) 436-1661		1578 Main St. East Earl, PA 17519 P- (717) 200-4000 F- (717) 222-5271		2924 S. Black Horse Pike Williamstown, NJ 08094 P- (856) 885-6677		61 Cathy Ln. P.O. Box 166 Florence, NJ 08518 P- (609) 447-6200 F- (609) 447-6206	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>BASE BID</b>											
1	Replace Lower Building Roof, Complete	1	LS	\$75,000.00	\$75,000.00						
2	Replace Wood Blocking, If/Where Directed	20	LF	\$5.00	\$100.00						
3	Replace Metal Decking, If/Where Directed	40	SF	\$18.00	\$720.00						
<b>TOTAL BASE BID PRICE</b>				<b>\$75,820.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	
<b>ALTERNATE BID #1</b>											
4	Replace Upper Building Roof, Complete	1	LS	\$130,000.00	\$130,000.00						
<b>TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 PRICE</b>				<b>\$130,000.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	
<b>TOTAL BASE AND ALTERNATE #1 PRICE</b>				<b>\$205,820.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	

# Office/Garage Building Roof Replacement Project- Riverside Sewerage Authority

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 11/1/2019 10:00AM				SEWER PLANT OFFICE/GARAGE BUILDING ROOF REPLACEMENT PROJECT RIVERSIDE TOWNSHIP, NEW JERSEY 30424 90							
				Strober-Wright Roofing Inc		Construct Connect		Dodge Data & Analytics			
				1432 Route 179, Units C2&C3 Lambertville, NJ 08530 P- (609) 397-1900 F- (609) 397-1916		30 Technology Pkwy. Norcross, GA 30092 P- (800) 364-2059 F- (866) 570-8187		4300 Beltway Place Arlington, TX 76018 P- (413) 570-0211			
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>BASE BID</b>											
1	Replace Lower Building Roof, Complete	1	LS								
2	Replace Wood Blocking, If/Where Directed	20	LF								
3	Replace Metal Decking, If/Where Directed	40	SF								
<b>TOTAL BASE BID PRICE</b>				<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>			
<b>ALTERNATE BID #1</b>											
4	Replace Upper Building Roof, Complete	1	LS								
<b>TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 PRICE</b>				<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>			
<b>TOTAL BASE AND ALTERNATE #1 PRICE</b>				<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>			