

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 12/19/2019 at 10:00 AM				DEMOLITION OF WELL HOUSE #9 AND WATER TREATMENT PLANT TOWNSHIP OF MEDFORD BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 25550 05															
				Enterprise Network Resolutions Contracting, LLC		Neri Construction, Inc.		All J's Services Construction		Fred M. Schiavone Construction, Inc.		Two Brothers Contracting, Inc.		Coastline Costruction, LLC		C Stevenson & Son, Inc.		Caravella Demolition	
				325 Tansboro Road Berlin, NJ 08009 P (609) 567-0600 F (856) 306-8998		849 Clayton Road Williamstown, NJ 08094 P (856) 629-2408		98 Old Marlton Pike Medford, NJ 08055 P (609) 929-4687 F (856) 727-1996		PO Box 416 Malaga, NJ 08328 P (856) 697-4558 F (856) 697-9612		11 Vreeland Avenue Totowa, NJ 07512 P (973) 956-8700 F (973) 956-8811		PO Box 1554 Medford, NJ 08055 P (609) 351-1542 F (609) 801-2777		950 Mt. Holly Rd Suite A Edgewater Park, NJ 08010 P (609) 871-1666 F (609) 871-2987		40 Deforest Ave. East Hanover, NJ 07936 P (973) 255-5544 F (973) 240-7412	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID																			
1	Demolition of Well House #9	1	LS	\$9,800.00	\$9,800.00	\$15,640.00	\$15,640.00	\$12,600.00	\$12,600.00	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$49,000.00	\$49,000.00				
2	Demolition of Water Treatment Plant	1	LS	\$24,100.00	\$24,100.00	\$29,630.00	\$29,630.00	\$54,400.00	\$54,400.00	\$88,800.00	\$88,800.00	\$66,200.00	\$66,200.00	\$289,130.00	\$289,130.00				
3	Salvage and Deliver Equipment & Materials	1	LS	\$4,400.00	\$4,400.00	\$34,999.00	\$34,999.00	\$18,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$30,000.00	\$30,000.00				
TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID				\$38,300.00		\$80,269.00		\$85,000.00		\$110,800.00		\$132,200.00		\$368,130.00		NO BID		NO BID	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 12/19/2019 at 10:00 AM				DEMOLITION OF WELL HOUSE #9 AND WATER TREATMENT PLANT TOWNSHIP OF MEDFORD BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 25550 05															
				Delphi Contracting		JCP Group, Inc.		R.E. Pierson Construction Co.		Yannuzzi Group		Construct Connect							
				PO Box 69 Sewell, NJ 08080 P (856) 228-3600 F (856) 228-0780		228 Blackwood- Barnsboro Road Blackwood, NJ 08012 P (856) 232-0400 F (856) 232-1243		426 Swedesboro Road PO Box 430 Piles Grove, NJ 08098 P (856) 769-8244 F (856) 769-5630		135 Kinnelon Rd. Unit #102 Kinnelon, NJ 07405 P (908) 218-0880 F (908) 218-0884		30 Technology Pkwy. Norcross, GA 30092 P (800) 364-2059 F (866) 570-8187							
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT						
BASE BID																			
1	Demolition of Well House #9	1	LS																
2	Demolition of Water Treatment Plant	1	LS																
3	Salvage and Deliver Equipment & Materials	1	LS																
TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID							