

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 02/24/21 @ 3:00 PM				ABOVE GROUND STORAGE TANK INSTALLATION TOWNSHIP OF MOORESTOWN BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 51200 00											
				T Slack Environmental Services		TTI Environmental Inc.		Aurora Environmental Inc.		Oxford Engineering Company		Independence Constructors, Inc.		E.O. Habegger Co, Inc.	
				180 Market Street Kenilworth, NJ 07033 P: (908) 964-5360 F: (908) 964-4244		1253 North Church Moorestown, NJ 08057 P: (856) 840-8800 x14 F: (856) 840-8815		1102 Union Ave Union Beach, NJ 07735 P: N/A F: (732) 888-1190		336 Point Street Camden, NJ 08102 P: (856) 541-0700 F: (856) 541-0505		1200 Route 22E Bridgewater, NJ 08807 P: (908) 707-3296 F: (908) 766-4253		334 N. Washington Street Hammonton, NJ 08037 P: (609) 704-9021 F: (609) 704-9015	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
BASE BID															
1	Removal of Existing Underground Storage Tank	1	L.S.	\$7,525.00	\$7,525.00	\$6,944.00	\$6,944.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$35,000.00	\$35,000.00				
2	Stock Piling of Excavated Soil	1	L.S.	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$550.00	\$550.00	\$400.00	\$400.00	\$4,800.00	\$4,800.00				
3	Site Restoration	1	L.S.	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$780.00	\$780.00	\$1,800.00	\$1,800.00	\$3,800.00	\$3,800.00				
4	Installation of Above Ground Storage Tank	1	L.S.	\$57,000.00	\$57,000.00	\$70,412.00	\$70,412.00	\$69,450.00	\$69,450.00	\$85,300.00	\$85,300.00				
5	Contaminated Soil Disposal- Non-Hazardous	20	Tons	\$65.00	\$1,300.00	\$45.00	\$900.00	\$62.00	\$1,240.00	\$110.00	\$2,200.00				
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE				\$67,075.00		\$79,586.00		\$87,890.00		\$131,100.00		NO BID		NO BID	
ALTERNATE #1															
A1.1	Contaminated Soil Disposal - Hazardous	20	Tons	\$100.00	\$2,000.00	\$85.00	\$1,700.00	\$95.00	\$1,900.00	\$240.00	\$4,800.00				
TOTAL ALTERNATE #1				\$2,000.00		\$1,700.00		\$1,900.00		\$4,800.00		NO BID		NO BID	
BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1 TOTAL				\$69,075.00		\$81,286.00		\$89,790.00		\$135,900.00					
ALTERNATE #2															
A2.1	Tank Monitoring System	1	L.S.	\$11,950.00	\$11,950.00	\$6,288.00	\$6,288.00	\$6,940.00	\$6,940.00	\$6,900.00	\$6,900.00				
TOTAL ALTERNATE #2				\$11,950.00		\$6,288.00		\$6,940.00		\$6,900.00		NO BID		NO BID	
BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1 & #2 TOTAL				\$81,025.00		\$87,574.00		\$96,730.00		\$142,800.00					