

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 08/04/21 @ 3:00 PM				MECHANICAL BAR SCREEN INSTALLATION TOWNSHIP OF MOORESTOWN BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 51200 11A											
				Construct Connect		Sub-Level Installations, Inc.		Municipal Maintenance Co.		Dodge Data & Analytics		Rapid Pump & Meter Service Co., Inc.		Eastern Environmental Contractors, Inc.	
				30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100 Norcross, GA 30092 P: (800) 364-2059 F: (866) 570-8187		70 Stacy Haines Road Lumberton, NJ 08048 P: (609) 953-9600 F: (609) 953-9602		1352 Taylors Lane Cinnaminson, NJ 08077 C: (609) 760-7164 P: (856) 786-9434 F: (856) 786-0642		2860 S State Hwy 161, Suite 160 #501 Grand Prairie, TX 75052 P: (413) 893-0645 F: (609) 336-2767		285 Straight Street - PO Box AY Paterson, NJ 07509 P: (973) 345-5600 F: (973) 345-0301		6304 5th Street - PO Box 278 Green Lane, PA 18054 P: (215) 234-8990 F: (215) 234-8998	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
Base Bid				no bid						no bid					
PROJECT DESCRIPTION															
1	Mechanical Bar Screen Installation, Complete	1	L.S.			\$363,500.00	\$363,500.00	\$455,169.00	\$455,169.00			\$439,390.00	\$439,390.00	\$376,700.00	\$376,700.00
2	Concrete Repairs, If and Where Directed		Allowance			\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00			\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID						\$368,500.00		\$460,169.00				\$444,390.00		\$381,700.00	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 08/04/21 @ 3:00 PM				MECHANICAL BAR SCREEN INSTALLATION TOWNSHIP OF MOORESTOWN BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 51200 11A											
				JEV Construction LLC		Quad Construction Company		Clyde N. Lattimer & Son		Williams Electrical Contractor, Inc.		MBE Mark III		Level-1 Construction, Inc.	
				116 West Main Street, 2nd Floor Clinton, NJ 08809 P: (908) 323-2950 F: (908) 323-2964		732 Eayrestown Road Lumberton, NJ 08048 C: (609) 509-3120 P: (609) 702-8000 F: (609) 702-8008		228 North Route 73 Berlin, NJ 08009 P: (856) 768-3700 F: (856) 768-1104		23 Overington Avenue Marlton, NJ 08053 P: (856) 983-5669 F: (856) 983-5669		213 Main Street Madison, NJ 07940 P: (973) 377-9240 F: (973) 377-7840		980 Coles Mill Road Williamstown, NJ 08094 P: (856) 629-0485 F: (856) 629-0486	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
Base Bid						no bid				no bid					
PROJECT DESCRIPTION															
1	Mechanical Bar Screen Installation, Complete	1	L.S.	\$378,000.00	\$378,000.00			\$384,000.00	\$384,000.00			\$407,000.00	\$407,000.00	\$468,000.00	\$468,000.00
2	Concrete Repairs, If and Where Directed		Allowance	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00			\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00			\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID				\$383,000.00				\$389,000.00				\$412,000.00		\$473,000.00	

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS					
Bid Opening 08/04/21 @ 3:00 PM					
				BR Welding, Inc.	
				3 Brook Road Howell, NJ 07731 P: (732) 363-8253 F: (732) 363-0155	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
Base Bid					
PROJECT DESCRIPTION					
1	Mechanical Bar Screen Installation, Complete	1	L.S.	\$419,000.00	\$419,000.00
2	Concrete Repairs, If and Where Directed		Allowance	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID				\$424,000.00	