

| ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS<br>SUMMARY OF BIDS<br>Bid Opening 7/29/2021 10:00 AM |  |       |      | Air Release Manhole Rehabilitation & Installation Project<br>Contract 2020-06<br>Mount Laurel, NJ<br>21908 00 |              |   |               |   |        |   |        |
|--|--|-------|------|---|--------------|---|---------------|---|--------|---|--------|
|  |  |       |      | <i>Engineer's Estimate</i>  |              | T&T Commonwealth<br>Construction Co., Inc.                                  |               | Coastline Construction LLC  |        | ConstructConnect  |        |
|  |  |       |      |   |              | 460 Faraday Avenue<br>Jackson, NJ 08527<br>P 732-901-7400<br>F 732-901-7404 |               | 1959 Route 206<br>Southampton, NJ 08088<br>P 609-351-1542<br>F 609-801-2777 |        | 30 Technology Parkway S<br>Suite 100, Norcross GA 30092<br>P 800-364-2059<br>F 866-570-8187 |        |
| NO   | DESCRIPTION  | QNTY. | UNIT | UNIT PR.  | AMOUNT       | UNIT PR.  | AMOUNT        | UNIT PR.  | AMOUNT | UNIT PR.  | AMOUNT |
| <b>BASE BID</b>  |  |       |      |   |              |   |               |   |        |   |        |
| 1  | Rehabilitate EX-LP-AR-1, Complete                                | 1     | LS   | \$20,000.00   | \$ 20,000.00 | \$ 25,000.00  | \$ 25,000.00  |   |        |   |        |
| 2  | Rehabilitate EX-LP-AR-2, Complete                                | 1     | LS   | \$20,000.00   | \$ 20,000.00 | \$ 25,000.00  | \$ 25,000.00  |   |        |   |        |
| 3  | Rehabilitate EX-LP-AR-3, Complete                                | 1     | LS   | \$30,000.00   | \$ 30,000.00 | \$ 105,687.00   | \$ 105,687.00 |   |        |   |        |
| 4  | Construct PR-LP-AR-4, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   | \$30,000.00   | \$ 30,000.00 | \$ 110,000.00   | \$ 110,000.00 |   |        |   |        |
| 5  | Construct PR-TM-AR-3, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   | \$35,000.00   | \$ 35,000.00 | \$ 95,000.00  | \$ 95,000.00  |   |        |   |        |
| 6  | OMIT   |       |      |   |              |   |               |   |        |   |        |
| 7  | Construct PR-TM-AR-5, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   | \$30,000.00   | \$ 30,000.00 | \$ 95,000.00  | \$ 95,000.00  |   |        |   |        |
| 8  | OMIT   |       |      |   |              |   |               |   |        |   |        |
| 9  | Rehabilitate EX-TM-AR-1, Complete                                | 1     | LS   | \$15,000.00   | \$ 15,000.00 | \$ 60,000.00  | \$ 60,000.00  |   |        |   |        |
| 10   | OMIT   |       |      |   |              |   |               |   |        |   |        |
| 11   | Rehabilitate EX-TM-AR-2, Complete                                | 1     | LS   | \$15,000.00   | \$ 15,000.00 | \$ 60,000.00  | \$ 60,000.00  |   |        |   |        |
| 12   | Rehabilitate EX-BW-AR-1, Complete                                | 1     | LS   | \$15,000.00   | \$ 15,000.00 | \$ 35,000.00  | \$ 35,000.00  |   |        |   |        |
| 13   | Construct PR-BW-AR-2, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   | \$70,000.00   | \$ 70,000.00 | \$ 155,000.00   | \$ 155,000.00 |   |        |   |        |
| 14   | Construct PR-BW-AR-3, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   | \$70,000.00   | \$ 70,000.00 | \$ 150,000.00   | \$ 150,000.00 |   |        |   |        |
| 15   | Additional Manhole Depth, If/Where Required                      | 5     | VF   | \$2,000.00  | \$ 10,000.00 | \$ 1,000.00   | \$ 5,000.00   |   |        |   |        |
| 16   | Forcemain Pigging Supply & Service                               | 1     | LS   | \$10,000.00   | \$ 10,000.00 | \$ 20,000.00  | \$ 20,000.00  |   |        |   |        |
| 17   | Township Police Traffic Directors, Allowance                     | 1     | ALL  | \$40,000.00   | \$ 40,000.00 | \$ 40,000.00  | \$ 40,000.00  |   |        |   |        |
| 18   | Remove & Replace Manhole Frame & Cover,<br>If and where directed | 2     | UN   | \$ 2,500.00   | \$ 5,000.00  | \$ 3,000.00   | \$ 6,000.00   |   |        |   |        |
| <b>TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID</b>   |  |       |      | <b>\$ 415,000.00</b>  |              | <b>\$ 986,687.00</b>  |               | <b>NO BID</b>   |        | <b>NO BID</b>   |        |

| ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS<br>SUMMARY OF BIDS<br>Bid Opening 7/29/2021 10:00 AM |  |       |      | Air Release Manhole Rehabilitation & Installation Project<br>Contract 2020-06<br>Mount Laurel, NJ<br>21908 00 |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
|--|--|-------|------|---|--------|--|--------|--|--------|---|--------|
|  |  |       |      | Dodge Data & Analytics  |        | Marlin Construction Services   |        | Montana Construction   |        | Mount Construction Co.  |        |
|  |  |       |      | 2860 S. State HW 161<br>Suite 160- #501<br>Grand Prairie, Tx 75052<br>P 413-893-0645                          |        | 442 Whitesvilled Road<br>Jackson, NJ 08527<br>P 732-901-4441<br>F 732-901-4449 |        | 80 Contant Ave<br>Lodi, NJ 07644<br>P 973-478-5200<br>F 973-478-7604 |        | 427 South White Horse Pike<br>PO Box 619<br>Berlin, NJ 08009<br>P 856-768-8493 x320 |        |
| NO   | DESCRIPTION  | QNTY. | UNIT | UNIT PR.  | AMOUNT | UNIT PR.   | AMOUNT | UNIT PR.   | AMOUNT | UNIT PR.  | AMOUNT |
| <b>BASE BID</b>  |  |       |      |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 1  | Rehabilitate EX-LP-AR-1, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 2  | Rehabilitate EX-LP-AR-2, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 3  | Rehabilitate EX-LP-AR-3, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 4  | Construct PR-LP-AR-4, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 5  | Construct PR-TM-AR-3, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 6  | OMIT   |       |      |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 7  | Construct PR-TM-AR-5, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 8  | OMIT   |       |      |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 9  | Rehabilitate EX-TM-AR-1, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 10   | OMIT   |       |      |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 11   | Rehabilitate EX-TM-AR-2, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 12   | Rehabilitate EX-BW-AR-1, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 13   | Construct PR-BW-AR-2, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 14   | Construct PR-BW-AR-3, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 15   | Additional Manhole Depth, If/Where Required                      | 5     | VF   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 16   | Forcemain Pigging Supply & Service                               | 1     | LS   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 17   | Township Police Traffic Directors, Allowance                     | 1     | ALL  |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| 18   | Remove & Replace Manhole Frame & Cover,<br>If and where directed | 2     | UN   |   |        |  |        |  |        |   |        |
| <b>TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID</b>   |  |       |      | <b>NO BID</b>   |        | <b>NO BID</b>  |        | <b>NO BID</b>  |        | <b>NO BID</b>   |        |

| ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS<br>SUMMARY OF BIDS<br>Bid Opening 7/29/2021 10:00 AM |  |       |      | Air Release Manhole Rehabilitation & Installation Project<br>Contract 2020-06<br>Mount Laurel, NJ<br>21908 00 |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
|--|--|-------|------|---|--------|----------|--------|----------|--------|----------|--------|
|  |  |       |      | South State Inc.  |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
|  |  |       |      | PO Box 68<br>Bridgeton, NJ 08302<br>P 856-451-5300<br>F 856-455-3461  |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| NO   | DESCRIPTION  | QNTY. | UNIT | UNIT PR.  | AMOUNT | UNIT PR. | AMOUNT | UNIT PR. | AMOUNT | UNIT PR. | AMOUNT |
| <b>BASE BID</b>  |  |       |      |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 1  | Rehabilitate EX-LP-AR-1, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 2  | Rehabilitate EX-LP-AR-2, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 3  | Rehabilitate EX-LP-AR-3, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 4  | Construct PR-LP-AR-4, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 5  | Construct PR-TM-AR-3, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 6  | OMIT   |       |      |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 7  | Construct PR-TM-AR-5, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 8  | OMIT   |       |      |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 9  | Rehabilitate EX-TM-AR-1, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 10   | OMIT   |       |      |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 11   | Rehabilitate EX-TM-AR-2, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 12   | Rehabilitate EX-BW-AR-1, Complete                                | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 13   | Construct PR-BW-AR-2, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 14   | Construct PR-BW-AR-3, Complete                                   | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 15   | Additional Manhole Depth, If/Where Required                      | 5     | VF   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 16   | Forcemain Pigging Supply & Service                               | 1     | LS   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 17   | Township Police Traffic Directors, Allowance                     | 1     | ALL  |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| 18   | Remove & Replace Manhole Frame & Cover,<br>If and where directed | 2     | UN   |   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |
| <b>TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID</b>   |  |       |      | <b>NO BID</b>   |        |          |        |          |        |          |        |