

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS INC. SUMMARY OF BIDS  Bid Opening 07/20/21 @ 10:00 AM				SEVENTH STREET WATER TANK EXTERIOR COATING REPAIR BURLINGTON CITY BURLINGTON, NEW JERSEY 40448 02									
				Engineer's Estimate		Allied Painting, Inc.		United Painters Inc.		Dynamic Sandblasting and Painting, LLC		US Tank Painting, Inc.	
						4 Larwin Road Cherry Hill, NJ 08034  P: (856) 429-3400 F: (856) 429-0696		70 Church Street Flemington, NJ 08822  P: (908) 323-8026 F: N/A		615 Hope Road Eatontown, NJ 07724  P: (732) 344-2969 F: (732) 344-2970		900 Rike Drive Millstone Twp, NJ 08535  P: (609) 448-2444 F: (609) 448-9444	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>BASE BID</b>													
1	Site & Tank Cleanup	1	LS	\$ 10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$30,000.00	\$30,000.00
2	Exterior Surface Preparation	1	LS	\$ 45,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$45,600.00	\$45,600.00
3	Exterior Surface Painting	1	LS	\$ 25,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$26,000.00	\$26,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$48,500.00	\$48,500.00
4	Repair Pressure/Vacuum Vent	1	LS	\$ 3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$9,800.00	\$9,800.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00
<b>TOTAL BASE BID PRICE</b>				<b>\$83,000.00</b>		<b>\$69,500.00</b>		<b>\$79,800.00</b>		<b>\$84,000.00</b>		<b>\$127,100.00</b>	

				Manda Painting Co.		Brave Industrial Paint LLC		American Construction Group LLC		Nuco Painting Corp.		Alpine Painting & Sandblasting	
				78 John Miller Way, Unit 436 Kearney, NJ 07032  P: (201) 941-7620 F: (201) 941-5477		177 Elmwood Ave Long Branch, NJ 07740  P: (732) 483-6403 F: (848) 303-8660		368 Princeton Ave Hillside, NJ 07205  P: (908) 764-6537 F: N/A		8 Oval Drive Islandia, NY 11749-1403  P: (631) 467-6602 F: (631) 615-2532		17 Florida Avenue Paterson, NJ 07503  P: (973) 279-3200 x 226 F: N/A	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>BASE BID</b>													
1	Site & Tank Cleanup	1	LS	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$46,000.00	\$46,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00		
2	Exterior Surface Preparation	1	LS	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$202,000.00	\$202,000.00	\$250,000.00	\$250,000.00		
3	Exterior Surface Painting	1	LS	\$70,000.00	\$70,000.00	\$120,000.00	\$120,000.00	\$208,500.00	\$208,500.00	\$235,000.00	\$235,000.00		
4	Repair Pressure/Vacuum Vent	1	LS	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$9,000.00	\$9,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID PRICE</b>				<b>\$185,000.00</b>		<b>\$339,000.00</b>		<b>\$457,500.00</b>		<b>\$497,500.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	

				ConstructConnect		Guimar General Contractor LLC		Jupiter Painting Contracting Co., Inc.		Utility Service Co., Inc. (Suez)			
				30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100 Norcross, GA 30092  P: (800) 364-2059 F: (866) 570-8187		39 Kormorn Street Newark, NJ 07105-3305  P: (973) 392-9280 F: (973) 466-0189		1500 River Road Croydon, PA 19021  P: (215) 785-6920 F: (215) 785-0873		535 Courtney Hodges Blvd. Perry, GA 31069  P: (478) 988-5266 F: (478) 988-5266			
NO	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT		
<b>BASE BID</b>													
1	Site & Tank Cleanup	1	LS										
2	Exterior Surface Preparation	1	LS										
3	Exterior Surface Painting	1	LS										
4	Repair Pressure/Vacuum Vent	1	LS										
<b>TOTAL BASE BID PRICE</b>				<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>			