

<b>ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS</b> <b>SUMMARY OF BIDS</b>  <b>Bid Opening 08/11/20 at 11:00 AM</b>	<b>TENNIS PRACTICE WALL AT FENTON LANE PARK</b> <b>TOWNSHIP OF CHESTERFIELD</b> <b>BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY</b> <b>42133 06</b>
---	---

	Capela Construction, Inc.	Shore Top Construction	Joseph Porretta Builders, Inc.	Command Co., Inc.
	30 N Central Ave. Sicklerville, NJ 08081  P (856) 262-2615 F (856) 629-1069	390 Toms River Rd. Jackson, NJ 08527  P (732) 835-2600 F (732) 359-3237	551 Anderson Ave. Hammonton, NJ 08037  P (609) 561-6391 F (609) 567-9398	1318 Antwerp Ave. Egg Harbor City, NJ 08215  P (609) 965-0399 F (609) 965-0441

NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>Base Bid</b>											
1	Clearing Site & Grading	1	LS	\$7,500.00	\$7,500.00	\$27,000.00	\$27,000.00	\$26,114.00	\$26,114.00	\$30,000.00	\$30,000.00
2	Reinforced Concrete Practice Wall	1	LS	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$53,000.00	\$53,000.00	\$26,664.00	\$26,664.00	\$39,000.00	\$39,000.00
3	Dense Graded Aggregate, 4" Thick	460	SY	\$30.00	\$13,800.00	\$10.00	\$4,600.00	\$17.85	\$8,211.00	\$19.00	\$8,740.00
4	Base Course Paving, 19M64 HMA	55	Tons	\$250.00	\$13,750.00	\$80.00	\$4,400.00	\$324.00	\$17,820.00	\$228.00	\$12,540.00
5	Surface Course Paving, 9.5M64 HMA	41	Tons	\$300.00	\$12,300.00	\$80.00	\$3,280.00	\$236.00	\$9,676.00	\$192.00	\$7,872.00
6	Construct Bituminous Sidewalk	130	SY	\$100.00	\$13,000.00	\$20.00	\$2,600.00	\$48.50	\$6,305.00	\$62.00	\$8,060.00
7	Tennis Court Striping, Complete	1	LS	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,830.00	\$1,830.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00
<b>TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID</b>				<b>\$87,850.00</b>		<b>\$96,380.00</b>		<b>\$96,620.00</b>		<b>\$112,212.00</b>	

NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>Alternate Bid #1</b>											
A8	Construct 8' High Chain Link Fence	950	LF	\$30.00	\$28,500.00	\$37.00	\$35,150.00	\$32.60	\$30,970.00	\$31.00	\$29,450.00
<b>TOTAL PRICE- ALTERNATE BID #1</b>				<b>\$28,500.00</b>		<b>\$35,150.00</b>		<b>\$30,970.00</b>		<b>\$29,450.00</b>	

<b>TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE #1</b>				<b>\$116,350.00</b>		<b>\$131,530.00</b>		<b>\$127,590.00</b>		<b>\$141,662.00</b>	
--	--	--	--	---------------------	--	---------------------	--	---------------------	--	---------------------	--

<b>ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS</b> <b>SUMMARY OF BIDS</b>  <b>Bid Opening 08/11/20 at 11:00 AM</b>	<b>TENNIS PRACTICE WALL AT FENTON LANE PARK</b> <b>TOWNSHIP OF CHESTERFIELD</b> <b>BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY</b> <b>42133 06</b>									
---	---	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

	Levy Construction, CO.	A-Tech Concrete, Co.	Berto Construction, Inc.	Eagle Construction Services
	134 Cuthbert Blvd. Aubdon, NJ 08106  P (856) 547-0707 F (856) 547-2424	11 Taylor Rd. Edison, NJ 08817  P (732) 248-1777 F (732) 248-1740	625 Leesville Ave. P.O. Box 276 Rahway, NJ 07065  P (732) 396-0099 F (732) 396-0061	1624 Jacksonville Road Burlington, NJ 08016  P (609) 239-8000 F (609) 239-8008

NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>Base Bid</b>											
1	Clearing Site & Grading	1	LS	\$30,000.00	\$30,000.00						
2	Reinforced Concrete Practice Wall	1	LS	\$39,682.00	\$39,682.00						
3	Dense Graded Aggregate, 4" Thick	460	SY	\$16.00	\$7,360.00						
4	Base Course Paving, 19M64 HMA	55	Tons	\$214.00	\$11,770.00						
5	Surface Course Paving, 9.5M64 HMA	41	Tons	\$218.00	\$8,938.00						
6	Construct Bituminous Sidewalk	130	SY	\$35.00	\$4,550.00						
7	Tennis Court Striping, Complete	1	LS	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00						
<b>TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID</b>				<b>\$127,300.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	

NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>Alternate Bid #1</b>											
A8	Construct 8' High Chain Link Fence	950	LF	\$202.00	\$191,900.00						
<b>TOTAL PRICE- ALTERNATE BID #1</b>				<b>\$191,900.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	

<b>TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE #1</b>				<b>\$319,200.00</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	
--	--	--	--	---------------------	--	---------------	--	---------------	--	---------------	--

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS  Bid Opening 08/11/20 at 11:00 AM				TENNIS PRACTICE WALL AT FENTON LANE PARK TOWNSHIP OF CHESTERFIELD BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 42133 06							
				Nick Laus Construction Company		Construct Connect					
				PO Box 2322 Vincetown, NJ 08088  P (609) 859-8668 x11 F (609) 859-3674		30 Technology Parkway S. Suite 100 Norcross, GA 30092  P (800) 364-2059 P (866) 570-8187					
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>Base Bid</b>											
1	Clearing Site & Grading	1	LS								
2	Reinforced Concrete Practice Wall	1	LS								
3	Dense Graded Aggregate, 4" Thick	460	SY								
4	Base Course Paving, 19M64 HMA	55	Tons								
5	Surface Course Paving, 9.5M64 HMA	41	Tons								
6	Construct Bituminous Sidewalk	130	SY								
7	Tennis Court Striping, Complete	1	LS								
<b>TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID</b>				<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>					

NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
<b>Alternate Bid #1</b>											
A8	Construct 8' High Chain Link Fence	950	LF								
<b>TOTAL PRICE- ALTERNATE BID #1</b>				<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>					

<b>TOTAL PRICE- BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE #1</b>				<b>NO BID</b>		<b>NO BID</b>					
--	--	--	--	---------------	--	---------------	--	--	--	--	--