

ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS BID OPENING: 11/21/19 AT 11:00 AM				PERACETIC ACID CHEMICAL FEED SYSTEM MOUNT HOLLY MUA BURLINGTON COUNTY, NJ 29901 00									
				Eagle Construction Services, Inc.		Quad Construction Company		Municipal Maintenance Co.		Jev Construction		Biosafe Systems LLC	
				1624 Jacksonville Road Burlington, NJ 08016 P- (609) 239-8000 F- (609) 239-9001		732 Eyerstown Road Lumberton, NJ 08048 P- (609) 702-8000 F- (609) 702-8008		1352 Taylors Lane Cinnaminson, NJ 08077 P- (856) 786-9434 F- (856) 786-0642		116 W. Main Street 2nd Floor Clinton, NJ 08809 P- (908) 323-2950 F- (908) 323-2964		22 Meadow Street East Hartford, CT 06108 P- (888) 273-3088 F- (860) 290-8802	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
Base Bid													
PROJECT DESCRIPTION													
1	PAA Chemical Feed System, Complete	1	LS	\$850,854.00	\$850,854.00	\$1,002,790.00	\$1,002,790.00	\$1,082,190.00	\$1,082,190.00	\$1,129,340.00	\$1,129,340.00	NO BID	NO BID
2	Integration with MUA's SCADA System, Complete	1	LS	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID				\$869,514.00		\$1,021,450.00		\$1,100,850.00		\$1,148,000.00		NO BID	
				C & H Industrial Services, Inc.		Eastern Environmental Contractors Inc.		Level-1 Construction, Inc.		Peroxychem		Williams Electrical Contractor, Inc.	
				542 Penny Street Franklinville, NJ 08322 P- (856) 875-8152 F- (856) 875-6865		6304 5th Street Green Lane, PA 18054 P- (215) 234-8990 F- (215) 234-8998		980 Coles Mill Road Williamstown, NJ 08094 P- (856) 629-0485 F (856) 629-0486		2005 Market Street Suite #3200 Philadelphia, PA 19103 P- (267) 422-2400 F- (267) 422-2401		23 Overington ave. Marlton, NJ 08053 P- (856) 983-5669 F- (856) 983-5669	
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT
Base Bid													
PROJECT DESCRIPTION													
1	PAA Chemical Feed System, Complete	1	LS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2	Integration with MUA's SCADA System, Complete	1	LS	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
				Zarnas		Construct Connect		Dodge Data & Analytics					
				850 Jennings Street Bethlehem, PA 18017 P- (610) 866-0923 F- (610) 866-4065		30 Technology Pkwy. Suite #100 Norcross, GA 30092 P- (800) 364-2059 F- (866) 570-8187		4300 Beltway Place Arlington, TX 76018 P- (413) 507-0211 F- (800) 768-5594					
NO	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT	UNIT PR.	AMOUNT				
Base Bid													
PROJECT DESCRIPTION													
1	PAA Chemical Feed System, Complete	1	LS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
2	Integration with MUA's SCADA System, Complete	1	LS	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00	\$18,660.00				
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID				NO BID		NO BID		NO BID					