

| ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS SUMMARY OF BIDS Bid Opening 12/14/2021 at 10:00 AM | | 2022-2023 SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF VARIOUS CHEMICALS CITY OF BURLINGTON BURLINGTON COUNTY, NEW JERSEY 40008 09 | | | |
|--|---|---|---|--|--|
| | | Miracle Chemical Company | PVS Chemicals, Inc | Kuehne Chemical Company | Coyne Chemical |
| | | 1511 B Highway #33 Farmingdale, NJ 07727 P: (609)-561-4161 x208 F: (609)-561-0920 | 10900 Harper Avenue. Detroit, MI 48213 P: (313) 921-1200 x4140 F: (313) 571-6765 | 971 M Village Round Allentown, PA 18106 P: (973)-589-0700 F: (973)-589-4866 | 3015 State Road Croydon, PA 19021 P: (215)-785-3000 F: (215)-785-1585 |
| NO | DESCRIPTION | UNIT PR. | UNIT PR. | UNIT PR. | UNIT PR. |
| Base Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| 1 | Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite (per gallon) | \$1.749 | \$1.902 | \$2.05 | NO BID |
| Alternate Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| A1 | Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite (per gallon) | \$1.899 | NO BID | \$2.25 | |
| Base Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| 2 | Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (per gallon) | NO BID | \$2.138 | \$4.00 | NO BID |
| Alternate Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| A2 | Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (per gallon) | | NO BID | \$4.00 | |
| Base Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| 3 | Potassium Permanganate (per 55lb drum) | \$260.19 | NO BID | NO BID | \$152.8036 |
| Alternate Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| A3 | Potassium Permanganate (per 55lb drum) | \$264.60 | | | \$180.5518 |
| Base Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| 4 | Powdered Activated Carbon (per pound) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$1.4110 |
| Alternate Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| A4 | Powdered Activated Carbon (per pound) | | | | \$1.5287 |
| Base Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| 5 | Sludge Polymer (per gallon) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$21.80 |
| Alternate Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| A5 | Sludge Polymer (per gallon) | | | | \$26.46 |
| Base Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| 6 | Liquid Sodium Bisulfite (per gallon) | \$2.899 | NO BID | NO BID | \$3.9416 |
| Alternate Bid - 1 Year Contract Chemical Supply - Complete | | | | | |
| A6 | Liquid Sodium Bisulfite (per gallon) | \$2.989 | | | \$5.3591 |